
AN ORDINANCE relatimg, to the Seattle Plumbing Codw~ repealing

S,~,,attlc Municipal C`ode Secuon 22.502.015 and Winance 116594: adIng new'

Section 22.502.() 16; adopti-ag Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, NlipLndices A, B, C~

and 1. and ywrtions of C&amp;Mmm I and 11 of the Unilbrni PlIllumbing, Code 1997

Edition, adloptim- IAPNIO InswUnjon. Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92. 6-95. 7-

90. 8-95. 9-95, IT93, 1301, 18-85~ 20-96, and 21-89 c.s ;ct forth in kppelidix I

of the Uniform
Plurnbin,(,.,,

Code 1997 Edution: adolating Chapter 13 oF die

Uii~iform Mechanical. Codl~:: the adopted Uniform Plunilic)ing, Code by

arn~:ndir-g -,N sections to Chapter 1 AdminisMon, arnenIng
,

and adding, nic

hapier 2 Defi~-Jtion.,, Cliapter 6 Vv"ater S-upply and Distribution. and

amending Chapter 11 Smrm Flabiage; unicnding the t`ec for appealing to the

Board, of Appealm and amcndIg SWC NALMICIPal Code Section

?15014.010,A go%reming peunk Res R)r owmam types of plumbim cross-
'71

conneown Control cquipl-Ilent.





November 18, 1999

v.2

1

2 ORDINANCE

3 AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; repealing Seattle

4 Municipal Code Section 22.502.015 and Ordinance 116594; adding new Section

5 22.502.016; adopting Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, Appendices A, B, C, and L
6 and portions of Chapters 1 and I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition;

7 adopting IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-95, 7-90, 8-95,

8 9-95, 12-93, 13-91, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendix I of the

9 Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; adopting Chapter 13 of the Uniform

10 Mechanical Code; amending the adopted Uniform Plumbing Code by amending
11 and adding new sections to Chapter I Administration, amending Chapter 2

12 Definitions, amending Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribution, and amending
13 Chapter 11 Storm Drainage; amending the fee for appealing to the Plumbing
14 Board of Appeals; and amending Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.504.010.A

15 governing permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-connection control

16 equipment.

17

18 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

19 SECTION 1. Section 22.502.015 of the Seattle Municipal Code and Ordinance 116594

20 are hereby repealed.

21 SECTION 2. A new Section 22.502,016 is added to the Seattle Municipal Code to read

22 as follows:

23 22.502.016 Adoption of Uniform Plumbing Code, IAPMO Installation Standards

24 and Seattle Amendments.

25 The following are hereby adopted and by this reference made a part of this subtitle:

26 Portions of Chapters 1 and I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended

27 by this ordinance; Chapters 2 and 6 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended by

28 this Ordinance; Chapters 3 through 5, 7 through 10, 13, 14, and Appendices A, B, C, and L of the

29 Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-

Page I of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

1 the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; all as published by the International Association of

2 Plumbing Officials (one copy of which has been filed with the City Clerk in C.F. 3 L) 3:5 3 -7);

3 and Chapter 13 of the 1997 Uniform Mechanical Code as adopted by Ordinance 119080;

together with the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted by

Ordinance
,

shall constitute the official Plunibing Code of the City of Seattle and

hereinafter be referred to as "the code" or "this code." In case of conflict between the Uniform

Plumbing Code, the IAPMO Installation Standards and the Seattle Amendments, the Seattle

Amendments shall be controlling,

SECTION 3. The following sections of Chapter I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997

10 Edition axe hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of

11 the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 10 1. 3, 101.4, 101.4.1, 101.4. 1. 1,

12 101.4.1.1.2, 101.4.1.1.3, 101.4.1.2, 101.4.2, 101.5, 101.5.3, 101.5.6, 102.0, 102.2, 102.2,4, 102.3,

13 103.0, 103.1, 103.1.1, 103.1.2, 103,1.2.1, 103.1.2.2, 103 2, 103.2.1, 103.11. 1, 103.2.1.2,

14 103.2.1.3, 103.2.1.4, 103.2.1.5, 103.2.3, 103.3, 103.3.1, 103.3.5, 103.5, 103.5.1.1, 103.5.1.2,

15 103.5.1.4, 103.5.2, 103.5.3, 103.5.3.5, 103.5.4, 103.5,4.1, 103.5.4.2, 103.5.5, 103.5.5.2, 1017,

16 103.7,1, 103.8, 103,8.1, and 103.8.2.

17 SECTION 4. The following sections of Chapter I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997

18 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 1,

19 Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 10 1.4. 1. 1. 1,

20 10 1. 4.1.3, 101.4.3, 101.5.1, 101.5.2, 101.5.4, 101,5.5, 102.1, 102.2.1, 102.2.2, 102.2.3, 102.2.5,

21 102.2.6, 102.3.1, 102.3.2, 103.1.3, 103.2.1.6, 103.2.2, 103.3.3, 103.5.1, 103.5.1.3, 103.5.5. 1,

22 103.5.6, 103.5.6.1, 103.5.6.2, and 103.5.6.3.

23 SECTION5. Section 101.4.1.1.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

Page 2 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

1 follows:

2 101.4.1.1.1 In existing buildings or premises in which plumbing installations are to be

3 altered, repaired, or renovated, deviations from the provision of this Code are permitted,

4 provided such deviations are found by the Administrative Authorit to be necessary as alternate

5 methods or materials in accordance with the standards in Section 301.2 of this Code, and are first

6 approved by the Administrative.Authority.

7 SECTION 6. Section 101.4.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

8 follows:

9 101.4.1.3 Existing Construction. No provision of this Code shall be deemed to

10 require a change in any portion of a plumbing or drainage system or any other work regulated by

11 this Code in or on an existing building or lot when such work was installed and is maintained in

12
1

accordance with law in effect ( )) at the time the system

13 was installed or the work completed except when any such plumbing or drainage system or other

14 work regulated by this Code is determined by the Administrative Authority to be in fact

15 dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or a nuisance ((aftd)) pr a menace to life, health or property.

16 SECTION7. Section 101,4.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

17 follows:

18 101.4.3 The provisions in the appendices are intended to supplement the requirements of

19 this Code and shall not be considered part of this Code unless ((feffRe4y)) adopted as such by

20 ordinance.

21 SECTION 8. Section 101.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

22 follows:

23 101.5.1 Additions, Alterations or Repairs. Additions, alterations or repairs may be

Page 3 of 21



made to any plumbing system without requiring the existing plumbing system to comply with all

the requirements of this Code, provided the addition, alteration or repair conforms to that

required for a new plumbing system. Additions, alterations or repairs shall not cause or allow an

existing system to become unsafe, insanitary or overloaded.

SECTION 9. Section 101.5.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

101.5.2 Health and Safety. Whenever the Administrative Authority determines that

compliance with all the provisions of this Code fails to eliminate or alleviate a nuisance, or any

other dangerous or insanitary conditions which ((fftay)) involve health or safety hazards, the

0

1

owner or the owner's agent shall install such additional plumbing and drainage facilities or shall

11 make such repairs or alterations as may be ordered by the Administrative Authority.

12 SECTION 10. Section 101.5.4 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

13 follows:

14 101.5.4 Changes in Building Occupancy. Plumbing systems, which are a part of any

15 building or structure undergoing a change in ((ttse e )) occupancy, as defined in the Building

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Code, shall comply to all requirements of this Code, which may be applicable to the new ((we

ef)) occupancy.

SECTION11. Section 101.5.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

101.5.5 Maintenance. All plumbing systems, materials and appurtenances, both

existing and new, and all parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operating condition. All

devices or safeguards required by this Code shall be maintained in conformance with the Code

4-
-,jjdki- -de, - ie.h.),)

in effect when installed. The owner or the owner's designated agent((e"

Page 4 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

2

3

4

6

7

8

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

shall be responsible for maintenance ofplumbing systems. To determine compliance with this

subsection, the Administrative Authority may cause any plumbing system to be ((fei

inspecte

SECTION 12. Section 102.1 of the 1997 Uniforni Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.1 Administrative Authority. The Administrative Authority ((shall be ~he

~
A-1- ---BtAiithe-f-it-, -rr-.

..,.ed te enfer-ee this Code)) is the director of the Seattle-King CQgnty

Doartment. of Public Health or the director's authorized rgpresentative, who shall administer and

enforce the provisions of the plumbing and mechanical code (Chgpter 13 of the 1997 Uniform

Mechanical Code) as adopted or amended except as provided in this Code; provided, that the

Director of Seattle Public Utilities or his or her authorized rgpresentative shall administer and

enforce provisions relating to the inspection and aproval of water meters and, where oplicable,

building soply piping.

SECTION 13. Section 102.2.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.1 The Administrative Authority may ((appeit4 saeh assistarAs, depttfies,

iiispeetefs, or- e~hef: empleyees as afe iieeessftt=j, ~e eaff~, et4 the f6netiens ef the depaAffieiit aiid

this Cede. ) adopt such administrative rules and regulations consistent with this Code as shall be

19 deemed necessga for its administration and enforcement.

20 SECTION 14. Section 102.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

21 follows:

22 102.2.2 Right of Entry. ((Whena~vei-z it is iieeessai-y te fflake aii iiispeetieii te eiif6fee-

23 the pfevisions of this Cede, ar- ~"eftever- the Adffiifiistfative Aath6fity hftS feffsE) Able, e-Ause

Page 5 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

+1, -- "ties impE)sed upeii the Adfflioistr-atiie Attthefit-y by this Cede, pr-a~vided tha4 i

stteh bttildiiig ef pfefflise. -ee,ed, the Adffiiiiis4a4ve AtAar-it-y shall pfeseiit efedefftials te

the eeeupant r-ffid feEteest efttfy. if seeh btiildin, -s is ttaeee"ied, the Adffiiiiistfati-,~e

A -+1,
I ~ ~..()R+.y A-a! I f if St f Rakg--, A- fP-A-1-4 A-;-R--AL- le effeA te le e4e the owner- er- other- p er-seft hwAiig ehaf ge

or- eefitrel of the biiildiii

10 Wheii the Adffiiflistfa~ive At4her-ity shall ha-,~e fifst ebtaiiied leefieii Waffa

11 er- athef Y-efaedy pfevided by WA, to seeur-e en~iy, He owner-, eee"af4, ef pefsen having ehafge,

12 eafe, er- eE)i4r-E)1 ef affy btiildiiig ef pfeffiises sha4l fail E)r- ffegleet, aftef pfepef feqiiest is ffiade as

13

14 ef inspeetieff afid to this Cede. ) Upon presentation of proper credentials,

15 the Administrative Authorily may, with the consent of the occoant or with the consent of the

16 owner of an unoccgpied building or premises, or in accordance with a lawfully issued search

17 warrant, enter at reasonable times a building or premises to perform a duty iMposed Lipon the

18 Administrative Authority by this Code, provided that the Administrative Authority shall make

19 enLry only if such enLry is consistent with the constitutions and laws of the United States and the

20 State of Washington.

21 SECTION 15. Section 102.2.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

22 follows:

23 102.2.3 Stop ((Ofder-~)) Work Notice and Correction Notice.

Page 6 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

I A. Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, the

2 Administrative Authority may order the work stopped by notice in writing served on the propert

owner and/oron any persons doing or causing such work to be done, and any such

4 persons shall ((fefthwith ) immediate stop work until authorized by the Administrative

5 Authority to proceed with the work, Service of a stop work order shall be made by one or more

of the following methods:

Personal service: Personal service of a ~~o~rkorder mjjy be made orLtffiae pr (JEM AY

owner and/or on gny person doing or causing the work to be done, or by leaving the stop work

order at the house of usual abode of the person being served, provided that the stop w2rk order is

10 left with a person of suitable age and discretion who resides there.

11 Service by posting on the properly: Service directed to the property owner and/or

12 person doing or causing such work to be done mU be made by posting the stop work order in a

13 conoicuous place on the property where the work is occurring, and concurrently mailing notice

14 as provided for below, if a mailing address is available.

is Service by mail: Service by mail mU be made for a stop work order by mailing two

16 CODieS. Dostage prepaid. one by ordipkry first class mail and the other by certified mail, to the

17 property owner and/or to any person doing or causing such work to be done, at the last known

18

19

address of the person being served, at the address of the location of the work being done, or at the

address of the place of business of the person being served. The taxpqyer's address as shown on

20 the tax records of the cognty shall be deemed to be the proper address for the VgMose of mailin

21 such notice to the person being served. Service by mail shall be presumed effective

22 third business dgy after the dqy Mpon which the stop work order was placed in the mail.

23 B. Whenever any work is being done contrM to the provisions of this code, the



November 18,1999

v.2

administrative authority mgy order the violations corrected without ordering all work stopped by

issuing a correction notice that identifies the violation. The correction notice mgy reqRi~re

reinspection before further construction or at the time of the next required inspection. The

correction notice shall be served or posted in the same manner as a stop work order.

C. These remedies are in addition to those authorized elsewhere in the Code.

SECTION 16. Section 102.2,5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.5 Authority to ((Gon4em*)) Correct Hazardous or Insanitary Plumbin

9 Whenever the Administrative Authority ascertains that any plumbing system or portion thereof,

10 regulated by this Code, has become hazardous to life, health, property, or has become insanitary,

11 the Administrative Authority shall order in writing that such plumbing either be removed or

12 placed in a safe or sanitary condition, as appropriate. The order shall fix a reasonable time limit

13 for compliance. No person shall use or maintain defective plumbing after receiving such notice.

14 When such plumbing system is to be disconnected, written notice shall be given. In cases

IS ((e4)) in which the Administrative Authority has determined that immediate danger to life or

16 property-aj~~, the Administrative Authority may cause such disconnection Lo be made

17 immediately without such notice.

18 SECTION 17. Section 102.2.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

19 follows:

20 102.2.6 Liability claims. ((The Adffiiffistr-a4i~ve Affthef4y ehafged with

21 ef&amp;r-eeffien4 ef this Cede, aefiiig in geed fikh and withetA ffia4iee iii the disehar-ge of ~he

22

23

Page 8 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

2 beea-ttse of sueb aet of
. .

.
-feizmed in the eiifefeeffief4 ef a" pfEWisieii of this Code sh

3 be defended by legal eatffisel pr-&amp;vided by ~his ji:tAsdietien until fiiial tefffiiiiafieti ef seeh

4 pfE)eeediffgs-.)) This Code is enacted as an exercise of the police power of the City of Seattle to

5 protect and preserve the public peace, health, safety and welfare, and its provisions shall be

6 liberally construed for the accoMplishment of these pMoses. It is expressly the pMose of thi~

Code to provide for and promote the health, safety and welfare of the general public, and not to

create or otherwise establish or designate any particular class or uogp of persons who will or

should be eMecially protected or benefitted by the terms of this Code.

10 It is the gpecific intent of this Code to place the obligation of complying with its

11 requirements gpon the owner or occUier of premises within this code's scgpe, and no provision

12 nor term used in this Code is intended to impose any duty whatsoever upon the Administrative

13 Authorijy or gny of the administrative authority's officers or =Ioyees, for whom the

14 iMlementation or enforcement of this Code shall be discretionga and not mandatoi:y,

15 Nothing in this Code creates or forms the basis for any liability on the part of the

16 Administrative Authority, or the Administrative Authoi-ity's officers, =Ioyees or agents, fo

17 My injuKy or damage resulting from the failure of the owner or occgpi r of premises to compl

18 with the provisions of this Code, or by reason or in conseq ence of gny act or omission in

19 connection with the iMplementation or enforcement of this Code on the part of the

20 Administrative Authorily by the Administrative Authority's officers, Mployees or qg~~nts.

21 AU claim and/or litigation arising from my conduct, acts or omissions of the

22 Administrative Authorijy, or any of the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents,

23 shall be subject to the provisions of Seattle Municipal Code Chapter 4.64. as amended.

Page 9 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

2

3

5

8

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

SECTION 18. Section 102.3.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.3.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm., ((ef)) corporation or other

gDLity to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip,

use, or maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this Code.

SECTION 19. Section 102.3.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.3.2 Penalties. Any person, firm, ((ef)) corporation or other entity violating any

provision of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof,

shall be punishable by a fine and/or imprisonment set forth by the ((geN'eming 1&amp;Ws of the

jth-isdiefieii)) Seattle Criminal Code or by state I
.

Each separate day or any portion thereof,

during which any violation of this Code occurs or continues, shall be deemed to constitute a

separate offense.

SECTION 20. Section 103.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.1.3 Licensing. It shall be the obligation of every person who enters into contracts

for the installation or repair of plumbing systems

fequir~)) for which this. Code.requires a permi
,

to comply with all 2pplicable state or local rules

and regulations concerning licensing, (("ieh the appheable go-1--1--ift- a-Ah
t,

----ei4ty has adopted.))

SECTION 21. Section 103.2.1.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.2.1.6 Give such other data and information relevant to the proposed work as may be

required by the Administrative Authority.

Page 10 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

I SECTION 22. Section 103.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

2 follows:

3 103.2.2 Plans and Specifications. Plans, engineering calculations, diagrams and other

4 data shall be submitted in one or more sets with each application for a permit. The

5 Administrative Authority may require plans, computations and specifications to be prepared by

6 and the plumbing designed by an engineer and/or architect licensed by the state to practice as

7 such.

8 Exception: The Administrative Authority may waive the submission of plans,

9 calculations or other data if the Administrative Authority finds that the nature of the work

10 applied for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary to ((ebtaiff)).deterrnine compliance

11 within the Code,

12 SECTION23. New section 103.3. 1.1 concerning owners' permits is adopted to read as

13 follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle

14 Amendments to the 1997Uniform Plumbing Code:

15 103.3.1.1 Owner's Permit. A bona fide owner mU install, alter, or rgpair plumbing in

16 his or her own building, provided:

17 1
.

The installation, alteration, or r0air work is not undertaken with the intention and

18 for the pMose of selling the VMpe]jy iMproved by such work-,

19 2. The owner gpplies in Person for an owner's permit for the work to be done, and

20 pgys the permit fee according to the fee schedule in this code~

21 3. The owner obtains an owner's p.ennit before commencing the installation,

22 alteration, or rppair work,

23 4. The installation, alteration, or reDair work is performed exclusively by the owner

Page I I of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

and not by gny othpr person, including a Dlumbing contractor; an

2 5. The installation, a1teratiLR..ai[ rgpair work is performed in the manner required by

3 this code subject to insRection and gpproval by the administrative authorily.

4 SECTION 24. Section 103.3.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

5 follows:

103.3.3 Validity of Permit. The issuance of a permit or approval of plans and

specifications shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of

the provisions of this Code or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction, No permit presuming to

give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code shall be valid.

10 The issuance of a permit based upon plans, specifications or other data shall not prevent

11 the Administrative Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errors contained in said

12 plans, specifications and other data or from preventing building operations being carried on

13 thereunder when in violation of this Code or of other ordinances of this jurisdiction.

14 A person to whom a permit has been issued shall not allow another Person to do or cause

15 to be done my work under such permit excot persons in !he =Ioy of the permittee.

16 Eve1y plumbing permit shall be posted on the building, structure or premises where the

17 work permitted is being -Derfonil ed and sha 11 i-tot be removed until the work has been finally

18 gpproved by the Administrative Authority.

19 Every permit issued by the administrative authority under the provisions of this code shall

20 211~ire'~y Li'mitation and become null and void one year from date of issue, Permits gaired fo

21 not more'han one year rnqy be renewed for one-half the original cost or fifty dollars, whichever

22 is less. Permits eLpired for more than one year require the regular scheduled fees.

23 Plumbing work authorized by a permit in effect on the effective date of this code shall be

Page 12 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

performed in accordance with the laws and ordinances in effect when the permit was issued,

2 excqpt when the administrative authority determines the work to be in fact danacrous, unsafe,

3 insanitga, or a nuisance or a menace to life, health or propellL.

4 SECTION 25. Section 103.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

5 follows:

6 103.5.1 General. All plumbing systems for which a permit is required by this Code

7 shall be inspected by the Administrative Authority. No portion of any plumbing system shall be

,8 covered or otherwise concealed until inspected and approved. Neither the Administrative

9 Authority nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement

10 of material required to permit inspection. When the installation of a plumbing system is

11 complete, an additional and final inspection shall be made.

1 2 SECTION 26. Section 103.5.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

13 follows:

14 103.5.1.3 Covering or Using. No plumbing or drainage system, building sewer,

15 private sewer disposal system or part thereof, shall be covered, concealed, or put into use until it

16 has been tested, inspected, and ((aeeept-ed)) gpprove as prescribed in this Code.

17 SECTION 27. Section 103.5.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

18 follows:

19 103.5.5.1 Defective Systems. An air test shall be used in testing the sanitary condition

20 of the drainage or plumbing system of any building premises when there is reason to believe that

21 it has become defective. In buildings or premises condemned by the ((pfepef)) Administrative

22 Authority because of an insanitary condition of the plumbing system or part thereof, the

2.3 ((a4efa6ens i ) corrections to such system shall confonn to the requirements of this Code.

Page 13 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

1 SECTION 28. Section 103.5.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

2 follows:

3 103.5.6 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or

4 reinspection when part or all of the work for which inspection is called is not

5 complete or when required corrections have not been made.

6 This provision is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is

7 rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as controlling the practice

10

11

of calling for inspections before the job is ready for inspection or reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the approved plans are not readily available to

the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which the inspection is requested, or

for deviating from plans (( ) when the deviation requires qpproval but

12 has not been aDDroved by the Administrative Authority.

13 To obtain reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefor in writing upon a

14 form famished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with (ffY&amp;1e4-4-))

15 Choter 22.504 of this Code.

16 In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the

17 work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

18 SECTION 29. Section 103.5.6.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

19 follows:

20 103.5.6.1 Corrections. Notices of correction or violation shall be ((wf4teff)) Lssued by

21 the Administrative Authority and may be posted at the site of the work or mailed or delivered to

22 the permittee or his authorized representative. Refusal, failure, or neglect to comply with any

23 such notice or order within ten days of receipt thereof, shall be considered a violation of this

Page 14 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

Code, and shall be subject to the ((pefta4ies)) remedies for violations as set forth elsewhere in

this Code. ((fef vielafien6-))

SECTION 30. Section 103.5.6.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.5.6.2 Retesting. If the Administrative Authority finds that the work ((Wi4)) ~Ioes

not pass ((#ie)) any required test or inspection, necessary corrections shall be made and the work

shall then be resubmitted for test or inspection.

SECTION 31. Section 103.5.6.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

10 103.5.6.3 Approval. Upon the satisfactory completion and final test of the plumbing

11 system, a certificate of approval shall be issued by the Administrative Authority to the permittee.

12 ((eff4efneaA-))

13 SECTION32. New sections 104.0,104.1, 104.1.1 and 104.1.2 concerning the

14 Plumbing Board of Appeals, and 105.0, 105.1,105.1.1, 105.1.2, 105.1.3, and 105.1.4 concerning

15 Hearing Examiner appeals, are adopted to read as follows and by this reference are made a part

16 of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

17 104.0 Board of Appeals

18 A Board of Appeals shafl be shed and shall consist of six voting members, with

19 one member rgpresenting journeyMan plumbers, plumbing contractors, professional mechanical

20 engineers, and building owners and two members representing the public. The Administrative

21 Authority shall serve as a nonvoting member of the Board. The Board of APpeals shall elect a

22 chair and a secretga who shall serve at the pleasure of the Board.

23 104.1 AU party aggrieved by a decision of the Administrative Authority made in

Page 15 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

5

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

accordance with this Code either in the context of a specific project or permit Uplication or in

the context of an aprlication for qP12roval of an alternal'c rraterial or method of construction, or

both, mgy file a written petition for gppeal to the Board, accoMpanied bv a nonrefundable fee of

one hundred dollars. Appeals shall be heard at reasonable times at the convenience of the Board,

but not later than thigy dUs after receipt of the petition. However, this time requirement mqy be

waived by written agreement between the Administrative Authorily and the gppellant if doing so

will facilitate resolution of the dispute. The gppellant shall be entitled to gppear in pgrson before

Lhe ai~qrd, to be represented by an attoMey, and to introduce evidence in s=ort of such petition.

The gppellant shall cause to be made at the qppellant's own expense gny test or research red

by the Board for the substantiation of any claim or claims made by the Wpellant. The Board of

Appeals shall determine whether a correct intep2retation of this Code has been made by the

Administrative Authoritv.

104.1.1 Decisions of the Board shall be in writin,~z: slhall be distributed to the

Administrative Authority and the gpl2ellant, and shall Uply only to the case being Theard. Board

decisions are deemed issued on the date that the decision is delivered to the gppellant or the

gppellant's counsel or, if the decision is mailed, on the date of mailing. AU person agwieved by

a decision of the Board mgy =eat the decision of the Board to the Hearing Examiner as

provided in Sections 105.0 through 105.1.4 of this chgpter.

104.1.2 The Board mgy make recommendations to the Administrative Authorily for

20 changes in the Code.

21 105.0 Hearing Examiner Appeals.

22 105.1 Filing of Appeals. Appeals shall be filed with the Cijy of Seattle Hearing

23 Examiner by five p.m. (5: 00 p.m.) of the tenth (10!) calendar dU following the date the decision

Page 16 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

10

I I

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

of the Board is issued pursuant to Section 104. 1. 1. When the last day of the gppeal period so

coMputed is Saturday, Sundqy or city holidU, the period-s~all run until five p.rn, (5.00 pm.1 on

the next business day. An gppeal shall be considered filed with the, Hearing Examiner when it

delivered to the Hearing Ex~,irn i Tier's office or, if the qppeal is sent via US mail or a private mail

service, when it is received by the Examiner. The Examiner's date stamp shall be placed on

incoming gppeals and there is a rebuttable preaamption that the date and time stgmped is the date

and time of filing. The Opeal shall be in writing and shall state speci fically ~Lh~ the qppella-nt

believes the decision of the Board to be incorrect and what relief is sought. The apeal shall be

accoMpanied by pgMent of the filling fee as set forth in SMC Section 3.02.125, Hg~~n

Examiner Filing Fees, including My amendments or revisions thereto.

105.1.1 Parties of Record. The parties to the gp]2eal shall be the =ellant and the

Adpli,nisLrative Authorily,

105.1.2 Notice ofHearing. Notice of the hearing on the Mpeal shall be mailed Twenty

(20) dUs prior to the scheduled hearing date to the parties of record.

105.1.3 Scope and Standard of Review. The hearing shall be de novo. The Board's

decision shall be given substantial weight by the Hearing Examiner and the burden shall be on

gpl2ella-nt to prove that the Board's decision is clearly erroneous.

105.1.4 Hearing Examiner's Decision. The Hearing Examiner shall issue a decision

in writing within fifteen d4ys after the close of the hearing and mail that dec.i.sion.to all parties of

record. The decision shall contain written findings and conclusions. The Hearing Examiner's

decision shall be final and conclusive and the parties of record shall be bound by the terms and

coDditions of the decision unless within tweaty-one d4ys from the date of issuance of the

decision gppellant makes gpplication to King County SMperior Court for a Land UseRetition

Page 17 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

6

10

11

12

pursuant to RCW 36.70C.

SECTION 33. Section 206.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended to add a

new definition as follows:

206.0 --D--

Domestic Water Heater - A domestic water boater is a tank with a self-contained

heating unit which stores potable hot water for residential or commercial use with a nominal

w,atcr containin-1 c"lacity of one-hundred twenty gallons or less, having a heating ipput of two-

bundreci fliousand BTUs per hour or less used for hot water sUply at Pressures of one-hundred

sixty 1.2ounds Versquare inch or less and at operating tgMeratures of two-hundred ten degrees

Fahrenheit or less.

13 SECTION 34. Section 214.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

14 follows:

15 214.0 --L--

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Listing Agency - An agency accepted by the Administrative Authority which is in the

business of listing or labeling and which maintains a periodic inspection program on current

production of listed models, and which makes available a published report of such listing in

which specific information is included that the product has been tested to approved standards and

found safe for use in a specific manner. L'sting Agencies Wroved bY the Administrative

Authority are as follows: International Association of plLimbing and Mechanical Officials

~J.A.P.M.Q.)-, Washington State Doartment of Social and Health Services; National Sanitation

Page 18 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Other testing or listing agencies may be ~idded to the qpproved list as the administrative authorit

deems necessga.

,N.S.F.)-, City of Los Angeles Testing Laboratojy-, American Gas Association;Foundation f

Canadian Gas Associatiow, Cara 9,,1 Standards Association; and Underwriters Laboratories.

Listing agencies or testing laboratories are not lirn ited to the agencies named in this section,

SECTION 35. Section 218.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

218.0 --P--

Plumbing System - Includes all potable water building supply and distribution pipes, all

plumbing fixtures and traps, all drainage and vent pipe(s), and all building drains and building

sewers, including their respective joints and connection, devices, receptors, and appurtenances

within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable water piping, potable water

treating or using equipment, medical gas and medical vacuum systems, fael gas piping, water

heaters ((afid ~~efAs for- saffie)) and rainwater
...

le.qdffs. However. certification is not rgquired for

the installation of a plumbing system within the property lines and outside the building.

Public or Public Use - All buildings or structures that are not defined as private or

private use.

(1) General Use Mplies to business, commercial, industrial and assembly

occlMancies other than those defined under hegLvy use. Included are the public and common

areas in hotels, motels and multidwelling buildings.

Page 19 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

(2) Heavy Use assembly gpplies to toilet facilities in occUancies which place a

5

10

11

12

13

14

is

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

heLU, but intermittent time-based demand on the water sgj2ply system, such as schools,

auditori a-ms, stadiums, race courses, transportation terminals, theaters and similar occoancies

where queuing is likely to occur during periods of peak use.

SECTION 36. Section 604.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

604.1 Water pipe and fittings shall be of brass, copper, cast iron, ((gaWaftii~ed fflaMeable

ifEffi-,)) galvanized wrought iron, ((galvaiiii~ed steet,-)) or other approved materials. Cast iron

fittings used for water need not be galvanized if over two ((R))) inches (5 1 mm) in size.

Asbestos-cement, CPVC, PE, or PVC water pipe manufactured to recognized standards may be

used for cold water distribution systems outside a building. CPVC water pipe and tubing may be

used for hot and cold water distribution systems within a building. All materials used in the

water supply system, except valves and similardevices shall be of a like material, except where

otherwise approved by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 37. Section 604.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a weight of not less than Type L.

Exception: Type M copper tubing may be used for water piping when piping is above

ground in, or on, a building. ((e.F tiodefgfetind etAside of stndettff es.))

SECTION 38. New section 803.1 concerning parking garage drainage systems is

adopted to read as follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 8, Indirect Wastes, of

the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

Page 20 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

803.1 Parking Garage Drainage Systems. All floor drainage under the roof of a

parking garage shall be connected to the satiitaa drainage system. When the top floor of the

building is used as a roof as well as a parking area, the drainage ftogi tl~-q roof shall be connected

to the storm drainage System. Drainage from conventional plumbing fixtures sliall not be inter-

connected with the floor drainage system. However, drainage lines from car or truck washin

cwi Trient mav be coiinccled to fhe floor d!-ai-iq,-,e system through an 012roved ir.tercentor.

Floor draina-~--,- waste lines sliall be ai-iiiiiimtiiri of flhree inches in size. Waste unit loadings fo

,three-inch or larger size floor drainage piping shall be sized in accordance with table 7-5 of this

code. Floor drains or floor drain openings shall be equipped with gpproved strainers and need

10 not be traped when connected to the building drain through a 12roPerly trgPped and vented

11 intercgptor. Trgps shall not be used when flic floor drains are located in areas exposed to

12 freezing teMperatures. The waste li.ne from floor drains entering an intemptor shall be above

13 line discbargin.g, fro ii i the iMerceptor to the btii1cjiii,.-- drain. The sand intercoto

14 receiving the floor drains shall liave a V-,7ater seal of not less than six inches. Floor drain trgps

15 need i i ot be vented individu aRy if line venting is used through an gpproved indirect waste syst

16 with a properly trgpped and vented intercgptor. A line vent for floor drains shall terminate

17 thi-oLigh flie roof or to an gpproved location in the outside atmosphere. When using line venting,

18 the terminating vents, if more than one, shall be egual in cross sectional area to the size of the

19
1

Ny.as. te line enterirl
I

the intercotor or tb e line vent mgy continue full size ftom the intercgptor to

20 the point of ten-nination. All jolans for parking garage floor drainage systems shall be submitted

21 to the administrative authority prior to installation for gpproval.

22 SECTION 39. The following sections of Chapter I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code,

23 1997 Edition, are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11, Storm

Page 21 of 21



November 18, 1999

v,2

Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 110 1.4, 110 1.11,

110 1. 11.2, 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.11.2.3, 1101.11.2.4, 1101.11.3, 1103.0, 1103. 1,

1103.3, 1104.0, 1104.1, 1105.0, 1105.1, 1105.1.2, 1105.2, 1105.3, 1105.4, 1105.4.1, 1105.4.2,

1106.1, 1106.2, 1106.4, 1109.0, 1109.1, 1109.2, 1109.2. 1, and 1109.2.3, and Table 11 -2.

SECTION 40. The following sections of Chapter I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code

1997 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11,

Storm Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.3,

110 1. 11. 1, 1104.3, 1105.1.1, 1109.2.2, and Table 11 - 1.

SECTION 41. Section 1101.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

10
1

follows:

11 1101.3 MaterialUses. Rainwater piping placed within the interior of a building or run

12 within a vent or shaft shall be of cast iron, galvanized steel, wrought iron, brass, copper, lead,

13 Sched;jle 40 ABS DWV, Schedule 40 PVC DW, or other approved materials, and changes in

14 direction shall conform to the requirements of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997 Edition.

15 g i-fistalWietis sha4l e liffiited te stt:uettifes iiet

16
1

exeeediiig dff ee fieeH above gfade. Fef the ptifpese ef this s-tibseetion, ~he first flee

17

18
1

levek,~4h er- abe:ve fiffished gfade. One (1) addifienM lepvel th4 is the fifst level aiid iiet.

19

20

21

22

23

pefffiWed. )

SECTION42. Section 1101.11.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

1101.11.1 PrimaryRoof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by roof

Page 22 of 21



November 18,1999

v,2

drains or gutters. The location and sizing of drains and gutters shall be coordinated with the

structural design and pitch of the roof. Unless otherwise required by the Administrative

Authority, roof drains, gutters, vertical conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm drains for

primary drainage shall be sized based on a storm of sixty (((60))) minutes duration and

((4-W))one hundred-year return period (see Appendix D of the Uniforin Plumbing Code, 1997

Edition).

7

8 SECTION43. Section 1104.3 of the 1997 UniformPhimbing Code is amended as

follows:

10

1

1104.3 Combining Storm with Sanitary Drainage. The sanitary and storm drainage

11 system of a building shall be entirely separate. ((, e*eept where a eeffibined sewef is tised, in

12

13 sifigle wye fitfings to the eefnbined btfikliiig sewer- 4 least ten (10) feet (3 0 4 8 mm) dewiis4eaffi

14 ffefn afty soil staek. )

15 SECTION44. Section 1105.1.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

16 follows:

17 1105.1.1 Roof drains shall be constructed of materials specified in ((T7ahk-144-)) WAC

18 51-46-1491 -Table 14- 1.

19 SECTION45. Section 1109.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

20 follows:

21 1109.2.2 AirTest. The air test shall be made by attaching an air compressor testing

22 apparatus to any suitable opening after closing all other inlets and outlets to the system, forcing

23 air into the system until there is a uniform gage pressure of five (((-S))) psi (34.5 kPa) or

Page 23 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

1
1

sufficient to balance a column of mercury ten ((f")) inches (254 mm) in height. This pressure

2
1

shall be held without introduction of additional air for a period of at least fifteen (15) minutes.

3
1

((,Sehedi:de 40 plastie DNW systeffis shall not b

4 SECTION46. Table 11-1 of the 1997 Uniforin Plumbing Code is replaced by the

5 following:

6 Table I 1 -1 - Rainwater Leaders

Roof or Other Area Served

- (Square Feet)

Size of Rainwater Leader

(Inches)'
.

1-1050, 2

051-3150 3

3151-6450 4

6451 -10800 5

10801 -18000 6

18001 -35700 8

35701- 58800 10

58801 -95400 12

NOTE: Iftable I I - I does not provide a practical solution for sizing rainwater leaders, refer to

tables I I - I and 11 -2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code for more comprehensive engineering

design information relating to installation of rainwater systems. Use the 2" column maximum

rainfall in inches per hour.

12 SECTION47. Section 22.504.010 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to read as

13 follows:

1. 4 22.504.010 Permit fees.

15 ((E-vet=y ) ALi applicant for a permit to do work under this Plumbing Code shall pay for

16

17

each permit, at the time of issuance, a fee in accordance with the f6llowing schedule, and at the

rate provided for each classification shown in ((g&amp;)) Lhe schedule:

A. Schedule of Fees

Base plumbing permit for one (1) through four (4) fixtures or traps

(other than reduced pressure principle backflow prevention devices or

double check valve assemblies, for which a soarate permit shall be

Page 24 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

1 obtained at the rates in this schedule) .................................... $75

For each additional plumbing fixture or trap (including water'

5

6

7

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

drainage vent piping and backflow protection therefor) ..... 10

For each atmospheric vacuum breaker in irrigation systems, tanks,

vats, etc., or for installation on unprotected plumbing fixtures

including necessary water piping

Vacuum breaker - one (1) to five (5) - each device .............. 10

Vacuum breaker - over five (5) - each device ................... 5

Pressure(( t"e baekflew pfei~ei4e ) vacuum breaker - each ...... 10

Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention device ((ffR&amp;))or double

check valve assembly (( eaeh ......... ............................... 10))

B.

Base plumbing permit for one (1) device or assembly .................. 75

Each additional device or assembly ................................. 10

Fees for Miscellaneous Inspection Services

Fees for inspection service outside regular working hours or for inspection service

requested but not covered by a permit will be charged for at a rate equal to the

cost of performing the service.

Fees for permanent location inspection of factory housing or modular unit containing

plumbing -

For each single-family dwelling or each

modular unit containing plumbing .........
I

...... .............. $20

Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extensions,

water service and necessary gas piping connections,

Page 25 of 21



6

Additional plumbing fixtures installed after factory installation of

plumbing for each plumbing fixture or trap .......................... 10

Fees for reconnection ad retest of plumbing systems in relocated buildings -

For each building containing plumbing ...................... ...... 20

Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extensions,

water service and necessary gas piping connections.

Additional plumbing fixtures installed after relocation ofbuilding

for each plumbing fixture or trap ................... ............. 10

C. For the purpose of this section., "fixture" means and includes an((y)) appliance

lo ((w4iieh)) that is connected with a water, drain((F)) or vent pipe, but ((fie)) A sillcock faucet or

11 hose bibb ((sha4-be)) is not considered a fixture. A sanitary plumbing outlet on or to which a

12
1 plumbing fixture or appliance may be set or attached (( is a fixture,

13 D. A((fky)) person who commenced ((any)) work for which a permit is required by

14 this ((Nuffgiiag)) Code without first having obtained ((sueh)) Lhe permit, shall upon subsequent

15 application for ((&amp;i*eh)) Lhe permit pay double the fee fixed by the ((ffbe,,~e)) schedule of fees for

16 ((stieh)) !he work in subsections A and B of this section unless it ((shaR-be)) is proved to the

17 satisfaction of the Administrative Authority that ((stieh)) the work was urgently necessary and

18 that it was not practical to obtain a permit ((pfief4e)) before the commencement of the work. In

19 all such emergency cases, a permit shall be obtained as soon as it is practical to do so, and if

20 there is an unreasonable delay in obtaining ((sw4)) Lhe permit, a double fee shall be charged as

21 provided in this ((seetie )) Code,

Page 26 of 21



November 18,1999

v.2

1 E~ A reinspection fee of Forty Dollars ($40) may be assessed for each inspection or

2 reinspection Lf the portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or

3 ((when)) Lf corrections called for are not made. This subsection ((i-s)) does not ((te be -ii.-Aeff)feted

4 require inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with

5 ((the a-00 this Code, but as ( diseeer-agiii ) controllin the practice of calling for

6 inspection or reinspection.

7 Reinspection fees may be assessed ((wheff)) Lf the permit is not properly posted on the

8 work site, the work to be inspected is not under test, for failure to provide access on the date for

9 which inspection is requested((T)) or for failure to make required corrections. (ffe--~~

10 feiffspee6en the appheant shall file aii appliea~ieft4hefefef)),Requests for reinspection shall be

11 made in writing upon ((a)) forms furnished for that purpose, and ((Pity)) shall be accomanied by

12 the reinspe'dion fee in accordance with this section. ( hi iflstffiees Whefe)) Lf reinspection fees

13 have been assessed, ((ffe)) additional inspection of the work ((wiJA)) shall not be performed until

14 the required fees have been paid.

15 SECTION 48. Section 22.504.020 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to read as

16 follows:

Page 27 of 21



November 18, 1999

v.2

1 22.504.020 Refund of fees.

2 ((Shee4d)) Lf the work for which a permit fee has been paid is not ((be)) started, the

3 Administrative authority, upon proper application for refund and surrender of the pen-nit for

4 cancellation, shall issue a refund. In determining the amount of refund due, the Administrative

5 Authority shall deduct the amount of the basic fee to cover the cost of administration of the

6 permit. ((Ne)) A refund shall not be made for an((y)) expiredpermit.

7 Passed by the City Council the day of 1-n ~ eo%~~ 1999,

8 and signed by me in open session in authentication of its passage this 2-:2--DJC
- day of

9 1999.

10

11

12

13

14

15 Approved by me this

16

17

is

iesiUentAQhe
City Council

day of N~v
~"'jgj6ee 1999.

\/AXV 51

Pau
1

1 Schell'Mayo

Page 28 of 21



jr-utblic Health
Seattle

&
a
m

p
;

King County

HEALTHY PEOPLE. HEALTHY COMNIUNliT~FS.

Alonzo L. Plough, Ph~D_ MPH, Director

MEMORANDUM

October 14, 1999

TO: Sue Donaldson, President, Seattle City Council

VIA: Elma Borbe, Budget Analyst, Executive Services Department, City of Seattle

FROM: Alonzo Plough, Ph.D., MPH, Director, Public Health - Seattle &amp; King County

RE: Request for Legislative Action - Enactment of Portions of 1997 Uniform Plumbing
Code and Amendments

Please find attached a proposed ordinance amending the Seattle Plumbing Code (SMC Chapter 22.502),

together with form SOP 100-0 14 (Request for Legislative Action). Also attached is a table summarizing

each of the proposed changes section by section,

Periodically the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO) adopts a new

version of the Uniform Plumbing Code and Standards (UPC), The latest version is the 1997 UPC. In

November 1997, the State Building Code Council repealed the state regulations that had adopted the 1991

UPC, and adopted an amended version of the 1997 UPC, per WSR 98-02-055, and WAC 51-46 and 51-47.

The 1997 UPC, as adopted by the State Building Code Council, is in effect throughout the state except in

those cities and counties that have enacted the new code with their local variations.

Seattle has previously adopted earlier revisions to the UPC. Seattle's current Plumbing Code, last amended

in 1993, adopted portions of the 1991 UPC. Compared with previous versions, the 1997 UPC contains an

entirely new section-numbering system. We are thus proposing the local adoption of portions of the 1997

UPC, while clarifying and improving upon our current local amendments that were adopted in previous

revisions. We are currently proposing similar legislation in King County.

Resources and program activity will remain the same, with two exceptions. First, Section 32 of the proposed

legislation establishes a $100 fee for bringing an appeal before the Plumbing Board of Appeals. The

Plumbing Board of Appeals is a six member board that reviews decisions of the local plumbing authority

(i.e., the chief plumbing inspector) concerning applications for approval of alternate materials or methods of

construction. Currently, the appeal fee is $25. The fee increase is needed in order to cover administrative

costs associated with convening meetings of the board and preparing the Board's written decisions.

The second resource-related change is contained in Section 47 of the proposed legislation. That section

amends the plumbing permit fees for certain types of cross connection control devices known as "reduced

pressure principle backflow prevention devices" and "double check valve assemblies." Currently, such

devices are treated as any other plumbing fixture, requiring a $75 base permit fee for installing up to four

devices, plus $10 for each additional device. Under the proposed legislation, cross connection control

devices will require a separate permit at the rate of $75 for installing one device, plus, $ 10 for each additional

device.

Envirenmoentall Heafth

999 3rd Avenue, Suite 700 - Seattle, VVA 9810a-4039
City of Seattle King Cou~ ~ty

T (206) 296-4722 (V/TDD) F (206) 296
GO,-

-0189 - www.metrokc.gov/health I~p Paul Schell, Mayor 0 Ron Sims, Execurive

Pfilt~d ., Ryd~d P~p~,



Sue Donaldson

October 14, 1999

Page 2 of 2

The permit fees would remain unchanged for all other types of plumbing fixture installations. This fee

change is necessary in order to provide funding for the Joint Cross Connection Control Program between the

Health Department and Seattle Public Utilities. This program's purpose is to implement the state's cross-

connection control regulations in accordance with Public Law 104-182-the Safe Drinking Water Act

Amendments of 1996 and WAC 246-290 -490, (as amended per WSR 99-07-02 1).

Thank you for your assistance. if you have any questions, our lead staff members for this legislation are

Dick Andersen, Chief Plumbing Inspector (233-79-14) and Roman Welyczko, Environmental Health

Enforcement Coordinator (296-4797). Finally, I wish to extend our appreciation to Assistant City Attorney

Bryan Glynn of the City of Seattle Law Department for providing invaluable editorial assistance in the

preparation of the attached legislation.

RW,dm
Attachments: Ordinance Amending the Seattle Plumbing Code

Table of Proposed Amendments to the Seattle Plumbing Code

SOP 100-0 14 Request for Legislative Action

cc: Dick Andersen, Public Health - Seattle

&
am

p;

King County

Thomas Castner, Seattle Public Utilities

Bryan Glynn, Seattle Law Department

Maureen Traxler, Department of Construction and Land Use

Roman Welyczko, Public Health - Seattle &amp; King County



SOP 100-014 REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; amending Seattle Municipal

Code Chapter 22.502 to adopt certain portions of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code, to

amend the permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-connection control equipment,

and to amend the application fee for appealing to the plumbing Board of Appeals.

1. Objective:

The objectives of this proposed ordinance are:

a) To update the Seattle Plumbing Code to reflect updated industry standards

adopted by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical

Officials and the Washington State Building Code Council;

b) To amend the fee for bringing an appeal before the plumbing Board of

Appeals, to cover administrative costs of the board's review of proposals for

alternate plumbing methods and materials; and

c) To amend the plumbing permit fees to cover the costs of permit issuance,

inspection, and code enforcement associated with cross-connection control

devices.

2. Dollar amount requested: N/A

3. Fund source and subsequent balance of that fund source: King County Health

Fund.

4. Commitment:

Revenues are intended to cover (a) plumbing Board of Appeals administrative

costs, and (b) costs of permit issuance, inspection and code enforcement

associated with cross-connection control devices.

5. List of new positions and salaries and indication whether positions are permanent:

one permanent Senior Plumbing Inspector.

6. Facilities or equipment required: one leased vehicle

7. Statement of criteria used in program/project evaluation: joint program

evaluation by the Health Department and Seattle Public Utilities.

8. Alternative methods of funding and/or alternative methods of accomplishing the

given program/project: N/A

\Plumbing Code Amdts (Seattle - SOP 100-014)



PLUMBING CODE ORDINANCE

Public Safety, Health, and Technology Committee

November 17,1999

Item #4

Amendments to correct typographical errors:

" Page 5, Line 20: "owner and on7 should be changed to "owner and/or on"

" Page 5, Line 2 5: "owner and on" should be changed to "owner and/or on"

" Page 6, Line 4: "pMpejjy owner and to should be changed to "property owner

and/or to My"



ORDINANCE

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; repealing Seattle

5 22.502.016; adopting Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, Appendices A, B, C, an,
d L

6 and portions of Chapters I and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition;

7 adopting IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-95, 7,-90, 8-95,
1

4 Municipal Code Section 22.502.015 and Ordinance 116594; adding new Section'

8 9-95, 12-93, 13-91, t8-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in AppendiN.1 of the

9 Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; adopting Chapter 13 of the.,~Uniform

10 Mechanical Code; amending the adopted Uniform Plumbing Code by amending
11 and adding new sections to Chapter I Administration, amending Chapter 2

1-2 Definitions, amending Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribut ion, and amending
13 Chapter 11 Storm Drainage; amending the fee for appealifig to the Plumbing
14 Board of Appeals; and amending Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.504.010,A

15 governing permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-connection control

1-6 equipment.
fl,

17

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

19 SECTIONI. Section 22.502.015 of the Seattle Municipal Code and Ordinance 116594

20 are hereby repealed.

21 SECTION 2. A new Section 22.502.016 is added to the Seattle Municipal Code to read

22 as follows:

23 22.502.016 Adoption of Uniform Plumbing Code, IAPMO Installation Standards

24 and Seattle Amendments.

25 The following are here~
,

Y adopted and by this reference made a part of this subtitle:

26 Portions of Chapters I and I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended

27 by this ordinance; Chapters 2 and 6 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended by

28 this Ordinance; Chapters, 3 through 5, 7 through 10, 13, 14, and Appendices A, B, C, and L of the

29 Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-

30 95, 7-90, 8-95, 9-95, 12-93, 13-91, 17-90, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendix I of

31 the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; all as published by the International

32 Plumbing Officials (one copy of which has been filed with the City Clerk in C.

33 and Chapter 13 of the 1997 Uniform Mechanical Code as adopted by Ordinance 1196

-
tfe~~S--e-atll,,--,,,~mendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted by Ordinance3

4.11
-,wit6-

I constitute the official Plumbing Code of the City of Seattle and hereinafter

to, as "the code" or "this code." In case of conflict between the Uniform Plumbing

37 Code, the IAPMO Installation Standards and the Seattle Amendments, the Seattle Amendments

38 shall be cont.rolling.

Page I of 21



SECTION 3. The following sections of Chapter I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997

Edition are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of

the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 101.3, 101.4, 101.4~ 1, 10 1.4~ 1. 1,

101.4.1.1.2, 101.4.1.1.3, 101.4.1.2, 101.4.2, 101.5, 101.5.3, 101.5.6, 102.0,,,102,2, 102.2.4, 102.3,

103.0, 103.1, 103.1.1, 103.1.2, 103.1.2.1, 103.1.2.2, 103.2, 103.2.1, 103.2.1.1, 103.2.1.2,

103.2
~

1. 3, 103.2.1.4, 103.2.1.5, 103.2.3, 103.3, 103.3.1, 103.3,5, t03.5, 103.5.1.1, 103.5. 1
~ 2,

103.5.1.4, 103.5.2, 103.5.3, 103.5.3.5, 103.5.4, 103.5.4.1, 103-5.4.2, 103.5.5, 103.5.5.2, 103.7,

103.7.1, 103.8, 103.8.1, and 103.8.2.

SECTION 4. The following sections of Chapter I of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997

1-0 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 1,

11 Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 10 1. 4. 1. 1, 1,

12 101.4.1.3, 101.4.3, 101.5.1, 101.5.2, 10.1.5.4, 101.5.5, 102.1, 102.2.1, 102.2.2, 102.2.3, 102.2.5,

13 102.2.6, 102.3.1, 102.3.2, 103,13, 1,03.2.1.6, 103.2.2, 103.3.3, 103.5.1, 103.5.1.3, 103.5
~
5. 1,

14 103.5.6, 103.5.6.1, 103.5.6.2, and 103.5.6.3.

15 SECTION5. Section 101.4.1.1.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

16 follows:

17 101.4,1.1.1 In existing buildings or premises in which plumbing installations are to be

18 altered, repaired, or'renovated, deviations from the provision of this Code are permitted,

19 provided such deviations are found by the Administrative Authori to be necessary as alternate

20 methods or mate,rials- in accordance with the standards in Section 301.2 of this Code,and are first

21 approved by the Administrative Authority.

22 SECTION 6. Section 101.4.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

2 3 1 follows:

24
1 1011.4.1.3 Existing Construction. No provision of this Code shall be deemed to

2 5
1

require a change in any portion of a plumbing or drainage system or any other work regulated by

2 6
1

this Code in'or on an existing building or lot when such work was installed and is maintained in

27 accordance with law in effect ((prior- to t4e effeetive date of this God )) at the time the system

28 was installed or the work completed, except when any such plumbing or drainage system or other

29 work regulated by this Code is determined by the Administrative Authority to be in fact

30 dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or a nuisance ((a*d)) or a menace to life, health or property.

Page 2 of 21



1 SECTION 7. Section 101.4.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

2 follows:

3 101.4.3 The provisions in the appendices are intended to supplement the requirements of

4 this Code and shall not be considered part of this Code unless ((for-ma4l))) adopted as such_by

5 ordinance.

6 SECTION 8. Section 101.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

7 follows:

101.5.1 Additions, Alterations or Repairs. Additions, alterations or repairs may be

made to any plumbing system without requiring the existing plumbing system to comply with all

10 the requirements of this Code, provided the addi
I

tion, alteration or repair conforms to that

required for a new plumbing system. Additions, alterations or repairs shall not cause or allow an

1-2 existing system to become unsafe, insanitary or overloaded.

13 SECTION 9. Section 101.5.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

14 follows:

15 101.5.2 Health and Safety. Whenever the Administrative Authority determines that

16 compliance with all the provisions of this Code fails to eliminate or alleviate a nuisance, or any

17 other dangerous or insanitary conditions which ((ffiay)) involve health or safety hazards, the

18 owner or the owner"s agent shall install such additional plumbing and drainage facilities or shall

19 make such repairs or alterations as may be ordered by the Administrative Authority.

20 SECTION 10. Section 101.5.4 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

21 follows:

22 101.5A Changes in Building Occupancy. Plumbing systems, which are a part of any

23 building or structure undergoing a change in ((use e occupancy, as defined in the Building

24 Code, shall pomply to all requirements of this Code, which may be applicable to the new ((use

25 oF)) occupancy.

26 SECTION 11. Section 101.5.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

27 follows:

28 10L5.5 Maintenance. All plumbing systems, materials and appurtenances, both

29 existing and new, and all parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operating condition. All

30 devices or safeguards required by this Code shall be maintained in conformance with the Code

Page 3 of 21



((edifion undep-yAi")) in effect when installed. The owner or the owner's designated agent shall

be responsible for maintenance of plumbing systems. To determine compliance with this

subsection, the Administrative Authority may cause any plumbing system to be ((r-eiflspeeted))

inspected.

SECTION 12. Section 102.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.1 Administrative Authority. The Administrative Authority ((shall be the

)).is the director of the Seattle-King CgILnty

9 LLepqrtment of Public Health or the director's authorized representative, who shall administer and

10 enforce the provisions of the plumbing and mechanical code (Chgpter 13 of the 1997 Uniform

11 Mechanical Code) as adopted or amended except as provided in this Code; provided, that the

12 Director of Seattle Public Utilities or his or her authorized representative shall administer and

13 enforce provisions relating to the insr.-ection and gpproval of water meters and, where ~!pplicqble,

14 building supply piping

15 SECTION 13. Section,`~ 102.2.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

16 follows:

j

17 102.2.1 The Administrative Authority may ((appoint sueh assistants, deputies,

18

19
1

this Code.)) adopt such administrative rules and regulations consistent with this Code as shall be

20 deemed necessary for its administration and enforcement.

21 SECTION 14. Section 102.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

22 follows:

23 102.2.2 Right of Entry.

24

2 5

~

believe that there e*ists in any build-Ing -or- upon an

26 Code which M-Ake th-e building oF
.

afe, insanitaff, dangerous eF hazar-dous, the

27

28

29
1

- -

--upied, the Adminis4afive Authe#ity shall present efedentials ta

30 the eeeupant and request entFy. if stieh buildin., - P-1
.

WS is ofloeeUpled, the Admiffistf~

Page 4 of 21



AuthE)Fity has Fe00HFS0 tO ON'efy FOffledy ffevided by !a-w to seeufe entry.

When the Administr-ative Authority shall have fiFst ob-+--kned V-F-F ns waFFant

or- other- Femedy pFovided by law to seeufe entr-y, no owner-, oeoupant, or. obar-ge,

of inspeetion and e*amillation pufsuant to this Code.)) Upon'~resentation of proper credentials,

the Administrative Authorijy mqy, with the consent of the occMant or with the consent of the

1-0 owner of an unoccupied building or premises, or in,accordance with a lawfully issued search

11 warrant, enter at reasonable times a building orpremises to perform a duty iMposed upon the

12 Administrative Authority by this Code, provided that the Administrative Authority shall make

13 entry only if such entry is consistent withthe constitutions and laws of the United States and the

14 State of Washington.

15 SECTION 15. Section 102.2.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

16 1 follows:

17 102.2.3 Stop ((OFdos)) Work Notice and Correction Notice.

18 A. Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, the

19
1

Administrative Authorit
'

may order the work stopped by notice in writing served on the propefty

20 owner and on any persons ((engaged in ) doing or causing such work to be done, and any such

21 persons shall ((fefthNyith)) immediatel stop work until authorized by the Administrative

2 2
1

Authority to proceed with the work. Service of a stop work order shall be made by one or more

2 3

1

of the following methods:

24 Personal service: Personal service of a stop work order ma be made on the property

25 owner and on any person doing or causing the work to be done, or by leaving the stop work order

26 at the house of usual abode of the person being served, provided that the stop work order is left

27 with a person ofsuitable age and discretion,who resides there.

28 Service fil posting on the property: Service directed to the property owner and/or

29 person doing or causing such work to be done mM be made by posting the stop work order in a

30 conspicuous plac&amp; on the property where the work is occurring, and concurrently mailing notice

Page 5 of 21



I as provided for below, if a mailing address is available.

2 Service by mail: Service by mail ma be made for a stop work order by mailing two

3 copies, postage prepaid, one by ordinM first class mail and the other by certified mdil, to the

4 property owner and to any person doing or causing such work to be done, at the last known

qdd,-c~,s of the person being served, at the address of the location of the work bein done, or at the

address of the place of business of the person being served. The taxpaver's address as shown on

the tax records of the county shall be deemed to be the proper ad-dress for the puMose of mailipg

such notice to the person being served, Service by mail shall be presumed effective upon th

third business da after the da upon which the stol? w&amp;k order was placed in the mail.

10
1

B. Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code, the

11
1

administrative authority mU order the violati.6ns corrected without ordering all work stoppedby

12
1

issuing a correction notice that identifies ,the violation. The c.orrection notice mU require

13
1

reinspection before further construction or at the time of the next required inspection. The

14 correction notice shall be served oi posted in the same manner as a stop work order.

15 C. These remedies are in addition to those authorized elsewhere in the Code.

16 SECTION 16. Seell ion 102.2.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

17 follows:

18 102.2.5 Authority to ((Condemn)) Correct Hazardous or Insanitary Plumbing.

19 Whenever the Administrative Authority ascertains that any plumbing system or portion thereof,

20 regulated by this Code, has become hazardous to life, health, property, or has become insanitary,

21 the Administrat
1 ve Authority shall order in writing that such plumbing either be removed or

2 2
1

placed in a safe or sanitary condition, as appropriate. The order shall fix a reasonable time limit

23 for compliance. No person shall use or maintain defective plumbing after receiving such notice.

24 When such plumbing system is to be disconnected, written notice shall be given. In cases

25 ((of)) in which the Administrative Authority has determined that immediate danger to life or

26 property_g~xists, the Administrative Authority mgy cause such disconnection ((+%-ty)) Lo be made

27 immediately without such notice.

28 SECTION 17. Section 102.2.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

29 follows:

30 102.2.6 Liability claims.

Page 6 of 21



@nfomement of this Code, acting in good faith and without maliee in the disehar-ge of the

10

11

Admiaistr-ativ@ AutheFity's duties, sha4l not thefeby be fend-r-ed peFsoflally liable ~ar- any damage

the disehar-ge of duties. A suit Wought against the Administrative Auth(

or- omission per-foFmed in the enforcement of an), pFovis,ton of this Code sha4l be

defended by legal eoufisel pr-ovided by this jur-isdietion until final termination of SU

pFoeeedia This Code is enacted as an exercise of the police power of the City of Seattle to

protect and preserve the public peace, health, safety and welfare, and its provisions shall be

liberally construed for the accoMplishment of thesc purposes. It is expressly the purpose of this

Code to provide for and promote the health, sal'cty and welfare of the general public, and not to

create or otherwise establish or designate aily particular class or group of persons who will or

12 should be especially protected or benefittod by the terms of this Code.

13 It is, the specific intent of t~JS Code to place the obligation of complying with its

14 reguirements upon the owner or.occupier of premises within this code's scope, and no provision

15 nor term used in this Co.d.e..is,;Titen01c,-l to impose any duLy whatsoever upon the Administrative

16 Authority or any of theArvanistrative authori!y's officers or employees, for whom the

17 implementation or enforcement of this Code shall be discretionary and not mandgigry.

18 Nothing in thi,, Code creates or forms the basis for any liability on the part of the

19 Administrative Atittiority, or the Administrative Authority's officers, eMployees or agents, for

2 0
1

any injury or dqMa Se resulting from the failure of the owner or occupier of premises to coMply

21 with the provisinj-,,~ of this Code, or by reason or in consequence of any act or omission in

22 connection, with the iMplementation or enforcement of this Code on the part of the

23 Administrative Authority by the Administrative Authority's officers, eMployees or agents.

24 Any claim and/or litigation. arising from any conduct, acts or omissions of the

25 Adminis~trafi\~e Authority, or any of the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents,

26 shall be subject to the provisions of Seattle Municipal Code Ch4pter 4.64, as amended.

27 SECTION 18. Section 102.3.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

28 follows:

29 102.3.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm,. ((ef)) corporation or other

30 ~~it to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip,

Page 7 of 21



use, or maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this Code.

SECTION 19. Section 102.3.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amend
'

cd as

follows:

102.3.2 Penalties. Any person, firm, ((e+)) corporation or other entit violating any

provision of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon-c'onviction thereof,

shall be punishable by a fine and/or imprisonment set forth by the 's of the

jur-isd-w-400 Seat le CriminalCode or by state law. Each separate day or any portion thereof,

during which any violation of this Code occurs or continues, shall be deemed to constitute a

separate offense.

-10 SECTION 20. Section 103.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

3-1 follows:

1-2 103.1.3 Licensing. It shall be the obligation of every person who enters into contracts

13 for the installation or repair of plumbing systems ((eover-ed by this eode, foF which a permit is

14 fequirved)) for which this Code requires a permit, to comply with all Mplicable state or local rules

15 and regulations concerning licensin ((whieh the ap keable govefniag authority has adep9, P

16 SECTION 21. Section 103.2.1.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

1-7 follows:

18 103.2.1.6 Give such other data and information relevant to the proposed work as may be

19 required by the Administrative Authority.

20 SECTION 22. Section 103.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

21 follows:

22 103.2.2 Plans and Specifications. Plans, engineering calculations, diagrams and other

23 data shall be submitted in one or more sets with each application for a permit. The

24 Administrative Authority may require plans, computations and specifications to be prepared by

25 and the plumbing designed by an engineer and/or architect licensed by the state to practice as

26 such.

27
1

1 Exception: The Administrative'Authority may waive the submission of plans,

28 calculations or other data if the Administrative Authority finds that the nature of the work applied

29 for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary to ((obt-ai*)) determine compliance within the

30 Code.

Page 8 of 21



SECTION23. New section 103.3. 1. 1 concerning owners' permits is adopted to read as

follows and -by this reference is made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle

Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

103.3.1.1 Owner's Permit. A bona fide owner may install, alter, or repair plumbing in

his or her own building, provided:

I The installation, alteration, or repair work is not undertaken with the intention and

for the purpose of selling the property iMproved by such. work;

2. The owner ggplies in person for an owner's permit for the work to be done, and

pqys the permit fee according to the fee schedti le in this code;

10
1

3. The owner obtains an owner's permit before commencing the installation,

12 4. The installation ahcration. or reDair work is nerformed exclusivelv bv the owner

11

1

alteration, or repair work,

1-3 and not by any other person, J ricluding a plumbinf,, contractor; and

14 5. The instal la-tion, alteration, or repair work is performed in the manner required b

15 this codc subject to inspection and ~~pproval by the administrative auth2dty.

16 SECTION24. Section 103.3.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

17 follows:

18
1

103.3J' Validity of Permit. The issuance of a permit or approval of plans and

19
1

specifications shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of

26 A person to whom a permit has been issued shall not allow another person to do or cause

24 plans', specifications and other data or from preventing building operations being carried on

25 thereunder when in violation of this Code or of other ordinances of this jurisdiction.

21 give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code shall be valid.

22 "the issuance of a permit based upon plans, specifications or other data shall not prevent

23 the Administrative Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errors contained in said

20 the provisions of this Code or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction. No permit presuming to

27 to be done an work under such permit except persons in the employ of the permittee.

28 Every plumbing permit shall be posted on the building, structure or premises where the

29 work permitted is being performed and shaR not be removed until the work has been finall

30 ~Ipproved by the Administrative Authority.

Page 9 of 21



Every permit issued by the administrative authority under the provisions of this code shall

expire by limitation and become null and void one year from date of issue. Permits ex~ired fo

not more than one year mM be renewed for one-half the original cost or fifty dollars, whichever

is less. Permits e-K ired for more than one year require the regular scheduled,fees.

Plumbing work authorized by a permit in effect on the effective date of this code shall be

performed in accordance with the laws and ordinances in effect when the permit was issued,

except when the administrative authori!y determines the wori to be in fact dangerous, unsafe,

insanitary, or a nuisance or a menace to life, health or property.

9 SECTION 25. Section 103.5.1 of the 19,97 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

10 follows:

11 103.5.1 General. All plumbing, systems for which a permit is required by this Code

12 shall be inspected by the Administrati ve Authority. No portion of any plumbing system shall be

13 covered or otherwise concealed until inspected and approved, Neither the Administrative

14 Authority nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement

15 of material required to permit inspection. When the installation of a plumbing system is

16
1

complete, an additional and final inspection shall be made.

17 SECTION 26.,. Section 103.5.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

18 follows:

19 103.5.1.3 Covering or Using. No plumbing or drainage system, building sewer,

20 private sewer disposal system or part thereof, shall be covered, concealed, or put into use until it

21 has been tested, inspected, and ((aeeepte )) ~pproved as prescribed in this Code.

22 SEU1110N 27. Section 103.5.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

23 follows:

24 103.5.5.1 Defective Systems. An air test shall be used in testing the sanitary condition

25 of the drainage or plumbing system of any building premises when there is reason to believe that

26 it has become defective. In buildings or premises condemned by the ((PFoper-)) Administrative

27 Authority because of an insanitary condition of the plumbing system or part thereof, the

28 ((aRer-atiens in)) corrections to such system shall conform to the requirements of this Code.

29 SECTION 28. Section 103.5.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

30 follows:

Page 10 of 21



103.5.6 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or

1 10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

reinspection when ((such peFtion)) part or all of the work for which inspection is called4s' not

complete or when required corrections have not been made.

This provision is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the,Airst time a job is

rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as controlling the practice

of calling for inspections before the job is ready for inspection or reinsliection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the approved platis are not readily available to

the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which the inspection is requested, or

for deviating from plans (( )
when the deviation requires gpproval but

has not been ~!,pproved by the Administrative Authority
I

Y.

To obtain reinspection, the applicant shallfile an application therefor in writing upon a

form furnished for that purpose and pay the reifispection fee in accordance with ((Tatbk-~4))

Ch~!pter 22.504 of this Code.

In instances where reinspection.fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the

work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

SECTION 29. Section 1'. 03.5.6.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.5.6.1 Corrections. Notices of correction or violation shall be ((wr-ittefl)) issued by

the Administrative Authority and may be posted at the site of the work or mailed or delivered to

the permittee or his authorized representative. Refusal, failure, or neglect to comply with any

such notice or order within ten days of receipt thereof, shall be considered a violation of this

Code, and shall -be subject to the ((pefia4ies)) remedies for violations as set forth elsewhere in

this Code. ((fof violatiaas~))

SECTION 30. Section 103.5.6.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.5.6.2 Retesting. If the Administrative Authority finds that the work does

not pass.((t4e)) any required test or inspection, necessary corrections shall be made and the work

shall then be resubmitted for test or inspection.

29
1

SECTION 31. Section 103.5.6.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

3 0 1 follows:

Page 11 of 21



103.5.6.3 Approval. Upon the satisfactory completion and final test of the plumbin~g

Plumbing Board of Appeals, and 105.0, 105.1, 105.1.1, 105.1.2, 105.1.3, afid 105.1.4 concerning

SECTION32. New sections 104.0,104.1, 104.1.1 and 104.1.2 conceffling the

system, a certificate of approval shall be issued by the Administrative Authority to the peirmittee.

Hearing Examiner appeals, are adopted to read as follows and by this,~re/ference are made a part

of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the ~,097 Uniform Plumbing Code:

104.0 Board of Appeals

A Board of Appeals shall be established and shall consist of six voting members, wit

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

one member representing journeyman plumbers, p1timbing contractors, professional mechanical

engineers, and building owners and two members representing the public. The Administrative

Authority shall serve as a nonvoting member of the Board. The Board of Appeals shall elect a

chair and a secretM who shall serve at-1he pleasure of the Board.

104.1 Any party aggrieved ~by a decision of the Administrative Authority made in

accordance with this Code eithef in the context of a specific project or permit ~Pplication or in

the context of an Uplicationfor qpproval of an alternate material or method of construction, o

both, may file a written petition for ~ppeal to the Board, accompanied by a nonrefundable fee of

one hundred dollars. Appeals shall be heard at reasonable times at the convenience of the Board,

but not later than thirty dqys after receipt of the petition. However, this time requirement mE be

waived by written agreement between the Administrative Authority and the Mpellant if do~jg so

will facilitate rq§olution of the dispute. The gppellant shall be entitled to appear in person before

the Board,
to.,be represented by an attorney, and to introduce evidence in support of such petition.

The ~!ppell
:

ant shall cause to be made at the Mpellant's own expense any test or research require

by the Board for the substantiation of any claim or claims made by the gpl2ellant. The Board of

25 Appeals,~shall determine whether a correct inteMretation of this Code has been made by the

26 Administrative Authority.

27 104.1.1 Decisions of the Board shall be in writing; shall be distributed to the

28 Administrative Authority and the ~ppellant; and shall gpply only to the case being heard. Board

29 decisions are deemed issued on the date that the decision is delivered to the ~!Ppellant or the

30 apellant's counsel or, if the decision is mailed, on the date of mailing. Any person aggrieved by

Page 12 of 21



a-decision of the Board mqy appeal the decision of the Board to the Hearing Examiner as

provided in Sections 105.0 through 105.1.4 of this ch~pter.

104.1.2 The Board mqy make recommendations to the Administrative Authority

4

5

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19I

20

changes in the Code.

105.0 Hearing Examiner Appeals.

105.1 Filing of Appeals. A ttle Heginppeals shall be filed with the City of Sa

Examiner by five p.m. (5:00 p.m.) of the tenth (10t") calendar dav following the date the decision

of the Board is issued pursuant to Section 104. 1. 1. When the last Ok/ of the ~!ppeal period so

coMputed is Saturda, SundU or ci!y holidqy, the period shall run..until five p.m. (5:00 12.m.) on

the next business d4y. An qppeal shall be considered filed4ith the Hearing Examiner when it

delivered to the Hearing Examiner's office or, if the ateal is sent via US mail or a private mail

service, when it is received by the Exwniner. The Examiner's date stamp shall be placed on

incoming ~!ppeals and there is a rebuttable presumption that the date and time stamped is the date

and time of filing. The..Upeal shall be in wfitim~ and shall state specifically why the ~Lppellqnt
I

believes the decision of the Board to bej-ncorrect and what relief is sought. The ~jppeal shall be

accoMpanied by p4yment of the filling fee as set forth in SMC Section 3.02.125, ffi~ gin

Examiner Filing Fees, including afty amendments or revisions thereto.

105.1.1 Parties of Record. The parties to the Epeal shall be the appellant and the

Administrative Authori!y.

105.1.2 Notice of Hearing. Notice of the hearing on the appeal shall be mailed Twenly

(20) des prior to the wheduled hearing date to the parties of record.

22
1

105.1.3 Sc
' and Standard of Review. The hearing shall be de novo. The Board's

24 Upellant to prove that the Board's decision is clearly erroneous.

I

25 105.1.4 Hearing Examiner's Decision. The Hearing Examiner shall issue a decision

27 record. The decision shall contain written findings and conclusions. The Hearing Examiner's

28 decision shall be final and conclusive and the parties of record shall be bound by the terms and

29 conditions of the decision unless within twenty-one dUs from the date of issuance of the

30 decision Vpellant makes ~ppfication to King County Superior Court for a Land Use Petition

Page 13 of 21

2 3
1

decision shall be gi, en substantial weight by the Hearing Examiner and the burden shall be on

2 6
1

in writing within fifteen dgys after the close of the hearing and mail that decision to all parties of
I



pursuant to RCW 36.70C.

SECTION 33. Section 206.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended to add a

new definition as follows:

206.0 --D--

Domestic Water Heater - A domestic water heater is a tank with W I

self-contained

heating unit which stores potable hot water for residential or commerpial use with a nominal

water containing ci~pacity of one-hundred twenty gallons or less',having a heating input of two-

hundred thousand BTUs per hour or less used for hot water supply at pressures of one-hundred

'I

Lo
I

sixLy pounds 12er square inch or less and at operating temperatures of two-hundred ten degrees

13 SECTION 34. Section 214.0 of the 11997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

14 follows:

15 214.0 --L--

16

17
1

Listing Agency - An agen.6 accepted by the Administrative Authority which is in the

18
1

business of listing or labeling an($," which maintains a periodic inspection program on current

19 production of listed models, and, which makes available a published report of such listing in

20 which specific information isjncluded that the product has been tested to approved standards and

2 1
1

found safe for use in a specific manner. Listing Agencies qpproved by the Administrative

2 2
1

Authority are as follows: International Association of plumbing and Mechanical Officials

23
1

(I.A.P.M.O.); Washington State Dppartment of Social and Health Services; National Sanitation

2 4
1

Foundation (N.S.F.); City of Los An_geles Testing Laboratory; American Gas Association;

28

29

30

Canadian Gas Association; Canadian Standards Association-, and Underwriters Laboratories.

Listing agencies or testing laboratories are not limited to the agencies named in this section.

Other testing or listing agencies may be added to the gpproved list as the administrative authori!y

deems necessM.

SECTION 35. Section 218.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

Page 14 of 21



3

follows:

218.0 --P--

Plumbing System - Includes all potable water building supply and distribution pipes, all

plumbing fixtures and traps, all drainage and vent pipe(s), and all building drains and building

sewers, including their respective joints and connection, devices, receptors, and appurtenances

7 within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable water piping, potable water

8 treating or using equipment, medical gas and medical vacuum systems, fuel gas piping, water

9 heaters ((and vents for- same)) and rainwater leaders. However, certification is not required for

1-0 the. Installation of a plumbing system within the property lines and outside the building.

12 Public or Public Use - All buildings or structures that are not defined as private or

13 private use.

1-4 (1) General Use Uplies to business, commercial, industrial and assembl

15 occupancies other than those defined under heavy use. Included are the public and common

1-6 areas in hotels, motels and multidwelling buddi 'Us.

17 (2) Heavy Use assembly appli6s to toilet facilities in occupancies which place a

3-8 heavy, but intermittent time-based demand on the water supply system, such as schools,

19 auditoriums, stadiums, race courses, transportation terminals, theaters and similaroccupancies

20 where queuing is likely to occur duriiig periods of peak use.

21

22 SECTION 36. Section 6,04.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

23 follows:

24 604.1 Water pipe and fittings shall be of brass, copper, cast iron, ((galvanized ma4leable

25 ifon-,)) galvanized wrought iron, ((galvanized stee4-,)) or other approved materials. Cast iron

26 fittings used for water need not be galvanized if over two ((q))) inches (5 1 mm.) in size.

27 Asbestos-cement, CPVC, PE, or PVC water pipe manufactured to recognized standards may be

28 used for cold water distribution systems outside a building. CPVC water pipe and tubing may be

29 used for hot and cold water distribution systems within a building. All materials used in the

30 water supply system, except valves and similar devices shall be of a like material, except where

Page 15 of 21



otherwise approved by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 37. Section 604.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a weight of not less than Type L.

'r 'NA 1,; 11 11 F-

I

YF~ ~FF~l "
L1,5 111"y %, Lta,-, I VV %.,I F F L16 VV %,11 F F 116,Ja V V

ground in, or on, a building. ((or- under-gr-e-nd of stmetur-es.))

SECTION 38. New section 803.1 concerning parking garage draina 'ge systems is

adopted to read as follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 8, Indirect Wastes, of

9 the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

10 803.1 Parking Garage Drainage Systems. All floor dndnage under the roof of a

11 parking garage shall be connected to the sanitgg drainage system. When the top floor of the

!2 building is used as a roof as well as a parking area, the draina c from the roof shall be connected

13 to the storm drainage system. Drainage from conventigial plumbing fixtures shall not be inter-

14
1

connected with the floor drainage system. However,..zdrainage lines from car or truck washin

15
1

equipment mqy be connected to the floor drainage s y stem through an ~pvroved interceptor. Floor

16
1

drainage waste lines shall be a minimumof three' inches in size. Waste unit loadings for three-

17
1

inch or larger size floor drainage piping shall'be sized in accordance with table 7-5 of this code.

Floor drains or floor drain oi?enings shall b6 equipped with 4pproved strainers and need not be

19 trEped when connected to the building drain through a properly tr~~pped and vented interceptor,

20 Tr4ps shall not be used when the floor.drains are located in areas exposed to freezing

21- temperatures. The waste line from fl~or drains entering an interceptor shall be above the waste

22 line discharging from the interceptor to the building drain. The sand interceptor receiving the

23 floor drains shall have a water seal'of not less than six inches. Floor drain trgps need.not be

2 4
1

vented individually if line ventinA is used through an Uproved indirect waste system with a

25
1

properly tr4pped and vented interceptor. Aline ent for floor drains shall terminate through the

26
1

roof orto an Mproved loc.a.fioti in the outside atmosphere. When using line venting, the

27 terminatim-, vents, if more than one, shall be equal in cross sectional area to the size of the waste

28 line entering the interceptor or the line vent mgy continue full size from the interc~~ptor to the

2 9
1

point of termination. All plans for parking garage floor drainage systems shall be submitted to

3 0
1

the administrative authority prior to installation for qpproval.

Page 16 of 21



1 SECTION 39. The following sections of Chapter 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code,

2 1997 Edition, are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11, Storm

3 Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.4, 1101 11,

4 1101.11.2, 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.11.2.3, 1101.11.2.4, 1101.11.3, 1103.0,1 103.1,

5

6

1103.3, 1104.0, 1104.1, 1105.0, 1105.1, 1105.1,2, 1105.2, 1105.3, 1105 A, 11 05~A. 1, 1105.4.2,

1106.1, 1106.2, 1106.4, 1109.0, 1109.1, 1109.2, 1109.2. 1, and 1109.2.3, and Table 11 -2.

7 SECTION 40. The following sections of Chapter I I of the Uniform Plumbing Code

8 1997 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11,

9 Storm Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.3,

10 110 1. 11. 1, 1104.3, 1105.1.1, 1109.2.2, and Table 11 - 1.

'1I SECTION 41. Section 1101.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

12 follows:

13 1101.3 Material Uses. Rainwater piping placed within the interior of a building or run

14 within a vent or shaft shall be of cast iron, galvaniZed steel, wrought iron, brass, copper, lead,

15 Schedule 40 ABS DWV, Schedule 40 PVC DWV, or other approved materials, and changes in

16 direction shall conform to the requirements of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997 Edition.

17 ((seetion 706.0. ABS and PVC DNATV 11411" 1
ii-tallations sha4l e limited to stnietur-es not,

18

19
1

building shall be that floof tha4 has f4f4y k--./ - --_ of the extefiofv~,a4l sur-faee afea

20

21 designed for- homan habitation an6 used only feF vehiele par-king, stefage, Of- sifflilaf use shall

22 pemiiaed.))

23 SECTION42. Section'~1101.11.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

24 follows:

25 1101.11.1 Primary Roof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by roof

26 drains or gutters, The location and sizing of drains and gutters shall be coordinated with the

27 structural design and pitch of the roof. Unless otherwise required by the Administrative

28 Authority, roof drains, gutters, vertical conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm drains for

29 primary drainage shall be sized based on a stormof sixty minutes duration and

30 ((44)0))one hundred-year return period (see Appendix D of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997

Page 17 of 21



Edition

3 SECTION 43. Section 1104.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

5 1104.3 Combining Storm with Sanitary Drainage. The sanitary and storm drainage

6 system of a building shall be entirely separate, exeept WheFe a eombined sewer- is used, in

whieh case the building AOFm dFain shall be connected in the s-A;44.J-~ 1H.--fizontal plane thFeugh

single wye fittings to the oombined building sewer- at least
te:p

(10) feet (304 9 MM) dowflstFea

fiom any se4-Aaek-.))

3-0 SECTION44. Section 1105.1.1 of the 199TUniform. Plumbing Code is amended as

11 follows:

12 1105.1.1 Roof drains shall be constructed of materials specified in (j4bk-14-4)) WAC

13 51-46-1491 -Table 14- 1.

14 SECTION 45. Section 1109.2.2' of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

1-5 follows:

16 1109.2.2 AirTest. The ai- lest shall be made by attaching an air compressor testing

17 apparatus to any suitable opening.after closing all other inlets and outlets to the system, forcing

18 air into the system until there is a uniform gage pressure of five (((-54)) psi (34.5 kPa) or sufficient

19 to balance a column of mercury ten inches (254 mm.) in height. This pressure shall be

20 held without introduction of additional air for a period of at least fifteen (15) minutes.

21

22

23

24

I -I of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is replaced by the

Table 11-1 - Rainwater Leaders

Roof or Other Area Served

(Square Feet)

Size of Rainwater Leader

(Inches)

~1 - 1050

37151 -6450

6451 -10800 5

10801- 18000

18001- 35700 8

35701 -58800
-

10

58801 -95400 12

25 NOTE: If table I I -I does not provide a practical solution for sizing rainwater leaders, refer to

26 tables 11 - I and 11 -2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code for more comprehensive engineering

27 design information relating to installation of rainwater systems. Use the 2" column maximum

SECTION 46. .,,Table

following:

Page 18 of 21



rainfall in inches per hour.

2

3

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

SECTION47. Section 22.504.010 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to read as

An applicant for a permit to do work under this Plumbing Codc~hall pay for

each permit, at the time of issuance, a fee in accordance with the following sch
,

~dule, and at the

follows:

22.504.010 Permit fees.

rate provided for each classification shown in ((thi&amp;)) the schedule:

A. Schedule of Fees

Base plumbing permit for one (1) through four (4) fixturesbr traps

(other than reduced pressure principle backflow prevention devices or

double check valve assemblies, for which a separate'l2ermit shall be

obtained at the rates in this schedule~. .
I ........................ $75

For each additional plumbing fixture or trap f including water

drainage vent piping and backflow~"p'rotection therefor) ........ 10

For each atmospheric vacuum breaker in irrigation systems, tanks,

vats, etc., or for installation on unprotected plumbing fixtures

includin2 necessary water pipingy

Vacuum breaker'- one (1) to five (5) - each device .............. 10

Vacuum breakir - over five (5) - each device ................... 5

Pressure((4-~pe baekflow pr-eyeiita vacuum breaker - each ...... 10

Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention device ((ap,&amp;))or double

check valve assembly eaeh .........
I ...............................

Base plurnbiu~ permit for one (1) device or assembly .................. 75

Each additional device or assembly ................................ 10

B. Fees for Miscellaneous Inspection Services

Fees for inspection service outside regular working hours or for inspection service

requested but not covered by a permit will be charged for at a rate equal to the

cost of performing the service.

Fees for permanent location inspection of factory housing or modular unit containing

plumbing -

Page 19 of 21



1

2

For each single-family dwelling or each

modular unit containing plumbing ................................ $zO

Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extension S,

water service and necessary gas piping connections.

10

Additional plumbing fixtures installed after factory installation of

plumbing for each plumbing fixture or trap ....... I'/ ............. 10

Fees for reconnection ad retest of plumbing systems in relocated buildings -

For each building containing plumbing .......... .................... 20

Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of'building drain extensions,

water service and necessary gas piping connections.

11 Additional plumbing fixtures installed after relocation of building

12 for each plumbing fixture or trap. ....... I ..................... 10

-13
1

C. For the purpose of this section,, "fixture" means and includes an((y)) appliance

14
1

((w4")) that is connected with a water, drain((q)) or vent pipe, but ((*e)) A sillcock faucet or

1-5 hose bibb ((shall be)) is not considered a fixture. A sanitary plumbing outlet on or to which a

16 plumbing fixture or appliance may be set or attached ((sha4l be eonstr-ued to be)) is a fixture,

17 D. A((ny)) person who commenced ((a*y)) work for which a permit is required by

18 this ((P4uffA4n#)) Code without first having obtained ((stieh)) the permit, shall upon subsequent

19 application for ((sw4)) the permit p,~iy
double the fee fixed by the ((above)) schedule of fees for

2 0
1

((sueh)) the work in subsections A'v and B of this section unless it ((sha4l be)) is proved to the

2 1
1

satisfaction of the Administrative Authority that ((sueh)) the work was urgently necessary and

22 that it was not practical to obItain a permit ((pfier- te)) before the commencement of the work. In

23 all such emergency cases, a" permit shall be obtained as soon as it is practical to do so, and if there

24 is an unreasonable delay,"in obtaining the permit, a double fee shall be charged as

2 5
1

provided in this ((seeton)) Code.

26 E. A rein'spection fee of Forty Dollars ($40) may be assessed for each inspection or

2 7
1

reinspection ((whe~ sueh)) jLflLe portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or
I

28 ((when)) if correctLibris called for are not made. This subsection
((i-s,)) ~Loes not ((ta be inteFffeted

29 require inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with

3 0
1

((the fequifements- ~ot)) this Code, but as ((diseoufagiiig)) controllin the practice of calling for

Page 20 of 21



2

4

reinspeetion the
appli-r-Affint.

sha-11 ffile an application ther-efo )) Requests for reinspection shal-I be

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

inspection or reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed ((whefi)) if the permit is not properly posted on the

work site, the work to be inspected is not under test, for failure to provide access on the date for

which inspection is requested((T)) or for failure to make required corrections. ((To obtain a

made in writing upon ((a)) forms furnished for that purpose, and ((piay)) shall be acc~M,'anied b

the reinspection fee in accordance with this section. ((In instaneas wher-e)) Lf rems'pection fees

have been assessed, ((no)) additional inspection of the work ((wiI4)) shall nov6e performed until

the required fees have been paid,

SECTION 48. Section 22.504.020 of the Seattle MunicipaL,,Code is amended to read as

follows:

22.504.020 Refund of fees.

((Shou4d)) Lf the work for which a permit fee has been paid is not ((be)) started, the

Administrative authority, upon proper application for y fund and surrender of the permit for

cancellation, shall issue a refund, In determining th amount of refund due, the Administrative

Authority shall deduct the amount of the basic fee to cover the cost of administration of the

permit. ((N-&amp;)) A refund shall not be made for an((y)) expired permit.

Passed by the City Council the

19
1

and signed by me in open session in aut hientication of its passage this day of

20
1

,
1999.

21

President of the City Council

Approved by me this day of

Paul Schell, Mayor

Page 21 of 21

1999.



TIME ANF ATE STAMP

SPONSORSHIP

THE ATTACHED DOCUMENT IS SPONSORED FOR FILING WITH THE CITY COUNCIL BY
THE MEMBER(S) OF THE CITY COUNCIL WHOSE SIGNATUREJSI ARE SHOWN BELOW:

FOR CITY COUNCIL PRESIDENT USE ONLY

COMMITTEE(S) REFERRED TO:

PRE&amp;DENT'S, SIGNATURE



STATE OF WASHINGTON - KING COUNTY
I
1. 13057

'Gity of Seattle-, C
_ss.

Affidavit of Publication

The undersigned, on oath states that he is an

authorized representative of The Daily Journal of Commerce, a

daily newspaper, which newspaper is a legal newspaper of general

circulation and it is now and has been for more than six months

prior to the date of publication hereinafter referred to, published in

the English language continuously as a daily newspaper in Seattle,

King County, Washington, and it is now and during all of said time

was printed in an office maintained at the aforesaid place of

publication of this newspaper. The Daily Journal of Commerce

was on the 12th day of June, 1941, approved as a legal newspaper

by the Superior Court of King County.

The notice in the exact form annexed, was published in regular

issues of The Daily Journal of Commerce, which was regularly

distributed to its subscribers during the below stated period. The

annexed notice, a

-119774 ORD IN L9

Subsc~Nd and sw,op to before me

/ 21 /99

Notary Public for the State of Washington,
residing in Seattle

was published on

12 / 2 1 / 99

Affidavit of Publication



iol) of j, f~!VvIbinet &amp;ajnage Sys,=
haclgt ;5ny po',,cqujr~ a,

tl,vs Cod~ in r on 0 ~xi~Ang
bk~,iidip,

W:thWv in cf,"'t ((riol"

gulaz-,4 by tOiW kmc

to CWr--v, A
-

amen&amp;A 4

ML4.l.3

ntini~trati-ve Atuhm!Y to

Oul$ ~p -qcp-ui6cd by the Ad be in fact

pi

lot when Web WOi

r 2 jIUi5*

I

Kk(C ((~W4)) 91 a

j .appenAic,
Maeni the

hc
sareirjtcmde, to s ppl,

codt,)~,,d ~11311 110., b, ~nous;&amp;tto !~Att
of t1his Codc

g Cod
of the 1997,

Unilorui P~umbinf

ti~e T,~q;

W1,63 Add i6ua,~ Aitterp"ns or RqA rs,

ith;l

i~ tht"Wition,
alteration or f"ir conroms t

of this Cod t4rnionte
withali thcjmvism

fails to

or z

vo

occurancy.

~VCTIQN

;allu,

m~A

rmw

Htsviate,3 nuisarim rx my
a

wt

IXTION M S

ngpnd

of tbi,

~(w

~odt~

f5t;

~mvo,~;.,-Vvjnofions

SFCTWN 12, Sect

-shall insto!l si3t:

!C jun

~vhert any such p1,3mbing
Or dtain

itary or o'er

ovision of this

oado.

k was in$411,d and

W enac-, w life"P401th or prej*Ttv.

Lmlez 04wm6t,)) adopt"Id %5

ePl

involve hCalth
"hich ~(nt"

4 of the M7 Llnifonn Plumbing Code is amtnd44

ptumbingnymm

building or

Acz 5MI comply io all YeTiizcmmts Lf this may be Vph

All platfibi-ing systm~,

m ~02.1 of thz 19,97

AN' CRP11 NIANIC-I~ c.t,ff~lug to qA g~~Zk, T,,Umbitt~,Codt, rvpza~jnr, S"W'dc

cl~.,~d~~~s~.............~-,2~.~.~"%,O~3 "d Ordiwcz 1 1,5~94,

and Pori'

2 through ll)-l 3,
'

14, Appto~i-lzs A, B, C, aM
ach ."d I I

PluMbing, Co&amp; M,7 Edition;
torts:

7-90, S-95,
w,04

0&amp; Shall be demod 10

)rauy
other -ork M9,00t0d bY

m3imained

r"emtri"OhrV

c6on of tb, 1
"7 Unfform CcAe ~

mlteri~ijs and Vpurt:

NairetrocM

s",Rb~

y wtommp

tu

3ts
Olan

am

City.of Seattle

ded.~~5

or s2fety hazard5, litt

hicbarcapartof

JM,5.4 Chz"ges

wit OndewAng a f-,han Op, (f
mc,,Ipancy, as defined in the ftild

Mo to the new ((w~e

emed z

ammb-Mh
191.5.5 Mttlntma

md all prIs thc1tof shall be Maintained inpmvff opmfing&lt;ovdition-
All

&amp;.Vic-r.s ,~r 6fr--Su&amp;,

I

ds rcquirc,4 by Otis Codt shall be mainmined in conf,~mance withOe Code

e
To det~rmitle MPRU~CO VIj

~hzffl be responsibI
fmjj~m ceof plumtOg gystems,

th I his

ystem
to be (~m" mpoettd'~

,,ub5,n,i:an, lhc Aflmini qali~t Aulhotity "y cttmt any plumbing s

ing Code is amvOed as
fb;-;3 Pium-,

~f

a

on

sumicetbv mail:

fy

follows

P:

q:UU

opvt

follows

sng~,

idtow, such nom

102.2.6 Li4VAky SICim. ~C-

dov s so 1,

IYAIII

wuiaaw

fc, health, propen,

te. The order shO fix o

Ap~ .. ..........

JiD"w

W

addmot l~ MOO

z

SECtIM4 16, Section 102.2 5ol`N:

Authvvlq to ((Q~

Whzmpver the AdminrAra(i v.0 AuOlfmil'v moftains tbat OnY Plombing Vstmor PortiOn tlWtof,

nr has bmc s3rsua

mpf9ed by this Codejhxs becomv: hzz

Administro
,

iivn,~utboritysbaflozde

V,%m such plimahing t;ysttm,,s
to be discommted, written rroike- shall be, given. In c2ses

immoirac dow 1, He ormuftm-~~

Writing the toth plurrtbing
e~Ahrrb, rerpovtd or

6mbje firne limij

qQC$Ub J*OnMViOn ~(tv~Y) LQ be ra-W

mediately
w

KCTIONV.

.. ..........

tWo

3TO t

:N WIL

Ul

Mo(

pas


