AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; repealing
Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.502.015 and Ordinance 116594; adding new
Section 22.502.016; adopting Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, Appendices A, B, C,
and L and portions of Chapters 1 and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997
Edition; adopting TAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-95, 7-
90, 8-95, 9-95, 12-93, 13-91, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendix 1
of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; adopting Chapter 13 of the
Uniform Mechanical Code; amending the adopted Uniform Plumbing Code by
amending and adding new sections to Chapter 1 Administration, amending
Chapter 2 Definitions, smending Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribution, and
amending Chapter 11 Storm Drainage; amending the fee for appealing to the
Plumbing ‘Board of Appeals; and amending Seattle Municipal Code Section
22.504.010.A governing permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-







19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

November 18, 1999

v.2

ORDINANCE 3 9; q{? ? L}f

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; repealing Seattle
Municipal Code Section 22.502.015 and Ordinance 116594; adding new Section
22.502.016; adopting Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, Appendices A, B, C, and L
and portions of Chapters 1 and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition;
adopting IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-95, 7-90, 8-95,
9-95, 12-93, 13-91, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendix I of the
Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; adopting Chapter 13 of the Uniform
Mechanical Code; amending the adopted Uniform Plumbing Code by amending
and adding new sections to Chapter 1 Administration, amending Chapter 2
Definitions, amending Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribution, and amending
Chapter 11 Storm Drainage; amending the fee for appealing to the Plumbing
Board of Appeals; and amending Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.504.010.A
governing permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-connection control
equipment.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Section 22.502.015 of the Seattle Municipal Code and Ordinancc 116594

are hereby repealed.

SECTION 2. A new Section 22.502.016 is added to the Seattle Municipal Code to read

as follows:

22.502.016 Adoption of Uniform Plumbing Code, IAPMO Installation Standards

and Seattle Amendments.

by this ordinance; Chapters 2 and 6 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended by
this Ordinance; Chapters 3 through 5, 7 through 10, 13, 14, and Appendices A, B, C, and L of the

Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-

The following are hereby adopted and by this reference made a part of this subtitle:

Portions of Chapters 1 and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended

Page 1 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; all as published by the International Association of
Plumbing Officials (one copy of which has been filed with the City Clerk in C.F. 30383 7);
and Chapter 13 of the 1997 Uniform Mechanical Code as adopted by Ordinance 119080;
together with the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted by
Ordinance , shall constitute the official Plumbing Code of the City of Seattle and
hereinafter be referred té as "the code" or "this code.” In case of conflict between the Uniform
Plumbing Code, the IAPMO Installation Standards and the Seattle Amendments, the Seattle
Amendments shall be controlling,

SECTION 3. The following sections of Chapter 1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997
Edition are hereby adopted and by fhis reference are made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of
the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 161.3, 101.4,101.4.1,101.4.1.1,
101.4.1.1.2,101.4.1.1.3,101.4.1.2, 101.4.2, 101.5, 101.5.3, 101.5.6, 102.0, 102.2, 102.2.4, 102.3,
103.0,103.1, 103.1.1, 103.1.2, 103.1.2.1, 103.1.2.2, 103.2, 103.2.1, 103.2.1.1, 103.2.1.2,
103.2.1.3, 103.2.1.4,103.2.1.5, 103.2.3, 103.3, 103.3.1, 103.3.5, 103.5, 103.5.1.1, 103.5.1.2,
103.5.1.4,103.5.2, 103.5.3, 103.5.3.5, 103.5.4, 103.5.4.1, 103.5.4.2, 103.5.5, 103.5.5.2, 103.7,
103.7.1, 103.8, 103.8.1, and 103.8.2. |

SECTION 4. The following sections of Chapter 1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997
Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter I,
Administration, of the Seattle Arhendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 101.4.1.1.1,
101.4.1.3,101.4.3, 101.5.1, 101.5.2, 101.5.4, 101.5.5, 102.1, 102.2.1, 102.2.2, 102.2.3, 102.2.5,
102.2.6, 102.3.1, 102.3.2, 103.1.3, 103.2.1.6, 103.2.2, 103.3.3, 103.5.1, 103.5.1.3, 103.5.5.1,
103.5.6, 103.5.6.1, 103.5.6.2, and 103.5.6.3.

SECTION 5. Section 101.4.1.1.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

Page 2 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2 '

follows:

101.4.1.1.1 In existing buildings or premises in which plumbing installations are to be
altered, repaired, or renovated, deviations from the provision of this Code are permitted,
provided such deviations are found by the Administrative Authority to be necessary as alternate

methods or materials in accordance with the standards in Section 301.2 of this Code, and are first

approvgd by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 6. Section 101.4.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.4.1.3 Existing Construction. No provision of this Code shall be deemed to
require a change in any portion of a plumbing or drainage system or any other work régulated by
this Code in or on an existing building or lot when such work was installed and is maintained in

accordance with law in effect ((prior-to-the-effective-date-of-this-Cede)) at the time the system

was instailed or the work completed, except when any such plumbing or drainage system or other

work regulated by this Code is determined by the Administrative Authority to be in faét
dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or a nuisance ((and)) or a menace to life, health or property.

SECTION 7. Section 101.4.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.4.3 The provisions in the appendices are intended to supplement the requirements of
this Code and shall not be considered part of this Code unless ((fermatly)) adopted as such by
ordinance.

SECTION 8. Section 101.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.5.1 Additions, Alterations or Repairs. Additions, alterations or repairs may be

Page 3 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

made to any plumbing system without requiring the existing plumbing system to comply with all
the requirements of this Code, provided the addition, alteration or repair conforms to that
required for a new plumbing system. Additions, alterations or repairs shall not cause or allow an
existing system to becorﬁe unsafe, insanitary or overloaded.

SECTION 9. Section 101.5.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.5.2 Health and Safety. Whenever the Administrative Authority determines that
compliance with all the provisions of this Code fails to eliminate or alleviate a nuisance, or any
other dangerous or insanitary conditions which ((sey)) involve health or safety Hazards, the
owner or the éwner’s agent shall install such additional plumbing and drainage facilities or shall
make such repairs or alterations as may be ordered by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 10. Section 101.5.4 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
followé:

101.5.4 Changes in Building Occupancy. Plumbing systems, which are a part of any
building or structure undergoing a change in ((use-e¥)) occupancy, as defined in the Building
Code, shall comply to all requirements of this Code, which may be applicable to the new ((use
8F)) occupancy.

SECTION 11. Section 101.5.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

- follows:

101.5.5 Maintenance. All plumbing systems, materials and appurtenances, both
existing and new, and all parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operating condition. All
devices or safegnards required by this Code shall be maintained in conformance with the Code

((edition-underwhiek)) in effect when installed. The owner or the owner’s designated agent

Page 4 of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

23

P T

November 18, 1999
v.2

shall be responsible for maintenance of plumbing systems. To determine compliance with this
subsection, the Administrative Authority may cause any plumbing system to be ((reinspeeted))
inspected.

SECTION 12. Section 102.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:
102.1 Administrative Authority. The Administrative Authority ((shal-be-the

Authority-duly-appointed-to-enforee-this-Code)) is the director of the Seattle-King County

Department of Public Health or the director's authorized representative, who shall administer and

enforce the provisions of the plumbing and mechanical code (Chapter 13 of the 1997 Uniform

Mechanical Code) as adopted or amended except as provided in this Code:; provided, that the

Director of Seattle Public Utilities or his or her authorized representative shall administer and

enforce provisions relating to the inspection and approval of water meters and, where applicable.

building supply piping.

SECTION 13. Section 102.2.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.1 The Administrative Authority may ((appeint-such-assistants;-deputies;

this-Cede:)) adopt such administrative rules and regulations consistent with this Code as shail be

deemed necessary for its administration and enforcement.
SECTION 14. Section 102.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.2 Right of Entry. ((Wheneveritis-neeessary-to-make-an-inspeetion-to-enforee

Page 5 0f 21




10

11

12

i3

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

e

ofinspeetion-and-examination-pursuant-te-this-Cede:)) Upon presentation of proper credentials,

the Administrative Authority may, with the consent of the occupant or with the consent of the
owner of an unoccupied building or premises. or in accordance with a lawfully issued search
warrant, enter at reasonable times a building or premises to perform a duty imposed upon the

Administrative Authority by this Code. provided that the Administrative Authority shall make

entry only if such entry is consistent with the constitutions and laws of the United States and the
State of Washington.

SECTION 15. Section 102.2.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

102.2.3 Stop ((Orders)) Work Notice and Correction Notice.

Page 6 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

A, Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, the
Administrative Authority may order the work stopped by notice in writing served on the property

owner and/oron any persons ((engagedin)) doing or causing such work to be done, and any such

persons shall ((forthwith)) immediately stop work until authorized by the Administrative

Authority to proceed with the work. Service of a stop work order shall be made by one or more

of the following methods:

Personal service: Personal service of a stop work order may be made on the property

owner and/or on anv person doing or causing the work to be done, or by leaving the stop work

order at the house of usual abode of the person being served. provided that the stop work order is

left with a person of suitable age and discretion who resides there.

Service by posting on the property: Service directed to the property owner and/or

person doing or causing such work to be done may be made by posting the stop work order in a

conspicuous place on the property where the work is occurring, and concurrently mailing notice

as provided for below, if a mailing address is available.

Service bv mail: Service bv mail may be made for a stop work order by mailing two

copies, postage prepaid. one by ordinary first class mail and the other by certified mail, to the

property owner and/or to any person doing or causing such work to be done, at the last known

address of the person being served. at the address of the location of the work being done, or at the

address of the place of business of the person being served. The taxpayer’s address as shown on

the tax records of the county shall be deemed to be the proper address for the purpose of mailing

such notice to the person being served. Service by mail shall be presumed effective upon the

third business day after the day upon which the stop work order was placed in the mail.

B. Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code. the

Page 7 of 21




(98]

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

November 18, 1999
v.2

administrative authority may order the violations corrected without ordering all work stopped by

| issuing a correction notice that identifies the viglation. The correction notice may require

reinspection before further construction or at the time of the next required inspection. The

correction notice shall be served or posted in the same manner as a stop work order.

C. These remedies are in addition to those authorized elsewhere in the Code.

SECTION 16. Section 102.2.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.5 Authority to ((Geaéemn)) Correct Hazardous or Insanitary Plumbing.
Whenever the Administrative Authority ascertains that any plumbing system or portion thereof,
regulated by this Code, has become hazardous to life, health, property, or has become insanitary,
the Administrative Authority shall order in writing that such plumbing either be removed or
placed in a safe or sanitary condition, as appropriate. The order shall fix a reasonable time limit
for compliance. No person shall use or maintain defective plumbing after receiving such notice.

When such plumbing system is to be disconnected, written notice shall be given. In cases
((e$)) in_ which the Administrative Authority has determined that immediate danger to life or

property_exists, the Administrative Authority may cause such disconnection ((meay)) to be made

immediately without such notice.

SECTION 17. Section 102.2.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.6 Liability claims. ((Fhe-Administrative-Authority-charged-with-the

Page 8 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

proeeedings:-)) This Code is enacted as an exercise of the police power of the Citv of Seattle to

protect and preserve the public peace, health. safety and welfare, and its provisions shall be

liberally construed for the accomplishment of these purposes. It is expressly the purpose of this

Code to provide for and promote the health. safety and welfare of the general public. and not to

create or otherwise establish or designate any particular class or group of persons who will or

should be especially protected or benefitted by the terms of this Code.

1t is the specific intent of this Code to place the obligation of complying with its
requirements upon the owner or occupier of premises within this code's scope, and no provision
nor term used in this Code is intended fo impose any duty whatsoever upon the Administrative

Authority or any of the administrative authority's officers or emplovees, for whom the

implementation or enforcement of this Code shall be discretionary and not mandatory,

Nothing in this Code creates or forms the basis for any liability on the part of the
Administrative Authority, or the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents, for

any injury or damage resulting from the failure of the owner or occupier of premises to comply

with the provisions of this Code, or by reason or in consequence of anv act or omission in

connection with the implementation or enforcement of this Code on the part of the

Administrative Authority by the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents.

Anv claim and/or litigation arising from any conduct, acts or omissions of the

Administrative Authority, or any of the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents,

shall be subject to the provisions of Seattle Municipal Code Chapter 4.64. as amended.

Page 9 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

i6

17

18

i9

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

SECTION 18. Section 102.3.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

102.3.1 Violations. [t shall be unlawful for any person, firm, ((e¥)) corporation or other
entity to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip,
use, or maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this Code.

SECTION 19. Section 102.3.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

102.3.2 Penalties. Any person, firm, ({ef)) corporation or other entity violating any
provision of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof,
shall be punishable by a fine and/or imprisonment set forth by the ((geverninglaws-ofthe
yurisdietion)) Seattle Criminal Code or by state law. Each separate day or any portion thereof,
during which any violation of this Code occurs or continues, shall be deemed to constitute a
separate offense.

SECTION 20. Section 103.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.1.3 Licensing. It shall be the obligation of every person who enters into contracts

for the installation or repair of plumbing systems ((eovered-by-this-codefor-which-a-pepmitis

required)) for which this Code requires a permit, to comply with all applicable State or local rules

and regulations concerning licensing, ((vhieh-th

SECTION 21. Section 103.2.1.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.2.1.6 Give such other data and information relevant to the proposed work as may be

required by the Administrative Authority.

Page 10 of 21




10

i1

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

SECTION 22. Section 103.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.2.2 Plans and Specifications. Plans, engineering calculations, diagrams and other
data shall be submitted in one or more sets with each application for a permit. The
Administrative Authority may require plans, computations and specifications to be prepared by
and the plumbing designed by an engineer and/or architect licensed by the state to practice as
such.

Exception: The Administrative Authority may waive the submission of plans,
calculations or other data if the Administrative Authority finds that the nature of the work
applied for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary to ((ebtain)) determi'ne compliance
within the Code.

SECTION 23. New section 103.3.1.1 concerning owners' permits is adopted to read as
follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle
Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

103.3.1.1 Owner's Permit. A bona fide owner may install, alter, or repair plumbing in

his or her own building, provided:

1. The installation. alteration. or repair work is not undertaken with the intention and

for the purpose of selling the property improved by such work:

2. The owner applies in person for an owner’s permit for the work to be done, and

pays the permit fee according to the fee schedule in this code;

3. The owner obtains an owner’s permit before commencing the installation,

alteration, or repair work:

4. The installation, alteration. or repair work is performed exclusively by the owner

Page 11 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

N A,

November 18, 1999
v.2

and not by any other person, including a plumbing confractor; and

5. The installation, alteration. or repair work is performed in the manner required by

this code subject to inspection and approval by the administrative authority.

SECTION 24. Section 103.3.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.3.3 Validity of Permit. The issuance of a permit or approval of plans and
specifications shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of
the provisions of this Code or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction. No permit presuming to
give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code shall be valid.

The issuance of a permit based upon plans, specifications or other data shall not prevent
thé Administrative Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errors contained in said
plans, spéciﬁcations and other data or from preventing building operations being carried on
thereunder when in violation of this Code or of other ordinances of this jurisdicﬁon.

A person to whom a permif has been issued shall not allow another person to do or cause

to be done any work under such permit except persons in the employ of the permittee.

Every plumbing permit shall be posted on the building, structure or premises where the

work permitted is being performed and shall not be removed until the work has been finally
approved by the Administrative Authority.

Every permit issued by the administrative authority under the provisions of this code shall
expire by limitation and become null and void one vear from date of issue. Permits expired for
not more than one year may be renewed for one-half the original cost or fifty dollars. whichever
1s less. Permits expired for more than one year require the regular scheduled fees.

Plumbing work authorized by a permit in effect on the effective date of this code shall be

Page 12 of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

performed in accordance with the laws and ordinances in effect when the permit was issued,

except when the administrative authority determines the work to be in fact dangerous, unsafe,

insanitary. or a nuisance or a menace to life, health or property.

SECTION 25. Section_ 103.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.1 General. All plumbing systems for which a permit is required by this Code
shall be inspected by the Administrative Authority. No portion of any plumbing system shall be

covered or otherwise concealed until inspected and approved. Neither the Administrative

Authority nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement
of material required to permit inspection. When the installation of a plumbing system is
complete, an additional and final inspection shall be made.

SECTION 26. Section 103.5.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

~ follows:

103.5.1.3 Covering or Using. No plumbing or drainage system, building sewer,
private sewer disposal system or part thereof, shall be covered, concealed, or put into use until it
has been tested, inspected, and (‘(aeeepfeé)) approved as prescribed in this Code.

SECTION 27. Section 103.5.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.5.1 Defective Systems. An air test shall be used in testing the sanitary condition
of the drainage or plumbing system of any building premises when there is reason to believe that
it has become defective. In buildings or premises condemned by the ((preper)) Administrative
Authority because of an insanitary condition of the plumbing system or part thereof, the

((atterations-m)) corrections to such system shall conform to the requirements of this Code.

Page 13 of 21




10
11
| 12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

SECTION 28. Section 103.5.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.6 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection when ((sueh-pertion)) part or all of the work for which inspection is called is not
complete or when required corrections have not been made.

This provision is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is
rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as controlling the practice
of calling for inspections before the job is ready for inspection or reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the approved plans are not readily available to
the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which the inspection is requested, or

for deviating from plans ({(requirtng-the-appreval-ef)) when the deviation requires approval but

has not been approved by the Administrative Authority.

To obtain reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefor in writing upon a
form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with ((Fable+-1))

Chanter 22.504 of this Code.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the
work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

SECTION 29. Section 103.5.6.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.6.1 Corrections. Notices of correction or violation shall be ((3witten)) issued by
the Administrative Authority and may be posted at the site of the work or mailed or delivered to
the permittee or his authorized representative. Refusal, failure, or neglect to comply with any

such notice or order within ten days of receipt thereof, shall be considered a violation of this

Page 14 of 21




|

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
a7
18
i9
20
21
22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

Code, and shall be subject to the ((penaities)) remedies for violations as set forth elsewhere in
this Code, ((ferviolations:))

SECTION 30. Section 103.5.6.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.6.2 Retésting. If the Administrative Authority finds that the work ((w#)) does

not pass ((the)) any required test or inspection, necessary cotrections shall be made and the work

shall then be resubmitted for test or inspection.

SECTION 31. Section 103.5.6.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code 1s amended as
follows: |

103.5.6.3 Approval. Upon the satisfactory completion and final test of the plumbing
system, a certificate of approval shall be issued by the Administrative Authority to the permittee,
((en-demand:))

SECTION 32. New sections 104.0, 104.1, 104.1.1 and 104.1.2 concerning the
Plumbing Board of Appeals, and 105.0, 105.1, 105.1.1, 105.1.2, 105.1.3, and 105.1.4 concerning
Heéring Examiner appeals, are adopted to read as follows and by this reference are made a part
of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

104.0 Board of Appeals

A Board of Appeals shall be established and shall consist of Six voting members, with

one member representing journeyman plumbers, plumbing contractors, professional mechanical

engineers, and building owners and two members representing the public. The Administrative

Authority shall serve as a nonvoting member of the Board. The Board of Appeals shall elect a

chair and a secretary who shall serve at the pleasure of the Board.

104.1 Any party aggrieved by a decision of the Administrative Authority made in

Page 15 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

ib

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

accordance with this Code either in the context of a specific projiect or permit application or in

the context of an application for approval of an alternate material or method of construction, or
both, may file a written petition for appeal to the Board, accompanied by a nonrefundable fee of

one hundred dollars. Appeals shall be heard at reasonable times at the convenience of the Board,

but not later than thirty days after receipt of the petition. However, this time requirement may be

waived by written agreement between the Administrative Authority and the appellant if doing so

will facilitate resolution of the dispute. The appellant shall be entitled to appear in person before

the Board, to be represented by an attorney, ‘and to introduce evidence in support of such petition.

The appellant shall cause to be made at the appellant's own expense any test or research required

bv the Board for the substantiation of any claim or claims made by the appellant. The Board of

Appeals shall determine whether a correct interpretation of this Code has been made by the

Administrative Authority.

104.1.1 Decisions of the Board shall be in writing; shall be distributed to the

Administrative Authority and the appellant; and shall apply only to the case being heard. Board

decisions are deemed issued on the date that the decision is delivered to the appellant or the

appellant's counsel or, if the decision is mailed. on the date of mailing. Any person aggrieved by

a decision of the Board may appeal the decision of the Board to the Hearing Examiner as

provided in Sections 105.0 through 105.1.4 of this chapter.

104.1.2 The Board may make recommendations to the Administrative Authority for

changes in the Code.

105.0 Hearing Examiner Appeals.
105.1 Filing of Appeals. Appeals shall be filed with the City of Seattle Hearing
Examiner by five p.m. (5:00 p.m.) of the tenth (10™) calendar day following the date the decision

Page 16 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

of the Board is issued pursuant to Section 104.1.1. When the last dav of the appeal period so

computed is Saturday, Sunday or city holiday. the period shall run until five p.m. (5:00 p.m.) on

the next business day. An appeal shall be considered filed with the Hearing Examiner when it

delivered to the Hearing Examiner’s office or. if the appeal is sent via US mail or a private mail

service, when it is received by the Examiner. The Examiner’s date stamp shall be placed on

incoming appeals and there is a rebuttable presumption that the date and time stamped is the date

and time of filing. The appeal shall be in writing and shall state specifically why the appeliant

believes the decision of the Board to be incorrect and what relief is sought. The appeal shall be

accompanied by payment of the filling fee as set forth in SMC Section 3.02, 125, Hearing

Examiner Filing Fees. including any amendments or revisions thereto.

105.1.1 Parties of Record. The parties to the appeal shall be the appellant and the

Administrative Authority.

105.1.2 Notice of Hearing. Notice of the hearing on the appeal shall be mailed Twenty

(20) days prior to the scheduled hearing date to the parties of record.

105.1.3 _Scope and Standard of Review. The hearing shall be de novo. The Board’s

decision shall be given substantial weight by the Hearing Examiner and the burden shall be on

appellant to prove that the Board’s decision is clearly erroneous.

105.1.4 Hearing Examiner’s Decision. The Hearing Examiner shall issue a decision

in writing within fifteen days after the close of the hearing and mail that decision to all parties of

record. The decision shall contain written findings and conclusions. The Hearing Examiner’s

decision shall be final and conclusive and the parties of record shall be bound by the terms and

conditions of the decision unless within twenty-one days from the date of issuance of the

decision appellant makes application to King County Superior Court for a Land Use Petition

Page 17 of 21




aad

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

i8

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

pursuant to RCW 36.70C.

i,

SECTION 33. Section 206.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended to add a

new definition as follows:

206.0 --D--

® %k

Domestic Water Heater — A domestic water heater is a tank with a self-contained

heating unit which stores potable hot water for residential or commercial use with a nominal

water containing capacity of one-hundred twenty gallons or less, having a heating input of two-

- hundred thousand BTUs per hour or less used for hot water supply at pressures of one-hundred

sixty pounds per square inch or less and at operating temperatures of two-hundred ten degrees

Fahrenheit or less.

% 3k sk

SECTION 34. Section 214.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

214.0 --L--

%ok

Listing Agency — An agency accepted by the Administrative Authority which is in the

business of listing or labeling and which maintains a periodic inspection program on current

production of listed models, and which makes available a published report of such listing in

which specific information is included that the product has been tested to approved standards and

found safe for use in a specific manner. Listing Agencies approved by the Administrative

Authority are as follows: International Association of plumbing and Mechanical Officials

Page 18 of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17

19
20
21
22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

Foundation (N.S.F.); City of Los Angeles Testing Laboratory; American Gas Association;
Canadian Gas Association; Canadian Standards Association; and Underwriters Laboratories.

Listing agencies or testing laboratories are not limited to the agencies named in this section.

Other testing or listing agencies may be added to the approved list as the administrative authority

deems necessary.

% 3k %k

SECTION 35. Section 218.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amendéd as
follows:

218.0 --P--

* ok

Plumbing System — Includes all potable water building supply and distribution pipes, all
plumbing fixtures and traps, all drainage and vent pipe(s), and all building drains and building
sewers, including their respective joints and connection, devices, receptors, and appurtenances
within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable water piping, potable water
treating or using equipment, medical gas and medical vacuum systems, fuel gas piping, water

heaters ((and-ventsfor-same)) and rainwater leaders. However, certification is not required for

the installation of a plumbing system within the property lines and outside the building.

S O
Public or Public Use — All buildings or structures that are not defined as private or
private use.

(1) General Use applies to business. commercial, industrial and assembly
occupancies other than those defined under heavy use. Included are the public and common

areas in hotels, motels and multidwelling buildings.

Page 19 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

(2) Heavv Use assembly applies to toilet facilities in occupancies which place a

heavy. but intermittent time-based demand on the water supply system, such as schools,
auditoriums, stadiums, race courses, transportation terminals, theaters and similar occupancies

where queuing is likely to occur during periods of peak use.

L O

SECTION 36. Section 604.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

604.1 Water pipe and fittings shall be of brass, copper, cast iron, ((gaivanized-matleable
i—l‘@ﬁ;—)) galvanized wrought iron, ((gelvanized-steel-)) or other approved materials. Cast iron
fittings used for water need not be galvanized if over tWo () inches (51mm) in size.
Asbestos-cement, CPVC, PE, or PVC water pipe manufactured to recognized standards may be
used for cold water distribution systems outside a building. CPVC water pipé and tubing may be
used for hot and cold water distribution systems within a building. All materials used in the
water supply system, except vaives and similar devices shall be of a like material, except where
otherwise approved by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 37. Section 604.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a weight of not less than Type L.

Exception: Type M copper tubing may be used for water piping when piping is above
ground in, or on, a building, ((erundersround-outside-of straetures:))

SECTION 38. New section 803.1 concerning parking garage drainage systems is
adopted to read as follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 8, Indirect Wastes, of

the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

Page 20 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

803.1 Parking Garage Drainage Systems. All floor drainage under the roof of a

parking garage shall be connected to the sanitary drainage system. When the top floor of the

building is used as a roof as well as a parking area, the drainage from the roof shall be connected

to the storm drainage system. Drainage from conventional plumbing fixtures shall not be inter-

connected with the floor drainage system. However, drainage lines from car or truck washing
equipment may be connected to the floor drainage system through an approved interceptor.

Floor drainage waste lines shall be a minimum of three inches in size. Waste unit loadings for

three-inch or larger size floor drainage piping shall be sized in accordance with table 7-5 of this

code. Floor draing or floor drain openings shall be equipped with approved strainers and need

not be trapped when connected to the building drain through a properly trapped and vented

interceptor.  Traps shall not be used when the floor drains are located in areas exposed to

freezing temperatures. The waste line from floor drains entering an interceptor shall be above

the waste line discharging from the interceptor to the building drain. The sand interceptor

receiving the floor drains shall have a water seal of not less than six inches. Floor drain traps

need not be Vented individually if line venting is used throtigh an approved indirect waste system

with a properly trapped and vented interceptor. A line vent for floor drains shall terminate

through the roof or to an approved location in the outside atmosphere. When using line venting
the terminating vents, if more than one, shall be equal in cross sectional area to the size of the
waste line entering the interceptor or the line vent may continue full size from the interceptor to

the point of termination. All plans for parking garage floor drainage systems shall be submitted

to the administrative authority prior to installation for approval.
SECTION 39. The following sections of Chapter 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code,

1997 Edition, are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11, Storm

Page 21 of 21




10

11

i2

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2 '

Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.4, 1101.11,
1101.11.2, 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.11.2.3, 1101.11.2.4, 1101.11.3, 1103.0, 1103.1,
1103.3,1104.0, 1104.1, 1105.0, 1105.1, 1105.1.2, 1105.2, 1105.3, 1105.4, 1105.4.1, 1105.4.2,
1106.1, 1106.2, 1106.4, 1109.0, 1109.1, 1109.2, 1109.2.1, and 1109.2.3, and Table 11-2.

SECTION 40. The following sections of Chapter 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code
1997 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11,
Storm Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.3,
1101.11.1, 1104.3,1105.1.1, 1109.2.2, and Table 11-1.

SECTION 41. Section 1101.3 of thé 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

1101.3 Material Uses. Rainwater piping placed within the interior of a building or run
within a vent or shaft shall be of cast iron, galvanized steel, wrought iron, brass, copper, lead,

Schedule 40 ABS DWYV, Schedule 40 PVC DWYV, or other approved materials, and changes in

direction shall conform to the requirements of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997 Edition.

SECTION 42. Section 1101.11.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

1101.11.1 Primary Roof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by roof

Page 22 of 21




10

11

12

13

i4

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

~ drains or gutters. The location and sizing of drains and gutters shall be coordinated with the

structural design and pitch of the roof. Unless otherwise required by the Administrative
Authority, roof drains, gutters, vertical conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm drains for
primary drainage shall be sized based on a storm of sixty ((€66})) minutes duration and

((+60))one hundred-year return period (see Appendix D of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997

Edition).

- SECTION 43. Section 1104.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

1104.3 Combining Storm with Sanitary Drainage. The sanitary and storm drainage

system of a building shall be entirely separate, ((-exeept-where-a-combined-seweris-usedin

frem-ary-seh-staels))

SECTION 44. Section 1105.1.1 of the 1997 Uniforma Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:
1105.1.1 Roof drains shall be constructed of materials specified in ((Fable-+4-1)) WAC

51-46-1491 — Table 14-1.

SECTION 45. Section 1109.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

1109.2.2 Air Test. The air test shall be made by attaching an air compressor testing
apparatus to any suitable opening after closing all other inlets and outlets to the system, forcing

air into the system until there is a uniform gage pressure of five ((€5))) psi (34.5 kPa) or

Page 23 of 21




15

16

17
18
/19
20

21

November 18, 1999
v.2

sufficient to balance a column of mercury ten (((+6})) inches (254 mm) in height. This pressure

shall be held without introduction of additional air for a period of at least fifteen (15) minutes.

SECTION 46. Table 11-1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is replaced by the

following:
Table 11-1 — Rainwater Leaders
Roof or Other Area Served Size of Rainwater Leader
(Square Feet) (Inches)
11050 2
1051 — 3150 3
3151 - 6450 4
6451 — 10800 5
10801 — 18000 6
18001 — 35700 8
35701 — 58800 10
58801 — 95400 12

NOTE: Iftable 11-1 does not provide a practical solution for sizing rainwater leaders, refer to
tables 11-1 and 11-2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code for more comprehensive engineering
design information relating to installation of rainwater systems. Use the 2” column maximum
rainfall in inches per hour.

SECTION 47. Section 22.504.010 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to read as
follows:

22.504.010 Permit fees.

((Bvery)) An applicant for a permit to do work under this Plumbing Code shall pay for
each permit, at the time of issuance, a fee in accordance with the following schedule, and at the
rate provided for each classification shown in ({(this)) the schedule:

A Schedule of Fees

Base plumbing permit for one (1) through four (4) fixtures or traps

(other than reduced pressure principle backflow prevention devices or

double check valve assemblies. for which a separate permit shall be

Page 24 0of 21




821

10

11

12

13

14

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

November 18, 1999
v.2

obtained at the rates inthis schedule). . . .. ... oo $75

For each additional plumbing fixture or trap (including water
drainage vent piping and backflow protection therefor) .. .............. 10
For each atmospheric vacuum breaker in irrigation systems, tanks,
vats, etc., or for installation on unprotected plumbing fixtures
including necessary water piping
Vacuum breaker —one (1) to five (5) ~each device .. . ........... 10
Vacuum breaker — over five (§) —eachdevice . .................. 5

Pressure((-type-backfow-preventor)) vacuum breaker —each. ... .. 10

Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention device ((and#))or double

check valve assembly ((—esch—rr++rr—rrrrrrrrrrrrrrrrr————— 10))
Base plumbing permit for one (1) device or assembly. ... .............. 75
Each additional deviceorassembly . .. ......... o0ttt 10
B. Fees for Miscellaneous Inspection Services

Fees for inspection service outside regular working hours or for inspection service
requested but not covered by a permit will be charged for at a rate equal to the
cost of performing the service.

Fees for permanent location inspection of factory housing or modular unit containing
plumbing —

For each single-family dwelling or each
modular unit containing plumbing . .. ... ... S $20
Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extensions,

water service and necessary gas piping connections,

Page 25 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

November 18, 1999
v.2

Additional plumbing fixtures in_stalled after factory installation of
plumbing for each plumbing fixtureortrap . ........... ... ... ... ... 10
Fees for reconnection ad retest of plumbing systems in relocated buildings —
For each building containing plumbing . .. .. ... ... ... . ... L. 20
Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extensions,
water service and necessary gas piping connections.
Additional plumbing fixtures installed after relocation of building
for each plumbing fixtureortrap . .. ...... ... . i 10
C. For the purpose of this section, "fixture" means and includes an((¥)) appliance
((whieh)) that is connected with a water, drain{(s)) or vent pipe, but ((#e)) a sillcock faucet or

hose bibb ((shal-be)) is not considered a fixture. A sanitary plumbing outlet on or to which a

plumbing fixture or appliance may be set or attached ((shat-be-constraed-te-be)) is a fixture.

D. A((m¥)) person who commenced ((amy)) work for which a permit is required by
this ((P&umbmg)) Code without first having obtained ((saeh)) the permit, shall upon subsequent
applicaﬁon for ((sueh)) the permit pay double the fee fixed by the ((abeve)) schedule of fees for

((sweh)) the work in subsections A and B of this section unless it ((shali-be)) is proved to the

satisfaction of the Administrative Authority that ((saeh)) the work was urgently necessary and

that it was not practical to obtain a permit ((prier-te)) before the commencement of the work. In

all such emergency cases, a permit shall be obtained as soon as it is practical to do so, and if
there is an unreascnable delay in obtaining ((sueh)) the permit, a double fee shall be charged as

provided in this ((seetion)) Code.

Page 26 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

November 18, 1999
v.2

E. A reinspection fee of Forty Dollars ($40) may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection ((when-sueh)) if the portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or
{(when)) if corrections called for are not made. This subsection ((is)) does not ((te-be-interpreted
as-requiring)) require inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with
((therequirements-of)) this Code, but as ((diseeuraging)) controlling the practice of calling for
inspection or reinspection. ‘

Reinspection fees may be assessed ((when)) if the permit is not properly posted on the
work site, the work to be inspected is not under test, for failure to provide access on the date for
which inspection is requested((;)) or for failure to make required corrections. ((Fe-obtaina

reinspeetion-the-apphieant-shall-file-an-applieation-therefor)) Requests for reinspection shall be

made in writing upon ((&)) forms furnished for that purpose, and ((pay)) shall be accompanied by

the reinspection fee in accordance with this section. ((f-instanees-where)) If reinspection fees
have been assessed, ((se)) additional inspection of the work ((}1)) shall not be performed until
the required fees have been paid.

SECTION 48. Section 22.504.020 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to read as

follows:

Page 27 of 21




10

5
N

12
13
14
15

16

17
18

November 18, 1999
v.2

22.504.020 Refund of fees.

((Sheuld)) If the work for which a permit fee has been paid is not ((be)) started, the
Administrative authority, upoﬁ proper application for refund and surrender of the permit for
cancellation, shall issue a refund. In determining the amount of refund due, the Administrative
Authority shall deduct the amount of the basic fee to cover the cost of administration of the

permit. ((Ne)) A refund shall not be made for an((¥)) expired permit.

Passed by the City Councilthe 272 29 dayof (Novepiborw , 1999,

and signed by me in open session in authentication of its passage this ’Z,?;.M day of

Nevempen) , 1999,

. “Presi eskﬁfént%\the élty Councﬂ

Approved by me this wa day of \5 4y e Linbg yf‘ , 1999.

Paul Schell‘”Mayor B

g B

Page 28 of 21




, ubﬁc Health

Seattle & King County

HEALTHY PECPLE. HEALTHY COMMUNITIES.

Alonzo L. Plough, Ph.D., MPH, Director
MEMORANDUM

October 14, 1999

TO: Sue Donaldson, President, Seattle City Council

VIA: Elma Borbe, Budget Analyst, Executive Services Department, City of Seattle “
FROM: Alonzo Plough, Ph.D., MPH, Director, Public Health — Seattle & King County il f
RE: Request for Legislative Action — Enactment of Portions of 1997 Uniform Plumbing

Code and Amendments

Please find attached a proposed ordinance amending the Seattle Plumbing Code (SMC Chapter 22.502),
together with form SOP 100-014 (Request for Legislative Action). Also attached is a table summarizing
each of the proposed changes section by section.

Periodically the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO) adopts a new
version of the Uniform Plumbing Code and Standards (UPC). The latest version is the 1997 UPC. In
November 1997, the State Building Code Council repealed the state regulations that had adopted the 1991
UPC, and adopted an amended version of the 1997 UPC, per WSR 98-02-055, and WAC 51-46 and 51-47.
The 1997 UPC, as adopted by the State Building Code Council, is in effect throughout the state except in
those cities and counties that have enacted the new code with their local variations.

Seattle has previously adopted earlier revisions to the UPC. Seattle’s current Plumbing Code, last amended
m 1993, adopted portions of the 1991 UPC. Compared with previous versions, the 1997 UPC contains an
entirely new section-numbering system. We are thus proposing the local adoption of portions of the 1597
UPC, while clarifying and improving upon our current local amendments that were adopted in previous
revisions. We are currently proposing similar legislation in King County.

Resources and program activity will remain the same, with two exceptions. First, Section 32 of the proposed
legislation establishes a $100 fee for bringing an appeal before the Plumbing Board of Appeals. The

- Plumbing Board of Appeals is a six member board that reviews decisions of the local plumbing authority
(i.e., the chief plumbing inspector) concerning applications for approval of alternate materials or methods of
construction. Currently, the appeal fee is $25. The fee increase is needed in order to cover administrative
costs associated with convening meetings of the board and preparing the Board’s written decisions.

The second resource-related change is contained in Section 47 of the proposed legislation. That section
amends the plumbing permit fees for certain types of cross connection control devices known as “reduced
pressure principle backflow prevention devices” and “double check valve assemblies.” Currently, such
devices are treated as any other plumbing fixture, requiring a $75 base permit fee for installing up to four
devices, plus $10 for each additional device. Under the proposed legisiation, cross connection control
devices will require a separate permit at the rate of $75 for installing one device, plus, $10 for each additional
device.

Envirenmental Health
999 3rd Avenue, Suite 700 » Seattle, WA 98104-4039 ﬁf@ City of Seattle )
T (206) 296-4722 (V/TDD) F (206) 296-0189 » www.metrokc.gov/health mﬁ Paul Schell, Mayor - %

Printed on Recycled Paper.

Gy King Coupty 2% i
# Ron Sims, ‘Executive ;’




Sue Donaldson
QOctober 14, 1999
Page 2 of 2

The permit fees would remain unchanged for all other types of plumbing fixture installations. This fee
change is necessary in order to provide funding for the Joint Cross Connection Control Program between the
Health Department and Seattle Public Utilities. This program’s purpose is to implement the state’s cross-
connection control regulations in accordance with Public Law 104-182-the Safe Drinking Water Act
Amendments of 1996 and WAC 246-290-490 (as amended per WSR 99-07-021).

Thank you for your assistance. If you have any questions, our lead staff members for this legisiation are
Dick Andersen, Chief Plumbing Inspector (233-7914) and Roman Welyczko, Environmental Health
Enforcement Coordinator (296-4797). Finally, I wish to extend our appreciation to Assistant City Attorney
Bryan Glynn of the City of Seattle Law Department for providing invaluable editorial assistance in the
preparation of the attached legislation.

RW:dm

Attachments:  Ordinance Amending the Seattle Plumbing Code
Table of Proposed Amendments to the Seattle Plumbing Code
SOP 100-014 Request for Legislative Action

ce: Dick Andersen, Public Health — Seattle & King County
Thomas Castner, Seattle Public Utilities
Bryan Glynn, Seattle Law Department
Maureen Traxler, Department of Construction and Land Use
Roman Welyczko, Public Health — Seattle & King County




SOP 100-014 REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; amending Seattle Municipal
Code Chapter 22.502 to adopt certain portions of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code, to
amend the permit fees for certain types of plumbing cross-connection control equipment,
and to amend the application fee for appealing to the plumbing Board of Appeals.

1. Objective:

The objectives of this proposed ordinance are:

a) To update the Seattle Plumbing Code to reflect updated industry standards
adopted by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials and the Washington State Building Code Council;

b) To amend the fee for bringing an appeal before the plumbing Board of
Appeals, to cover administrative costs of the board's review of proposals for
alternate plumbing methods and materials; and

c) To amend the plumbing permit fees to cover the costs of permit issuance,
inspection, and code enforcement associated with cross-connection control

devices.
2. Dollaf amount requested: N/A
3. Fund source and subsequent balance of that fund source: King County Health
Fund.
4. Commitment:

Revenues are intended to cover (a) plumbing Board of Appeals administrative
costs, and (b) costs of permit issuance, inspection and code enforcement
associated with cross-connection contro} devices.

5. List of new positions and salaries and indication whether positions are permanent:
one permanent Senior Plumbing Inspector.

6. Facilities or equipment required: one leased vehicle

7. Statement of criteria used in program/project evaluation: joint program
evaluation by the Health Department and Seattle Public Utilities.

8. Alternative methods of funding and/or alternative methods of accomplishing the
given program/project: N/A

\Plumbing Code Amdts (Seattle — SOP 100-014) SRS




PLUMBING CODE ORDINANCE

Public Safety, Health, and Technology Committee
November 17, 1999_

Item #4
‘4 Amendments to correct typographical errors:

s Page 5, Line 20: “owner and on” should be changed to “owner and/or on”

o Page 5, Line 25: “owner and on” should be changed to “owner and/or on”

s Page 6, Line 4: “property owner and to any” should be changed to “prop_erty owner
and/or to any”

Sy,



20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

37

38

October 7, 1999

ORDINANCE

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Plumbing Code; repealing Seattle /
Municipal Code Section 22.502.015 and Ordinance 116594; adding new Section
22.502.016; adopting Chapters 2 through 10, 13, 14, Appendices A, B, C, and L
and portions of Chapters I and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition;
adopting JAPMO Installation Standards 2-90; 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-95, 7;:9(), 8-95,
9-95, 12-93, 13-91, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendi);if of the
Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition; adopting Chapter 13 of thg:t"Uniform
Mechanical Code; amending the adopted Uniform Plumbing Code by amending
and adding new sections to Chapter 1 Administration, amendirig Chapter 2
Definitions, amending Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribution, and amending
Chapter 11 Storm Drainage; amending the fee for appeahng to the Plumbing
Board of Appeals; and amending Seattle Municipal Coﬂe Section 22.504.010.A
governing permit fees for certain types of plumbmg ctoss-connection control
equipment. :

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Section 22.502.015 of the Seattle Municipal Code and Ordinance 116594
are hereby repealed.

SECTION 2. A new Section 22592016 is added to the Seattle Municipal Code to read
as follows:

22.502.016 Adoption of U}I{;orm Plumbing Code, IAPMO Installation Standards
and Seattle Amendments.

| The folloWing are hereby adopted and by this reference made a part of this subtitle:

Portions of ‘Chapters(;{{ and 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended
by this ordinance; Chapteigé:‘Z and 6 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997 Edition, as amended by
this Ordinance; Chaptel_ggé through 5, 7 through 10, 13, 14, and Appendices A, B, C, and L of the
Uniform Plumbing Cede 1997 Edition; IAPMO Installation Standards 2-90, 3-93, 4-96, 5-92, 6-

95, 7-90, 8-95, 9—95;1293, 13-91, 17-90, 18-85, 20-96, and 21-89 as set forth in Appendix I of

the Uniform Plumﬁing Code 1997 Edition; all as published by the International ASSOCTAIOTRO .

_with the Seat mendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted by Ordinance

, shgll constitute the official Plumbing Code of the City of Seattle and hereinafter
e referrsd 10 as “the code” or "this code.” In case of conflict between the Uniform Plumbing
Code, the IAPMO Installation Standards and the Seattle Amendments, the Seattle Amendments

shall be controlling.

Page 1 of 21

Ay




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30

o i,

SECTION 3. The following sections of Chapter 1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997
Edition are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 1, Admiﬁfétfation, of
the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 101.3, 101 .4, 101"’;4,1 101.4.1.1,
101.4.1.1.2, 101.4.1.1.3, 101.4.1.2, 101.4.2, 101.5, 101.5.3, 101.5.6, 102.0,. 1022 102.2.4, 102.3,
103.0, 103.1, 103.1.1, 103.1.2, 103.1.2.1, 103.1.2.2, 103.2, 103.2.1, 10321 [,103.2.1.2,
103.2.1.3,103.2.1.4, 103.2.1.5, 103.2.3, 103.3, 103.3.1, 103.3.5, ‘1,03.5, 103.5.1.1,103.5.1.2,
103.5.1.4, 103.5.2, 103.5.3, 103.5.3.5, 103.5.4, 103.5.4.1, 103542 103.5.5, 103.5.5.2, 103.7,
103.7.1, 103.8, 103.8.1, and 103.8.2.

SECTION 4. The following sections of Chapter 1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code 1997
Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by thls reference are made a part of Chapter 1,
Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 101.4.1.1.1,
101.4.1.3,101.4.3, 101.5.1, 101.5.2, 10154 101.5.5,102.1, 102.2.1, 102.2.2, 102.2.3,102.2.5,
102.2.6, 102.3.1, 102.3.2, 103.1.3,_‘__1(33.2.1.6, 103.2.2,103.3.3, 103.5.1, 103.5.1.3, 103.5.5.1,
103.5.6, 103.5.6.1, 103.5.6.2, andfl()3.5.6.3.

SECTION 5. Section 101.4.1.1.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.4.1.1.1 In existing buildings or preﬁises in which plumbing installations are to be

altered, repaired, or renovated, deviations from the provision of this Code are permitted,

provided such deyiations are found by the Administrative Authority to be necessary as alternate

methods or matférials“ in accordance with the standards in Section 301.2 of this Code, and are first
approved by the Administrative Authority.

SECT ION 6. Section 101.4.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: |

10j.4.1.3 Existing Construction. No provision of this Code shall be deemed to
require aféhange in any portion of a plumbing or drainage system or any other work regulated by

this Code in'or on an existing building or lot when such work was instalied and is maintained in

accordance with law in effect ((prior-to-the-effective-date-of this-Cede)) at the time the system

was installed or the work completed, except when any such plumbing or drainage system or other

work regulated by this Code is determined by the Administrative Authority to be in fact

dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or a nuisance ((and)) or a menace to life, health or property.

Page 2 of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30

SECTION 7. Section 101.4.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:
101.4.3 The provisions in the appendices are intended to supplement the requirements of

this Code and shall not be considered part of this Code unless ((£e%ma}¥y)) adg,ptéd as such by

ordinance.

SECTION 8. Section 101.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumping Code is amended as

- follows:

101.5.1 Additions, Alterations or Repairs. Ad&itions, alterations or repairs may be
made to any plumbing system without requiring thf:;--é;isting plumbing system to comply with all
the requirements of this Code, provided the a@gﬁﬁon, alteration or repair conforms to that
required for a new plumbing system. Ad@itigns, alterations or repairs shall not cause or allow an
existing system to become unsafe, insﬁarii’:;ary or overioaded.

SECTION 9. Section 10152 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

101.5.2 Health angl:";Safety. Whenever the Administrative Authority determines that
compliance with all the in)visions of this Code fails to eliminate or alleviate a nuisance, or any
other dangerous or insgilitary conditions which ((say)) involve health or safety hazards, the

owner or the owner’:.sfs agent shall install such additional plumbing and drainage facilities or shall

- make such repairs;;br alterations as may be ordered by the Administrative Authority.

SECTIQN 10. Section 101.5.4 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: »

10154 Changes in Building Occupancy. Plumbing systems, which are a part of any
building or ggmcture undergoing a change in ((use-ef)) occupancy, as defined in the Building
Code, shall ;omply to all requirements of this Code, which may be applicable to the new ((ase
er)) occupailcy.

SEéTION 11. Section 101.5.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

101.5.5 Maintenance. All plumbing systems, materials and appurtenances, both
existing and new, and all parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operating condition. All

devices or safeguards required by this Code shall be maintained in conformance with the Code

Page 3 of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30

((edition-under-whieh)) in effect when installed. The owner or the owner’s designated agent shall
be responsible for maintenénce of plumbing systems. To determine compliance with this .
subsection, the Administrative Authority may cause any plumbing system to be ((fe—mspee{ed ))
inspected. |

SECTION 12. Section 102.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Qodé 1s amended as

follows:

102.1 Administrative Authority. The Administrati‘ve' Authority ((shall-be-the

Autherity-duly-appeinted-to-enforce-this-Code)) s the diﬁr,e’c’::tor of the Seattle-King County

Department of Public Health or the director's authorized representative, who shall administer and

enforce the provisions of the plumbing and meqh‘énical code (Chapter 13 of the 1997 Uniform

Mechanical Code) as adopted or amended exé"ept as provided in this Code; provided, that the

Director of Seattle Public Utilities or hig.;br her authorized representative shall administer and

enforce provisions relating to the inspéction and approval of water meters and, where applicable,

building supply piping.

SECTION 13. Sectiofri§{102.2.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.1 The Adr;;ifﬁistrative Authority may ((appeint-such-assistants-deputies;

this-Cede:)) adopt suc_ﬁ administrative rules and regulations consistent with this Code as shall be

deemed necessary for its administration and enforcement.

SECTION 14. Section 102.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

f_ollows:

102.2.2 Right of Entry. ((Wh

Page 4 of 21




11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

- 27

28

29

30

of-inspection-andexaminationparstant-to-this-Code:)) qun’f)resentation of proper credentials,

the Administrative Authority may, with the consent of the occupant or with the consent of the

owner of an unoccupied building or premises, or in_,.::‘fccordance with a lawfully issued search

warrant, enter at reasonable times a building or premises to perform a duty imposed upon the

Administrative Authority by this Code, proyiﬁded that the Administrative Authority shall make

entry only if such entry is consistent Withfthe constitutions and laws of the United States and the

State of Washington.

SECTION 15. Section 1 2.2.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.3 Stop ((Qﬂlefs)) Work Noetice and Correction Notice.

A. Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, the
Administrative Authoritvy’;may order the work stopped by notice in writing served on the property
owner and on any per§;§;13 ((engagedn)) doing or causing such work to be done, and any such |
persons shall ((fef%h:géth)) immediately stop work until authorized by the Administrative

Authority to proceeﬁ with the work. Service of a stop work order shall be made by one or more

of the following méthods:

Personal service: Personal service of a stop work order may be made on the property

owner and on am} person doing or causing the work to be done, or by leaving the stop work order

at the house of usual abode of the person being served, provided that the stop work order is left

with a person of suitable age and discretion ' who resides there,

Service by posting on the property: Service directed to the property owner and/or

person doing or causing such work to be done may be made by posting the stop work order in a

conspicuous place on the property where the work is occurring, and concurrently mailing notice

Page S of 21




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24
25
26
27
28
29

30

as provided for below, if a mailing address is available.

Service by mail: Service by mail may be made for a stop work order by mailing two

copies, postage prepaid, one by ordinary first class mail and the other by certified ma/il, to the
/

property owner and to any person doing or causing such work to be done, at the last known

s
address of the person being served, at the address of the location of the W,@'-fk being done, or at the

address of the place of business of the person being served. The taxpé%rer’s address as shown on

the tax records of the county shall be deemed to be the proper qdéress for the purpose of mailing

such notice to the person being served. Service by mail Shaﬁ be presumed effective upon the

third business day after the day upon which the stop W.dfk order was placed in the mail.

B. Whenever any work is being donq,c‘/(’)ntrary to the provisions of this code, the

administrative authority may order the Violatjdhs corrected without ordering all work stopped by

issuing a correction notice that identifies‘_tﬁe violation. The correction notice may require

reinspection before further constructip% or at the time of the next required inspection. The

correction notice shall be served Qr’posted in the same manner as a stop work order,

C. These remedies,.;ére in addition to those authorized elsewhere in the Code.

SECTION 16. Se_gﬁon 102.2.5 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.5 Authonty to ((Cendemn)) Correct Hazardous or Insanitary Plumbing.
Whenever the Admif;istrative Authority ascertains that any plumbing system or portion thereof,
regulated by this stode, has become hazardous to life, health, property, or has become insanitary,
the Administragiize Authority shall order in writing that such plumbing either be removed or
placed in a safe or sanitary condition, as appropriate. The order shall fix a reasonable time limit
for compliagie. No person shall use or maintain defective plumbing after receiving such notice.

When such plumbing system is to be disconnected, Jwritten notice shall be given. In cases

((ef)) in wfﬂch the Administrative Authority has determined that immediate danger to life or

property. exists, the Administrative Authority may cause such disconnection ((#ay)) to be made

immediatély without such notice.

- SECTION 17. Section 102.2.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.2.6 Liability claims. ((The-Administrative-Authority-charged-with-the

Page 6 of 21




10

il

12

i3

i4

15

16

17

18

19

20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30

preceedings:)) This Code is enacted as an exercise of the pe’ﬁce power of the City of Seattle to

protect and preserve the public peace, health, safety andn welfare, and its provisions shall be

liberally construed for the accomplishment of thes_éburposes. It is expressly the purpose of this

Code to provide for and promote the health saféty and welfare of the general public, and not to

create or otherwise establish or designate aﬂﬁ particular class or group of persons who will or

should be especially protected or benefifged by the terms of this Code.

It is the specific intent of thi‘_sffCodf: to place the obligation of complying with its

requirements upon the owner or occupier of premises within this code's scope, and no provision

nor term used in this Code is intended to impose any duty whatsoever upon the Administrative

Authority or anv of the administrative authority's officers or emplovees, for whom the

implementation or enforgfément of this Code shall be discretionary and not mandatory.

Nothing in thisf‘zCode creates or forms the basis for any liability on the part of the

Administrative Authority, or the Administrative Authority's officers, emplovees or agents, for

any injury or damage resulting from the failure of the owner or occupier of premises to comply

with the provisions of this Code, or by reason or in consequence of any act or omission in

connection with the implementation or enforcement of this Code on the part of the

Administrative; Authority by the Administrative Authority's officers, employees or agents.

Any claim and/or litigation arising from any conduct, acts or omissions of the

Administrati\f}e Authority, or any of the Administrative Authority's officers, emplovees or agents,

shall be subjéct to the provisions of Seattle Municipal Code Chapter 4.64, as amended.

SECTION 18. Section 102.3.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

102.3.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, ((e¥)) corporation or other

entity to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip,

Page 7 of 21




11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30

use, or maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this Code. ,
/

SECTION 19. Section 102.3.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amend__ﬁéi as
/

- follows:

102.3.2 Penalties. Any person, firm, ((ef)) corporation or other entity violating any
provision of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and upopr"éﬁonviction thereof,

shall be punishable by a fine and/or imprisonment set forth by the ((soverninglaws-of-the

jurisdietion)) Seattle Criminal Code or by state law. Each separgxté day or any portion thereof,
duringwhich any violation of this Code occurs or continues,‘-~-s'hall be deemed to constitute a

separate offense.

SECTION 20. Section 103.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.1.3 Licensing. It shall be the Qﬁligation of every person who enters into contracts

for the installation or repair of plumbing -S’YStems {{eovered-by-this-codeforwhichnpermitis

required)) for which this Code requires a permit, to comply with all applicable state or local rules

and regulations concerning licensing, ((which-+h

SECTION 21. Secti(:)n" 103.2.1.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

103.2.1.6 Give such other data and information relevant to the proposed work as may be

required by the Admirﬁstrative Authority.

SECTION}_ZZJZ. Section 103.2.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: |

103.2.::2:' P;ans and Specifications. Plans, engineering calculations, diagrams and other
data shall bg:’ﬁsubmitted in one or more sets with each application for a permit. The
Administr_é&ive Authority may require plans, computations and specifications to be prepared by
and the Piumbing designed by an engineer and/or architect licensed by the state to practice as
such.

- Exception: The Administrative Authority may waive the submission of plans,

calculations or other data if the Administrative Authority finds that the nature of the work applied

for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary to ((ebtain)) determine compliance within the

Code.

Page 8 of 21




10

11

12

i3

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

SECTION 23. New section 103.3.1.1 concerning owners' permits is adopted to rgad' as
follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seatﬂé

Amenbdments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

103.3.1.1 Owner's Permit. A bona fide owner may install, alter: or repair ﬁlumbing in

his or her own building, provided:

1. The installation, alteration, or repair work is not undertaken with the intention and

for the purpose of selling the property improved by such-work;

2. The owner applies in person for an Q-\‘Xrner’s permit for the work to be done, and

pays the permit fee according to the fee sched}ﬂé in this code;

3. The owner obtains an ownef’s permit before commencing the installation,

alteration, or repair work;

4. The installation, altération, or repair work is performed exclusively by the owner

and not by anv other person, iﬁéluding a plumbing contractor: and

5. The install@ﬁon, alteration, or repair work is performed in the manner required by

this cod_gfsubiect to inspection and approval by the administrative authority.

SECTION 24 Section 103.3.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:
10333 Validity of Permit. The issuance of a permit or approval of plans and

specificatiog% shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of

the provisjbns of this Code or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction. No permit presuming to

give autﬁ:ority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code shall be valid.

:;i';;l“he issuance of a permit based upon plans, specifications or other data shall not prevent
the Aéministrative Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errors contained in said
planésg, specifications and other data or from preventing building operations being carried on
theréunder when in violation of this Code or of other ordinances of this jurisdiction.

A person to whom a permit has been issued shall not allow another person to do or cause

to be done any work under such permit except persons in the employ of the permittee.

Every plumbing permit shall be posted on the building, structure or premises where the

work permitted is being performed and shall not be removed until the work has been finally

approved by the Administrative Authority,

Page 9 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

Every permit issued by the administrative authority under the provisions of this code shall

expire by limitation and become null and void one vear from date of issue. Permits exﬁired for

not more than one year may be renewed for one-half the original cost or fifty dol@afé, whichever

is less. Permits expired for more than one year require the regular schedule__dr‘fées.

Plumbing work authorized by a permit in effect on the effectiye‘dfate of this code shall be

performed in accordance with the laws and ordinances in effect wﬁén the permit was issued,

except when the administrative authority determines the wqrikf to be in fact dangerous, unsafe

insanitary, or a nuisance or a menace to life, health or préiaertv.

SECTION 25. Section 103.5.1 of the 19-'97'}Jnif0rm Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: "

103.5.1 General. All plumbing,-'s‘%tems for which a permit is required by this Code
shall be inspected by the Administra»t-_ivg Authority. No portion of any plumbing system shall be

covered or otherwise concealed until inspected and approved. Neither the Administrative

Authority nor the jurisdiction sh;ﬂl be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement
of material required to perm.i'tjinspection. When the installation of a plumbing system is
complete, an additional and finz;} inspection shall be made.

SECTION 26:_.;.?;'Section 103.5.1.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

103.5.1.3 ';Eiovering or Using. No plumbing or drainage system, building sewer,
private sewer dis'};osal system or part thereof, shall be covered, concealed, or put into use until it
has been tested,f inspected, and ((aceepted)) approved as prescribed in this Code.

SECTiON 27. Section 103.5.5.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: |

1033.5.1 Defective Systems. An air test shall be used in testing the sanitary condition
of the drainage or plumbing system of ény building premises when there is reason to believe that
it has become defective. In buildings or premises'condemned by the ((preper)) Administrative
Authority because of an insanitary condition of the plumbing system or part thereof, the
((alterations-in)) corrections to such system shall conform to the requirements of this Code.

SECTION 28. Section 103.5.6 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

Page 10 of 21




- 10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

103.5.6 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection when ((sueh-pertion)) part or all of the work for which inspection is calleqfi’é/not
campléte or when required corrections have not been made. / |

This provision is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees th?/f/i;st time a job is
rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as cgﬁ'f?olling the practice
of calling for inspections before the job is ready for inspection or reigfs_»ﬁéction.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the approved pl@n"é{ are not readily available to

the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for Whiﬁ?l the inspection is requested, or

for deviating from plans ((requiring-the-approval-ef)) wh@rf the deviation requires approval but

has not been approved by the Administrative Authoripy';

To obtain reinspection, the applicant shalll,fﬂe an application therefor in writing upon a
form furnished for that purpose and pay the re_iﬂépection fee in accordance with ((Fable1-1))

Chapter 22.504 of this Code.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the
work will be performed until the reqﬁired fees have been paid.

SECTION 29. Section;iszB.S 6.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: |

103.5.6.1 Correcﬁ;)ns. Notices of correction or violation shall be ((seeitter)) issued by
the Administrative Autb&ity and may be posted at the site of tﬁe work or mailed or delivered to
the permittee or his e}ﬁ;horized representative. Refusal, failure, or neglect to comply with any
such notice or ordgr: within ten days of receipt thereof, shall be considered a violation of this

Code, and Shallfb'e subject to the ((penalties)) remedies for violations as set forth elsewhere in

this Code, ((for-vielations:))
SECTION 30. Section 103.5.6.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

1(53.5.6.2 Retesting. If the Administrative Authority finds that the work ((iH)) does

not pass;((the)) any required test or inspection, necessary corrections shall be made and the work

shall then be resubmitted for test or inspection.

SECTION 31. Section 103.5.6.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows;

Page 11 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

103.5.6.3 Approval. Upon the satisfactory completion and final test of the plumbing

e

system, a certificate of approval shall be issued by the Administrative Authority to the ger/mittee;

/

{{on-demand:)) ‘ //
V4
SECTION 32. New sections 104.0, 104.1, 104.1.1 and 104.1.2 conce;rﬁing the
p:

i

Plumbing Board of Appeals, and 105.0, 105.1, 105.1.1, 105.1.2, 105.1.3, affd 105.1.4 concerning
. }\/

Hearing Examiner appeals, are adopted to read as follows and by this,}é/ference are made a part

of Chapter 1, Administration, of the Seattle Amendments to the /],47 Uniform Plumbing Code:

/
104.0 Board of Appeals S

&
7

A Board of Appeals shall be established and sha-lfconsist of six voting members, with

one member representing journeyman plumbers, plimbing contractors, professional mechanical

engineers, and building owners and two membe'i‘s representing the public. The Administrative

/

Authority shall serve as a nonvoting membé‘r of the Board. The Board of Appeals shall elect a

chair and a secretary who shall serve ap‘%he pleasure of the Board.

104.1 Any party aggrieved"‘f)v a decision of the Administrative Authority made in

accordance with this Code eith@r"‘" in the context of a specific project or permit application or in

the context of an appiicatior;ﬁfor approval of an alternate material or method of construction, or

both, may file a written pgz{ition for appeal to the Board, accompanied by a nonrefundable fee of

one hundred dollars. {&tf)peals shall be heard at reasonable times at the convenience of the Board,

but not later than th@r’iv days after receipt of the petition. However, this time requirement may be

waived by writtenfagreement between the Administrative Authority and the appellant if doing so

will facilitate rgﬁgolution of the dispute. The appellant shall be entitled to appear in person before

the Board, tojbe represented by an attorney, and to introduce evidence in support of such petition.

The appell}é{nt shall cause to be made at the appellant's own expense any test or research required

by the Bqérd for the substantiation of any claim or claims made by the appellant. The Board of

Appeals;shall determine whether a correct interpretation of this Code has been made by the

Adminfstrative Authority.

104.1.1 Decisions of the Board shall be in writing: shall be distributed to the

Admiilistrative Authority and the appellant; and shall apply only to the case being heard. Board

decisions are deemed issued on the date that the decision is delivered to the appellant or the

- appellant’s counsel or, if the decision is mailed, on the date of mailing. Any person aggrieved by

Page 12 of 21




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

a decision of the Board may appeal the decision of the Board to the Hearing Examiner as

provided in Sections 105.0 through 105.1.4 of this chapter. /

104.1.2 The Board may make recommendations to the Administrative Authority for
y

) /
changes in the Code. /

7
7

105.0 Hearing Examiner Appeals. /
Y,
Ve
105.1 Filing of Appeals. Appeals shall be filed with the City of Sedttle Hearing
ﬂ/i/
Examiner by five p.m. (5:00 p.m.) of the tenth (10™) calendar day folloyvi'ng the date the decision

g

of the Board is issued pursuant to Section 104.1.1. When the last dav of the appeal period so

i

computed is Saturday, Sunday or city holiday, the period shall run until five p.m. (5:00 p.m.) on

the next business day. An appeal shall be considered file@,@ith the Hearing Examiner when it

delivered to the Hearing Examiner’s office or, if the apf;eal is sent via US mail or a private mail

service, when it is received by the Examiner. TheJEfxaminer’s date stamp shall be placed on

incoming appeals and there is a rebuttable presﬁ}nption that the date and time stamped is the date

and time of filing. The appeal shall be in \{inting and shall state specifically why the appellant

believes the decision of the Board to.be ,iﬁcorrect and what relief is sought. The appeal shall be

accompanied by payment of the fillip",é:r fee as set forth in SMC Section 3.02.125. Hearing

Examiner Filing Fees, including anv amendments or revisions thereto.

105.1.1 Parties of Rg(‘i)rd. The parties to the appeal shall be the appellant and the

Administrative Authority.

105.1.2 Notice of Hearing., Notice of the hearing on the appeal shall be mailed Twenty

(20) davs prior to the sgileduled hearing date to the parties of record.

105.1.3 Scoﬁé and Standard of Review. The hearing shall be de novo. The Board’s

decision shall be gwen substantial weight by the Hearing Examiner and the burden shall be on

appellant to prov;c-i that the Board’s decision is clearly erroneous.

£
i

105.1.4 / Hearing Examiner’s Decision. The Hearing Examiner shall issue a decision

in writing witliin fifteen days after the close of the hearing and mail that decision to all parties of

record. The decision shall contain written findings and conclusions. The Hearing Examiner’s

decision shall be final and conclusive and the parties of record shall be bound by the terms and

conditions of the decision unless within twenty-one davs from the date of issuance of the

decision appellant makes application to King County Superior Court for a Land Use Petition

Page 13 of 21




13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

25

26

27

28

29

30

pursuant to RCW 36.70C.

SECTION 33. Section 206.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended to add a

new definition as follows: /.
/
2060 --D-- Vs
7
% % % _ Ve
/f ’

-~ .
Domestic Water Heater — A domestic water heater is a tank withﬁ a'self-contained

o

heating unit which stores potable hot water for residential or commergiﬁl use with a nominal

A‘f

water containing capacity of one-hundred twenty gallons or less, Having a heating input of two-

hundied thousand BTUs per hour or less used for hot water Vsii'fpplv at pressures of one-hundred

sixty pounds per square inch or less and at operating ter__r,tﬁeratures of two-hundred ten degrees

P

Fahrenheit or less.

* % % £

ki

SECTION 34. Section 214.0 of the _’,1597 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

214.0 --L--

) %k

i
£

Listing Agency — An ageng’f; accepted by the Administrative Authority which is in the
business of listing or labeling an(fwhich maintains a periodic inspection program on current

production of listed models, angfis which makes available a published report of such listing in

B

which specific information isg:i:hcluded that the product has been tested to approved standards and

found safe for use in a spec@fic manner. Listing Agencies approved by the Administrative

T

Authority are as follows: Ef;ternational Association of plumbing and Mechanical Officials

(LAPM.O.); Washjngtqéx State Department of Social and Health Services: National Sanitation

Foundation (N.S.F.); Citv of Los Angeles Testing Laboratory; American Gas Association;

Canadian Gas Associétion; Canadian Standards Association: and Underwriters Laboratories.

Listing agencies or tésting laboratories are not limited to the agencies named in this section.

Other testing or listing agencies may be added to the approved list as the administrative authority

deems necessary.

* %k Xk

SECTION 35. Section 218.0 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as

Page 14 of 21




10
11
12
13

14

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28
29

30

follows:

218.0 --P--

El

Plumbing System — Includes all potable water building supply and distrébﬁtion pipes, all
plumbing fixtures and traps, all drainage and vent pipe(s), and all building q:;ains and building
sewers, including their respective joints and connection, devices, receptgr'é: and appurtenances
within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable water piping, potable water |

treating or using equipment, medical gas and medical vacuum sy§féms, fuel gas piping, water

heaters ((and-ventsforsame)) and rainwater leaders. Howeve,r’;ﬂ certification is not required for

the installation of a plumbing system within the property lines and outside the building.

% %k 3%

Public or Public Use — All buildings or strugti‘ﬁres that are not defined as private or

private use.

(1) __ General Use applies to business‘,_;f’commercial, industrial and assembly

occupancies other than those defined under hgﬁﬁvv use. Included are the public and common

areas in hotels, motels aﬁd multidwelling biﬁldings.

(2) Heavy Use assembly ap‘plifés to toilet facilities in occupancies which place a

heavy, but intermittent time-based demz_ﬁld on the water supply system, such as schools,

auditoriums, stadiums, race courses, t;énsportation terminals, theaters and similar occupancies

where queuing is likely to occur dur@ﬁg periods of peak use.

* %k %k

SECTION 36. Section 6041 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows: |

604.1 Water pipe and éféttings shall be of brass, copper, cast iron, ((galvanized-malleable
rons-)) galvanized wrought 1r0n, ((zalvanized-steel-)) or other approved materials. Cast iron
fittings used for water need not be galvanized if over two ((€2})) inches (51mm) in size.
Asbestos-cement, CPVC, PE or PVC water pipe manufactured to recognized standards may be
used for cold water distribution systems outside a building. CPVC water pipe and tubing may be
used for hot and cold water distribution systems within a building. All materials used in the

water supply system, except valves and similar devices shall be of a like material, except where

Page 15 of 21




Ul

10

11

12

14

15

16

17

18

i9

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

otherwise approved by the Administrative Authority.
SECTION 37. Section 604.2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:
604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a weight of not less than Type L
Exception: Type M copper tubing may be qsed for water piping when piping_;:i“giabove
ground in, or on, a building, ((erunderground-outside-ef structures:))
SECTION 38. New section 803.1 concerning parking garage draingg’é: systems is
adopted to read as follows and by this reference is made a part of Chapter& Indirect Wastes, of

the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code:

803.1 Parking Garage Drainage Systems. All floor dgdfnage under the roof of a

parking garage shall be connected to the sanitary drainage svsgéin. When the top floor of the

building is used as a roof as well as a parking area, the drai__ﬂage from the roof shall be connected

to the storm drainage system. Drainage from conventiqriél plumbing fixtures shall not be inter-

connected with the floor drainage svstem. However,;ﬂrainage lines from car or truck washing

equipment may be connected to the floor drainag&;févstem through an approved interceptor. Floor

?

drainage waste lines shall be a minimum of thre_é inches in size. Waste unit loadings for three-

inch or larger size floor drainage piping sha.ll;:%e sized in accordance with table 7-5 of this code.

Floor drains or floor drain openings shall be equipped with approved strainers and need not be

trapped when connected to the building @iiain through a properly trapped and vented interceptor.

Traps shall not be used when the floor drains are located in areas exposed to freezing

temperatures. The waste line from ﬂ_ébr drains entering an interceptor shall be above the waste

line discharging from the intercepto_f to the building drain. The sand interceptor receiving the

floor drains shall have a water sea}?of not less than six inches. Floor drain traps need not be

vented individually if line ventiné is used throush an approved indirect waste svstem with a

properly trapped and vented intéfceptor. A line vent for floor drains shall terminate through the

roof or to an approved location_é?in the outside atimosphere. When using line venting, the

terminating vents, if more than one, shall be equal in cross sectional area to the size of the waste

line entering the interceptor or the line vent may continue full size from the interceptor to the

point of termination. Al plans for parking sarage floor drainage systems shall be submitted to

the administrative authority prior to installation for approval.

Page 16 of 21




12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

ASmSh T e

SECTION 39. The following sections of Chapter 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
1997 Edition, are hereby adopted and by this reference are made a part of Chapter 11, Storm
Drainage, vof the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code: 1101.4, 11()11 1,
1101.11.2, 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.11.2.3, 1101.11.2.4, 1101.11.3, 1103.0,;1’{03.1,
1103.3, 1104.0, 1104.1, 1105.0, 1105.1, 1105.1.2, 1105.2, 1105.3, 1105.4, 110541 1105.4.2,
1106.1, 1106.2, 1106.4, 1109.0, 1109.1, 1109.2, 1109.2.1, and 1109.2.3, ar}df(:l“able 11-2.

SECTION 40. The following sections of Chapter 11 of the qu—f;rm Plumbing Code
1997 Edition are hereby adopted as amended and by this reference agéinade a part of Chapter 11,
Storm Drainage, of the Seattle Amendments to the 1997 Unifong::fiiiumbing Code: 1101.3,
1101.11.1, 1104.3, 1105.1.1, 1109.2.2, and Table 11-1.

SECTION 41. Section 1101.3 of the 1997 Unif()l{jrfl}‘Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

1101.3 Material Uses. Rainwater piping p}aced within the interior of a building or run
within a vent or shaft shall be of cast iron, galvani_z’éd steel, wrought irbn, brass, copper, lead,

Schedule 40 ABS DWYV, Schedule 40 PVC DWV, or other approved materials, and changes in

direction shall conform to the requirements of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997 Edition.

permitied:))

SECTION 42. Séctiox;‘g;l 101.11.1 of the 1997 Uniform Plufnbing Code is amended as
follows:

1101.11.1 Primary éoof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by roof
drains or gutters. The Iocati(; and sizing of drains and gutters shall be coordinated with the
structural design and pitch of the roof. Unless otherwise required by the Administrative
Authority, roof drains, gutte;s, vertical conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm drains for
primary drainage shall be siied based on a storm of sixty ((€603)) minutes duration and

((#69))one hundred-year return period (see Appendix D of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997

Page 17 of 21




10
11

12

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24

25
26
27

Edition).

SECTION 43. Section 1104.3 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is ar{;ﬁ:ﬁded as
follows:

1104.3 Combining Storm with Sanitary Drainage. The sani;;af& and storm drainage

system of a building shall be entirely separate. ((Te*eep%whefe-&eembmeése“%s-asedrm

from-any-sei-stack:))
SECTION 44. Section 1105.1.1 of the 1997U niform Plumbing Code is amended as

follows:

1105.1.1 Roof drains shall be construg.t"éd of materials specified in ((Fable144)) WAC

51-46-1491 — Table 14-1. |

SECTION 45. Section 1109.2‘:25;:)f the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as
follows:

1109.2.2 Air Test. The a%f.‘t?est shall be made by attaching an air compressor testing |
apparatus to any suitable opening_,:éfter closing all other_ inlets and outlets to the system, forcing
air into the system until there zsa uniform gage pressure of five ((653)) psi (34.5 kPa) or sufficient
to balance a column of mercg%;i ten (((1603)) inches (254 mm) in height. This pressure shall be

held without introduction of additional air for a period of at least fifteen (15) minutes.

SECTION 46. ;‘;Tablc 11-1 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code is replaced by the

following:
i Table 11-1 - Rainwater Leaders
Roof or Other Area Served Size of Rainwater Leader
(Square Feet) {Inches)
1-1050 ' 2
1051 - 3150 3
3151 - 6450 4
6451 — 10800 5
10801 — 18000 6
18001 — 35700 8
35701 — 58800 10
58801 — 95400 12

NOTE: If table 11-1 does not provide a practical solution for sizing rainwater leaders, refer to
tables 11-1 and 11-2 of the 1997 Uniform Plumbing Code for more comprehensive engineering
design information relating to installation of rainwater systems. Use the 2” column maximum

Page 18 of 21




)

10

il

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

rainfall in inches per hour.

SECTION 47. Section 22.504.010 of the Seattle Municipal Code is amended to n;-’éd as

i

follows: /

22.504.010 Permit fees. | /

/

((Every)) An applicant for a permit to do work under this Plumbing Codef{iﬂall pay for
each permit, at the time of issuance, a fee in accordance with the following sgﬁééiule, and at the
rate provided for each classification shown in ((this)) the schedule: |

A.  Schedule of Fees

r

Base plumbing permit for one (1) through four (4) fixture§;6ur traps

(other than reduced pressure principle backflow prever;ﬁon devices or

double check valve assemblies, for which a separa;efpermit shall be

obtained at the rates in this schedule). . . . . . .. A $75
For each additional plumbing fixture or trap;(-’iﬁrplcluding water

drainage vent piping and backﬂmy‘ﬁrotection therefor) ................ 10
For each atmospheric vacunm breaker m irrigation systems, tanks,

Vats; etc., or for installation on unprotected plumbing fixtures

including necessary water}ﬁiping

Vacuum breakeg;:’i one (1) tofive (S)—eachdevice.............. 10
Vacuum brealgér —over five (5) —eachdevice ... ................ 5

Pressure((—;y%e—b&e—leﬂew—prwemef)) vacuum breaker —each...... 10

Reduced pressure princig’ie backflow prevention device ((andf))or double

check valve assembly ({——eac‘* ......................................... 19))
Base plumbir}{f,é permit for one (1) deviceorassembly. . . ... ... ....... 75
Each additi(gxal device or assemblv ................................ 10
B. Fees for Ngscellaneous Inspection Services

Fees for inspecti(fh service outside regular working hours or for inspection service
requested_? but not covered by a permit will be charged for at a rate equal to the
cost of performing the service.

Fees for permanent location inspection of factory housing or modular unit containing

plumbing —

Page 19 of 21




10

11

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

For each single-family dwelling or each
modular unit containing plumbing . . ........ . ... L. A $};Q’ |
Plumbing permit includes on-site connections of building drain extensiqné,

water service and necessary gas piping connections. I

Additional plumbing fixtures installed after factory installation of .

plumbing for each plumbing fixture ortrap . . . . .. ey 4 ............ 10
Fees for reconnection ad retest of plumbing systems in relocatfgévlfbuildings -
For each building containing plumbing .. ... . ... ................. 20
~ Plumbing permit includes on-site connections (}f"i;uilding drain extensions,
water service and necessary gas piping conq_eéions.
Additional plumbing fixtures installed after reiogéi;ion of building
for each plumbing fixtare or trap . . . ........................... 10
C. For the purpose of this section, "fi{%f{;re" means and includes an((¥)) appliance
((hieh)) that is connected with a water, dram((;)) or vent pipe, but ((8e)) a sillcock faucet or
hose bibb ((shall-be)) is not considered a ﬁxture A sanitary plumbing outlet on or to which a
plumbing fixture or appliance may be set ?ff:attached ((shall-be-construed-to-be)) is a fixture.
D. A{(®¥)) person who com?f{;nced ((amy)) work for which a permit is required by
this ((Plumbing)) Code without first havmg obtained ((saech)) the permit, shall upon subsequent

application for ((sueh)) the permit pﬁé;f double the fee fixed by the ((abeve)) schedule of fees for

((sueh)) the work in subsections Aand B of this section unless it ((shali-be)) is proved to the
satisfaction of the Admjnistratiyg Authority that ((saeh)) the work was urgently necessary and
that it was not practical to obtam a permit ((prierte)) before the commencement of the work. In
all such emergency cases;, ?g_fi;ermit shall be obtained as soon as it is practical to do so, and if there
is an unreasonable dela;;féx obtaining ((saeh)) the permit, a double fee shall be charged as
provided in this ((seetféa)) Code.

E. A reig’ipection fee of Forty Dollars ($40) may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection ((wheﬁ«ﬁaeh)) if the portion of work for which inspection is called is ﬁot complete or
((when)) if correctiféns called for are not made. This subsection ((is)) does not ((to-be-interpreted

as-Fequiring)) reguire inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with

((the—fég&ﬁemen%s%ai’)) this Code, but as ((diseouraging)) controlling the practice of calling for

Page 20 of 21




10
i1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

27

28
29

e, i,

inspection or reinspection.
Reinspection fees may be assessed ((when)) if the permit is not properly posted on the

work site, the work to be inspected is not under test, for failure to provide access on the date for

/
which inspection is requested((;)) or for failure to make required corrections. ((Fo-obtaina /

s

reinspection-the-applicant shall-file-an-application-therefor)) Requests for reinspection sha}li/be
f‘f

made in writing upon ((a&)) forms furnished for that purpose, and ((pay)) shall be accoﬁi}aanied by
/

p‘/.} .
the reinspection fee in accordance with this section. ((Ja-instanees-where)) If reinspection fees
. /4"
&

have been assessed, ((#e)) additional inspection of the work ((w4H)) shall nopﬁé performed until

the required fees have been paid. ,f

SECTION 48. Section 22.504.020 of the Seattle Municipq;:é;)de is amended to read as
follows:

22.504.020 Refund of fees.

((Shewuld)) If the work for which a permit fee has“bé;n paid is not ((be)) started, the
Administrative authority, upon proper application for‘ﬁ;zéf;und and surrender of the permit for
cancellation, shall issue a refund. In determining t;hgamount Qf refund due, the Administrative

Authority shall deduct the amount of the basic fee to cover the cost of administration of the

permit. {(Ne)) A refund shall not be made qusan((y)) expired permit.

Passed by the City Council the___ /' day of , 1999,
and signed by me in open session in autﬁ;ntication of its passage this day of
, 1999,

President of the City Council

Approved by me thisf day of , 1999.

Paul Schell, Mayor

Page 21 of 21

s

/




TIME ANTC ATE STAMP

SPONSORSHIP

THE ATTACHED DOCUMENT IS SPONSORED FOR FILING WITH THE CITY COUNCIL BY
THE MEMBER(S) OF THE CITY COUNCIL WHOSE SIGNATURE(S) ARE SHOWN BELOW;

FOR CITY COUNCIL PRESIDENT USE OiNLY

COMMITTEE(S) REFERRED TO:




STATE OF WASHINGTON - KING COUNTY

LIGRGT s
ity of Ssstitle, ity Clevk

No.

Affidavit of Publication

The undersigned, on oath states that he is amn
authorized representative of The Daily Journal of Commerce, a
daily newspaper, which newspaper is a legal newspaper of general
circulation and it is now and has been for more than six months
prior to the date of publication hereinafter referred {c, published in
the English language continuously as a daily newspaper in Seattle,
King County, Washington, and it is now and during all of said time
was printed in an office maintained at the aforesaid place of
publication of this newspaper. The Daily Journal of Commerce
was on the 12th day of June, 1941, approved as a legal newspaper
by the Superior Court of King County.

The notice in the exact form annexed, was published in regular
issues of The Daily Journal of Commerce, which was regularly
distributed to its subscribers during the befow stated period. The
annexed notice, a

TR 74 ORD IH FUL

was published on

LFELSE

s

f;/r@oi g publication is

The amount of the fee charged fcf;”the,
the sum of § , ; 1as been paid igll.

)

WU =

Notary Pubtic for the State of Washington,
residing in Seattle

Affidavit of Publication






