ing

t

IS

Chapter 22

to the Seattle Exi

ing
amend

AN ORDINANCE relat

110 to the

ing

ing Code,
ipa

Id

Bu

[0}
e
=

]

(&

[

[

jud
Qo

0]

hul

>
O
'

Q

]
e}

©

O
—

(]
©

O
&

IC

Seattle Mun

and

ing Building Code
6 through 10
A

t

is
4

ional Exi
hapters 2

2009 Internat

b

ing ¢

amend

1

IX

13 and 15 and Append

7

ing a new

chapters 12
adopt
adm

Chapter 1 related to

and

122529

d enforcement;

ing an
13 of Ord

tt

, perm

on

trati

is

in

Inance

2

Sections

ing

repeal

ironment

ilt Env

Bu




O 0 N N AW N

[\ NS T (S T N 2 ST \S T (S S e e e

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

ORDINANCE V23379

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Existing Building Code, amending Chapter 22.110 to
the Seattle Municipal Code to adopt by reference the 2009 International Existing Building
Code; amending chapters 2, 4, 6 through 10, and chapters 12, 13 and 15 and Appendix A,
adopting a new Chapter 1 related to administration, permitting and enforcement; and
repealing Sections 2-13 of Ordinance 122529,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 22.110.010 of the Seattle Municipal Code, which section was last
amended by Ordinance 122529, is amended as follows:

22.110.010 Adoption of International Existing Building Code((s))

The Seattle Existing Building Code consists of the following portions of the ((2006)) 2009

edition of the International Existing Building Code ((and-errata-published-by-theJnternational
Code-Couneil)): Chapters 2 through 10, Chapters 12, 13, 15, and Appendix A, together with

Chapter 1 and the amendments and additions adopted by ordinance. One copy of the ((2606))
2009 International Existing Building Code is filed with the City Clerk in C.F. ((30893%))
310928.

Section 2. The following is adopted as Chapter 1 of the Seattle Existing Building Code
and reads as follows:

Chapter 1
ADMINISTRATION
SECTION 101
GENERAL
101.1 Title. This subtitle shall be known as the “Seattle Existing Building Code.”

101.2 Applicability. If requested by the permit applicant, this code applies as a code alternate to
Chapter 34 of the Seattle Building Code for alteration, change of occupancy, relocation of and|
additions to existing buildings as defined in Chapter 2.
Exceptions:
1.  Buildings within the scope of the International Residential Code shall comply with the
International Residential Code.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 1

X
G’\\m




MR- N R - N T N VSR

10
1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

2. Buildings undergoing substantial alteration as defined in the Seattle Building Code shall
comply with the Seattle Building Code.

3. . Repairs shall comply with the Seattle Building Code.

4,  Historic buildings shall comply with the Seattle Building Code. _

101.2.1 Compliance with other codes. Although this code may apply as an alternate to

Chapter 34 of the Seattle Building Code for alterations, changes of occupancy, relocation and

additions to certain existing buildings, compliance with the applicable provisions of other

codes, including but not limited to the Washington State Energy Code with Seattle

Amendments and the Seattle Electrical Code, is also required.

[W] 101.2.2 Fire prevention. Except as specifically provided for in this Code, the provisions

of the International Fire Code shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures,

processes and premises regarding:

1. The hazard of fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling or use of structures,

materials or devices;

2. conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures or

premises; and

3. the construction, extensmn repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm

systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the premises from occupancy or operation.

[W] 101.2.3 Buildings not previously occupied. A building or portion of a building that has

not been previously occupied or used for its intended purpose in accordance with the laws in

existence at the time of its completion shall comply with the provisions of the International

Building Code for new construction or with any current permit for such occupancy.

101.2.4 Buildings previously occupied. The legal occupancy of any building existing on the

date of adoption of this code is permitted to continue without change, except as specifically

provided otherwise in this code, the Infernational Fire Code, or the Seattle Housing and

Building Maintenance Code, or as deemed necessary by the code official to correct an unsafe

building. For the purpose of this section, "unsafe building" is not a mere lack of compliance

with the current code. ‘

101.3 Purpose.
101.3.1 General. The purpose of this code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life
or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design,
construction, quality of materials, occupancy, location and maintenance of certain existing
buildings and structures within the City and certain equipment in those buildings, as
specifically regulated herein. :
101.3.2 Protection of the public. The purpose of this code is to provide for and promote the
health, safety and welfare of the general public, and not to create or otherwise establish o
designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be especially protected
or benefited by the terms of this code.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 2

s
0\
Q‘g&&%\‘




O 0 N N B WN

[\ [\ Do [\ [\ N N [\®] N — End —_ — — P et oy vy [—y
oo ~J N ()] S W N — ja] O ~ [@)) w R W [\ — (ww]

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

101.3.3 Flexibility. The intent of this code is to provide flexibility for the use of alternative
approaches to achieve compliance with minimum requirements to safeguard the public
health, safety and welfare insofar as they are affected by the alteration, change of occupancy,
addition and relocation of certain existing buildings.

101.4 Internal Consistency. If in any specific case, different sections of this code specify
different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, the most restrictive governs.
If there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific
requirement applies.

101.5 Referenced codes. The codes and standards referenced in this code are considered part of
the requirements of this code to the extent prescribed by each such reference. If differences
occur between provisions of this code and referenced codes and standards, the provisions of this
code apply. .

101.6 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Existing Building Code do
not apply unless specifically adopted as part of this code with the exception of Appendix A,
which is herein adopted.

101.7 Metric units. Wherever in this ordinance there is a conflict between metric units of
measurement and English units, the English units govern.

101.8 Impracticality. In cases where total compliance with all the requirements of this code i
impractical, the applicant may arrange a pre-design conference with the design team and the codg
official. The applicant shall identify design solutions and modifications that conform to Section
102.2 or 102.3. The code official may waive specific requirements in this code, which the code
official determines to be impractical.

101.9 References to other codes. Whenever an International, National or Uniform Code is
referenced in this code, it means the Seattle edition of that code, including local amendments.
References to the “Building Code”, “Residential Code”, “Fire Code”, “Mechanical Code” and
“Plumbing Code” mean the Seattle editions of those codes.

SECTION 102
COMPLIANCE METHODS

102.1 Compliance methods. The addition to or alteration, change of occupancy, or relocation of
existing buildings shall comply with one of the methods listed in Sections 102.1.1 through
102.1.3 selected by the applicant. Sections 102.1.1 through 102.1.3 shall not be applied in
combination with each other. Where this code requires consideration of the seismic-force-
resisting system of an existing building subject to alteration, change of occupancy, addition or
relocation of existing buildings, the seismic evaluation and design shall be based on Section
102.1.4 regardless of which compliance method is used.
Exception: Subject to the approval of the code official, alterations complying with the laws
in existence at the time the building or the affected portion of the building was built shall be
considered in compliance with the provisions of this code unless the building is undergoing a
substantial alteration. New structural members added as part of the alteration shall comply

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 3

i

R




O© o a9 O U R~ W N e~

N N [\ ] N [\ S N N [\ — — —_ »—n. — —_— —_ [we—y — —_
o] ~ (@) (9] P (V8] [\ —_ [ O o) ~J @) w EaN w N —_ o

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

with the International Building Code. Alterations of existing buildings in flood hazard areas
shall comply with Section 601.3. 4

102.1.1 Prescriptive compliance method. To use the prescriptive compliance method, the
repairs, alterations, additions, changes of occupancy and relocated buildings shall comply
with Seattle Building Code Chapter 34.

102.1.2 Work area compliance method. To use the work area compliance method, the
alterations, additions, changes of occupancy and relocated buildings shall comply with
Chapters 4-10 and Chapter 12 of this code.

102.1.3 Performance compliance method. To use the performance compliance method, the
alterations, additions, changes of occupancy and relocated buildings shall comply with
Chapter 13 of this code.

102.1.4 Evaluation and design procedures. The seismic evaluation and design shall be

based on the procedures specified in the International Building Code, ASCE 31 or ASCE 41.

The procedures contained in Appendix A of this code shall be permitted to be used as
specified in Section 102.1.4.1.
102.1.4.1 Compliance with IBC level seismic forces. Where compliance with the
seismic design provisions of the International Building Code is required, the procedures
shall be in accordance with one of the following:
1. One-hundred percent of the values in the International Building Code. Where the
existing seismic force-resisting system is a type that can be designated as “Ordinary”,
values of R, Q0, and Cd used for analysis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the
International Building Code shall be those specified for structural systems classified
as “Ordinary” in accordance with Table 12.2-1 of ASCE 7, unless it is demonstrated
that the structural system will provide performance equivalent to that of a “Detailed”,
“Intermediate” or “Special” system.
2. Compliance with ASCE 41 using both the BSE-1 and BSE-2 earthquake hazard
levels and the corresponding performance levels shown in Table 102.1.4.1.

TABLE 102.1.4.1
PERFORMANCE CRITERIA FOR IBC LEVEL SEISMIC FORCES OCCUPANCY

CATEGORY (Based PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR PERFORMANCE LEVEL
on IBC Table USE WITH ASCE 41 BSE-1 FOR USE WITH ASCE 41
1604.5) EARTHQUAKE HAZARD - BSE-2 EARTHQUAKE
LEVEL HAZARD LEVEL
I Life safety (LS) Collapse prevention (CP)
I Life safety (LS) Collapse prevention (CP)
Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 4

(H




oI e R N =) L ¥ S S O

NN N NN NN NN Mk s e e e e e = e
<= B T > N & e N Pt S = TN- - RN I N ¥ S O S R S T =)

Maureen Traxlet/MT
DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010
Version #4

I Note a Note a

v Immediate occupancy (I0) Life safety (LS)

a. Acceptance criteria for Occupancy Category III shall be taken as 80 percent of the acceptance
criteria specified for Occupancy Category 11 performance levels, but need not be less than the
acceptance criteria specified for Occupancy Category IV performance levels.

102.1.4.2 Compliance with reduced IBC level seismic forces. Where seismic
evaluation and design is permitted to meet reduced International Building Code seismic
force levels, the procedures used shall be in accordance with one of the following:

1. One-hundred percent of the values in the International Building Code. Where the
existing seismic force-resisting system is a type that can be designated as “Ordinary”,
values of R, Qo, and Cy used for analysis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the
International Building Code shall be those specified for structural systems classified
as “Ordinary” in accordance with Table 12.2-1 of ASCE 7, unless it is demonstrated
that the structural system will provide performance equivalent to that of a “Detailed”,
“Intermediate” or “Special” system. :

- 2. Structures or portions of structures that comply with the requirements of the
applicable chapter in Appendix A as specified in Items 2.1 through 2.5 shall be
deemed to comply with this section.

2.1. The seismic evaluation and design of unreinforced masonry bearing wall
buildings in Occupancy Category I or II are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter Al.

2.2. Seismic evaluation and design of the wall anchorage system in reinforced
concrete and reinforced masonry wall buildings with flexible diaphragms in
Occupancy Category I or II are permitted to be based on the procedures specified
in Chapter A2.

2.3. Seismic evaluation and design of cripple walls and sill plate anchorage in
residential buildings of light-frame wood construction in Occupancy Category I or
II are permitted to be based on the procedures specified in Chapter A3.

2.4. Seismic evaluation and design of soft, weak, or open-front wall conditions in
multiunit residential buildings of wood construction in Occupancy Category I or II
are permitted to be based on the procedures specified in Chapter A4.

3. Compliance with ASCE 31 based on the applicable performance level as shown in
Table 102.1.4.2. It shall be permitted to use the BSE-1 earthquake hazard level as
defined in ASCE 41 and subject to the limitations in Item 4 below.

4. Compliance with ASCE 41 using the BSE-1 Earthquake Hazard Level and the
performance level shown in Table 102.1.4.2. The design spectral response
acceleration parameters Sys and Sy; specified in ASCE 41 shall not be taken less than

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 5

b
(G




[V, - N S B

No - SEEE e N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

75 percent of the respective design spectral response acceleration parameters Sps and
Sp; defined by the International Building Code.

| | TABLE 102.1.4.2
PERFORMANCE CRITERIA FOR REDUCED IBC LEVEL SEISMIC FORCES

CATEGORY | PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR | PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR
(Based on IBC USE WITH ASCE 31 USE WITH ASCE 41 BSE-1
Table 1604.5) EARTHQUAKE HAZARD
LEVEL

I Life safety (LS) Collapse prevention (CP)

1I Life safety (LS) Collapse prevention (CP)

I Notes a, b Note a

v Immediate occupancy (10) Immediate occupancy (IO)

a. Acceptance criteria for Occupancy Category III shall be taken as 80 percent of the acceptance

criteria specified for Occupancy Category II performance levels, but need not be less than the
acceptance criteria specified for Occupancy Category IV performance levels.

b. For Occupancy Category III, the ASCE 31 screening phase checklists shall be based onthe life
safety performance level. ‘

102.2 Modifications. The code official may modify the requirements of this code for individual
cases provided the code official finds: (1) there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out
the provisions of this code; (2) the modification is in conformity with the intent and purpose of
this code; and (3) the modification will provide a reasonable level of fire protection and
structural integrity when considered together with other safety features of the building or other
relevant circumstances. The code official may, but is not required to, record the approval of
modifications and any relevant information in the files of the code official or on the approved
permit plans.
102.3 Alternate Materials, Methods of Construction and Design. This code does not prevent
the use of any material, design or method of construction not specifically allowed or prohibited
by this code, provided the alternate has been approved and its use authorized by the code official.
The code official may approve an alternate, provided the code official finds that the proposed
alternate complies with the provisions of this code, and that the alternate, when considered
together with other safety features of the building or other relevant circumstances, will provide at
least an equivalent level of strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability, safety and
sanitation.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 6

o

ey
N

o




NeoREe S N e Y B \® B

NN NN N NN NN e e e e e e e
o < I e O o . = I o S - - B N e VLY, B N U0 S S =]

Maureen Traxler/MT )
DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

The code official may require that sufficient evidence or proof be submitted to reasonably
substantiate any claims regarding the use or suitability of the alternate. The code official may, but
is not required to, record the approval of modifications and any relevant information in the files
of the building official or on the approved permit plans.

Section 3. The following sections of Chapter 2 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

SECTION 201
GENERAL

ek

SECTION 202
_ GENERAL DEFINITIONS
ADDITION. An extension or increase in floor area, number of stories, or height of a building or
structure. A
ALTERATION. Any construction or renovation to an existing structure other than a repair or
addition. Alterations are classified as Level 1, Level 2, and Level 3.

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY. A change in the purpose.or level of activity within a building
that involves a change in application of the requ1rements of this code.

CODE OFFICIAL. The (( e i ini :
and-enforeement-of this-eode)) Dlrector of the Department of Plannlng and Development and
authorized representatives.

EQUIPMENT OR FIXTURE. Any plumblng, heatlng, electrical, Ventﬂatlng, air conditioning,
refrigerating, and fire protection equipment, and elevators, dumb waiters, escalators, boilers,
pressure vessels and other mechanical facilities or installations that are related to building
services. Equipment or fixture shall not include manufacturing, production, or process
equipment, but shall include connections from building service to process equipment.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 7

S
(%




O 0 Yy kW

NN NN NN N NN e = e e

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

EXISTING BUILDING. A building erected prior to the date of adoption of ((the-apprepriate))
this code, ((e£)) one for which a ((legal-building-permit)) valid Certificate of Occupancy has been
issued, or one that has passed a final inspection.,

[B] FLOOD HAZARD AREA. The greater of the following two areas:
1. The area within a flood plain subject to a 1-percent or greater chance of flooding in any year.

2. The area designated as a flood hazard area on a community’s flood hazard map, or otherwise
legally designated.

HISTORIC BUILDING ((AxﬁLbuﬂdmgefﬁme&m&Gh&Hs—hstedﬂfﬁh%&a%%%N&&eﬂ&l

Naﬁefhal—l?cegi-ster—ef—Hisffeﬁe—Piaees—)) A bulldln,q or structure that has been nomlnated for

designation under SMC 25.12.660 and the City Landmarks Preservation Board has not issued a
determination regarding designation, or has been designated for preservation by the City
Landmarks Preservation Board under SMC 25.12.660, that has been designated for preservation
by the State of Washington, has been listed or determined eligible to be listed in the National
Register of Historic Places, or is located in a landmark or special review district subjectto a
requirement to obtain a certificate of approval before making a change to the external appeatrance
of a structure.

LOAD BEARING ELEMENT. Any column, girder, beam, joist, truss, rafter, wall, floor or roof]
sheathing that supports any vertical load in addition to its own weight or any lateral load.

NONCOMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL. A material that, under the conditions anticipated, will not
ignite or burn when subjected to fire or heat. Materials that pass ASTM E 136 are considered
noncombustible materials. ’

PRIMARY FUNCTION. A primary function is a major activity for which the facility is
intended. Areas that contain a primary function include, but are not limited to, the customer
services lobby of a bank, the dining area of a cafeteria, the meeting rooms in a conference center,
as well as offices and other work areas in which the activities of the public accommodation or
other private entity using the facility are carried out. Mechanical rooms, boiler rooms, supply
storage rooms, employee lounges or locker rooms, janitorial closets, entrances, corridors and
restrooms are not areas containing a primary function.

REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE. A registered
design professional engaged by the owner to review and coordinate certain aspects of the project,
as determined by the code official, for compatibility with the design of the building or structure,
including submittal documents prepared by others, deferred submittal documents and phased
submittal documents.

REHABILITATION. Any work, as described by the categories of work defined herein,
undertaken in an existing building.

Form Last Revised on December 1.1, 2009 8

S

I
(8




O 0 3 N U bRk W N

o N N L NWN = OO NN W N = O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

REHABILITATION, SEISMIC. Work conducted to improve the seismic lateral force
resistance of an existing buzldmg

SEISMIC LOADING. The forces prescribed herein, related to the response of the structure to
earthquake motions, to be used in the analysis and design of the structure and its components.
SUBSTANTIAL ALTERATION. Alterations that are subject to Section 3404.9 of the
International Building Code.

[B] SUBSTANTIAL DAMAGE. For the purpose of determining compliance with the flood
provisions of this code, damage of any origin sustained by a structure whereby the cost of
restoring the structure to its before-damaged condition would equal or exceed 50 percent of the
market value of the structure before the damage occurred.

SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT. For the purpose of determining compliance with the flood
provisions of this code, any repair, alteration, addition, or improvement of a building or
structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the structure,
before the improvement or repair is started. If the structure has sustained substantial damage,
any repairs are considered substantial improvement regardless of the actual repair work
performed. The term does not, however, include either:

1. Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary, or
safety code violations identified by the code official and that is the minimum necessary to assure
safe living conditions, or

2. Any alteration of a historic structure, provided that the alteration will not preclude the
structure’s continued designation as a historic structure.

pufpese—aﬁd—}eeaﬂe&))

TECHNICALLY INFEASIBLE. An alteration of a building or a facility that has little
likelihood of being accomplished because the existing structural conditions require the removal
or alteration of a load-bearing member that is an essential part of the structural frame or because
other existing physical or site constraints prohibit modification or addition of elements, spaces,
or features that are in full and strict compliance with the minimum requirements for new '
construction and that are necessary to provide accessibility.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 9

o
T
@Qm\«




—

O 0 N N D BN

00 ~1 N B W N e OO0 NI Y R W N = O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

UNSAFE (( i

: h d-apa ' : — ed-unsafe:)) Structurally unsound
prov1ded Wlth 1nadequate egress constltutmg a ﬁre hazard or otherwise dangerous to human life

or constituting a hazard to safety, health or public welfare because of inadequate maintenance,
deterioration, instability, dilapidation, obsolescence, fire damage, abandonment or other causes.

WORK AREA. That portion or portions of a building consisting of all reconfigured spaces as
indicated on the construction documents. Work area excludes other portions of the building
where incidental work entailed by the intended work must be performed and portions of the
building where work not initially intended by the owner is specifically required by this code. The
boundary of the work area includes all spaces not physically separated from rooms or spaces
where work is being performed. ‘

Section 4. The following sections of Chapter 4 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 4
CLASSIFICATION OF WORK
SECTION 401
GENERAL

401.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall be used in conjunction with Chapters 5 through
10 and 12 and shall apply to the alteration, ((repeirs)) addition and change of occupancy of
existing structures, including ((histerie-and)) moved structures((-asreferenced-in-Section
101:5:2)). The work performed on an existing buzldmg shall be classified in accordance with this
chapter.
401.1.1 Compliance with other alternatives. Alterations, ((repairs)) additions and changes of
occupancy to existing structures shall comply with the provisions of Chapters 4 through 10 and
Chapter 12 or with one of the alternatives provided in Section ((+64-5)) 102.

hhk

SECTION 402
REPAIRS

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 10

5
CL%K




N o ") T e - ¥ N N

[\ NG TR NG TR NG T N TR NG T NG T N T N T S S S S e T S T T =
0 N1 SN R W=D YR I YN R W N = O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

402.2-Applieation:)) Repairs shall comply with the provisions of Chapter ((3)) 34 of the
International Building Code.

KRk

SECTION 405
ALTERATION—LEVEL 3
[W] 405.1 Scope. Level 3 alterations apply where the work area exceeds 50 percent of the
((aggregate)) floor area of the building.

khk

SECTION 408
HISTORIC BUILDINGS

408.1 Scope HlStOl‘lC bulldmgs ((pfevrsw&s)) shall complv with the Seattle Building Code.

EX X3

Section 5. The following sections of Chapter 6 of the International Existing Building '

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 6
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 1

SECTION 601
GENERAL
601.1 Scope. Level 1 alteratlons as descrlbed in Sectlon 403 shall comply w1th the requ1rements
of this chapter. ((evell-alte ne5-sh mslvowith th -
modified-in-Chapter H-))

hkk

SECTION 602
BUILDING ELEMENTS AND MATERIALS

Rk

602.4 Materials and methods. All new work shall comply with materials and methods

requirements in the International Building Code, (Futernationsl-Energy-Conservation-Code))

Washington State Energy Code with Seattle Amendments, International Mechanical Code, and
((International)) Uniform Plumbing Code, as applicable, that specify material standards, detail of

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 11

S
(&)
c,\m\&




W B W N

Mol )

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

installation and connection, joints, penetrations, and continuity of any element, component, or
system in the building.

Tkk

SECTION 604
MEANS OF EGRESS

604.1 General. Repairs shall ((be-done-in-a-meanner-thatmaintains-thelevel-of protection
provided for-the-means-ofegress)) comply with the International Building Code.

Hkk

SECTION 606
STRUCTURAL

ek

606.2 Addition or replacement of roofing or replacement of equipment. Where addition or
replacement of roofing or replacement of equipment results in additional dead loads, structural
components supporting such reproofing or equipment shall comply with the gravity load
requirements of the International Building Code. '

Exceptions:

1. Structural elements where the additional dead load from the roofing or equipment is not
increased by more than 5 percent.

2. Buildings constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code or the
conventional light-frame construction methods of the International Building Code and where the
dead load from the roofing or equipment is not increased by more than 5 percent.

3. Addition of a second layer of roof covering weighing 3 pounds per square foot (0.1437
kN/m?2) or less over an existing, single layer of roof covering.

606.3 Additional requirements for reroof permits. The requirements of this section shall apply
to alteration work requiring reroof permits.

606.3.1 Bracing for unreinforced masonry parapets. Where a permit is issued for rerooﬁng
more than 25 percent of the roof area of a building assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or
F that has parapets constructed of unreinforced masonry, the work shall include installation of
parapet bracing to resist the reduced International Building Code level seismic forces as
specified in Section ((164:5-4)) 102.1.4.1 of this code, unless an evaluation demonstrates
compliance of such items. :

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 12

0o
W
(Q\\E\Y\




O o ~ (@) 9] ~ w . N —

[\ ] [\ NN [\ [\ [\ [\ —_ — o [ — — — —_ [y —
[~ BN e A ) W - VS B S =N R - - BN B o) SR O, T S e =~

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

606.3.2 Roof diaphragms resisting wind loads in high wind regions. Where roofing materials
are removed from more than 50 percent of the roof diaphragm of a building or section of a
building located where the basic wind speed is greater than 90 mph or in a special wind region,
as defined in Section 1609 of the International Building Code, roof diaphragms and connections
that are part of the main wind-force resisting system shall be evaluated for the wind loads
specified in the International Building Code, including wind uplift. If the diaphragms and
connections in their current condition do not comply with those wind provisions, they shall be
replaced or strengthened in accordance with the loads specified in the Infernational Building
Code.

hkk

SECTION 607
ENERGY CONSERVATION

607. 1 Mlnlmum requlrements Level 1 alteratlons to ex1st1ng bu1ld1ngs or structures ((are

shall complv w1th the Washm,qton State Energy Code wzth Seattle Amendmenz‘s

Section 6. The following sections of Chapter 7 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 7 -
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 2

SECTION 701
GENERAL

khk

701.3 Compliance: All new construction elements, components, systems, and spaces shall
comply with the requirements of the International Building Code.
Exceptions:

1. Windows may be added w1thout requiring compliance with the light and ventilation
requirements of the Infernational Building Code.

2. Newly installed electrical equipment shall comply with the ((r-equemeﬂ%s—ef—Seeﬁeﬂq-OS))
Seattle Electrical Code.

3. The length of dead-end corridors in newly constructed spaces shall only be required to
comply with the provisions of Section 705.6.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 13

e
m
(&




Nl e e N I

10
1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
2
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

4. The minimum ceiling height of the newly created habitable and occupiable spaces and

corridors shall be 7 feet (2134 mm).

5. Automatic sprinkler systems are required when new dwelling units are added to buildings
according to Items 5.1 through 5.6 below. This exception is permitted to be used to add
one unit over the life of the building,

5.1 One unit is permitted to be added to a residential or commercial building without an
automatic sprinkler system unless sprinklers are otherwise required by this section. If
more than one unit is added, the new units shall be equipped with a sprinkler system.

52 In buildings that do not comply with the provisions of this code for number of stories,
allowable area, height or type of construction before the unit is added, an automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in the new unit. The addition of the new unit shall
not be allowed if it increases the nonconformity.

5.3 In buildings undergoing substantial alteration, an automatic sprinkler system is
required where required by this code for new construction.

5.4 One unit is permitted to be added to an existing duplex without an automatic sprinkler

system where both of the following conditions are met:
5.4.1 The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change in
occupancy; and
5.4.2 The building complies with the requirements for building height and number-of
stories for a Group R-2 occupancy. '
5.5 Where one unit is added to an existing duplex, sprinklers are required in the new unit
and not in the existing units where all of the following conditions are met:
5.5.1 The existing duplex does not comply with the requirements for building height
and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy;
5.5.2 The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change in
occupancys;
5.5.3 The new unit is constructed as an addition to the duplex;
5.5.4 The new unit is separated from the existing duplex by a fire wall; and
5.5.5 The addition by itself complies with the requirements for a Group R-2
occupancy.
5.6 A sprinkler system is not required when a Group U occupancy that is accessory to a

Group R-3 occupancy is converted to a dwelling unit.
’ Kk k

SECTION 704
FIRE PROTECTION

[W] 704.1 Scope. The requirements of this section shall be limited to work areas in which Level
2 alterations are being performed, and where specified they shall apply throughout the floor on
which the work areas are located or otherwise beyond the work area.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 14

)
1\




NolN- BN B R R " A \C R

NN NN NN NN N e e e e e e R e e e
w N U s W NN =D Y NN R WD~ O

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

Exception:, The fire code official may modify or waive the fire protection requirements for
Level 2 alteration projects in which the fire protection requirements constitute an excessive
burden.

704.1.1 Corridor ratings. Where an approved automatic sprinkler system is installed throughout
the story, the required fire-resistance rating for any corridor located on the story shall be
permitted to be reduced in accordance with the International Building Code. In order to be
considered for a corridor rating reduction, such system shall provide coverage for the stairwell
landings serving the floor and the intermediate landings immediately below.

[W] 704.2 Automatic sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in
accordance with the requirements of Sections 704.2.1 through 704.2.5. Installation requirements
shall be in accordance with the International ((Building-Cede)) Fire Code and NFPA 13 or NFPA

704.2.1 High-rise buildings. In high-rise buildings, work areas that have exits or cotridors
shared by more than one tenant or that have exits or corridors serving an occupant load greater
than 30 shall be provided with automatic sprinkler protection in the entire work area where the
work area is located on a floor that has a sufficient sprinkler water supply system from an
existing standpipe or a sprinkler riser serving that floor.

704.2.1.1 Supplemental automatic sprinkler system requirements. Where the work area on
any floor exceeds 50 percent of that floor area, Section 704.2.1 shall apply to the entire floor on
which the work area is located. '
Exception: Tenant spaces that are entirely outside the work area.

704.2.2 Groups A, B, E, F-1, H, I, M, R-1, R-2, R-4, S-1 and S-2. In buildings with
occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F-1, H, I, M, R-1, R-2, R-4, S-1 and S-2, work areas that have
exits or corridors shared by more than one tenant or that have exits or corridors serving an
occupant load greater than 30 shall be provided with automatic sprinkler protection where all of
the following conditions occur:

1. The work area is required to be provided with automatic sprinkler protection in accordance
with the International Building Code as applicable to new

construction;

2. The work area exceeds 50 percent of the floor area; and

3. The building has sufficient municipal water supply for design of a fire sprinkler system
available to the floor without installation of a new fire pump.

704.2.2.1 Mixed uses. In work areas containing mixed uses, one or more of which requires
automatic sprinkler protection in accordance with Section 704.2.2, such protection shall not be
required throughout the work area provided that the uses requiring such protection are separated
from those not requiring protection by fire-resistance-rated construction having a minimum 2-
hour rating for Group H and a minimum 1-hour rating for all other occupancy groups.

704.2.3 Windowless stories. Work located in a windowless story, as determined in accordance
with the International Building Code, shall be sprinklered where the work area is required to be

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 15

-
o
<§\§a&




O e N1 Yy i BW N e

N NN NN NN N Nk ke e e =
o I =) T e N U e S N = N~ B - - BN B o) S R S S T =)

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

sprinklered under the provisions of the International Building Code for newly constructed
buildings and the building has a sufficient municipal water supply without installation of a new
fire pump. ‘

704.2.4 Other required suppression systems. In buildings and areas listed in Table 903.2.11.6
of the International Building Code, work areas that have exits or corridors shared by more than
one tenant or that have exits or corridors serving an occupant load greater than 30 shall be
provided with sprinkler protection under the following conditions:

1. The work area is required to be provided with automatic sprinkler protection in accordance
with the International Building Code applicable to new construction; and

2. The building has sufficient municipal water supply for design of a fire sprinkler system
available to the floor without installation of a new fire pump.

704.2.5 Supervision. Fire sprinkler systems required by this section shall be supervised by one
of the following methods: '

1. Approved central station system in accordance with NFPA 72;
2. Approved proprietary system in accordance with NFPA 72;
3. Approved remote station system of the jurisdiction in accordance with NFPA 72; or

4. When approved by the code official, approved local alarm service that will cause the sounding
of an alarm in accordance with NFPA 72.

Exception: Supervision is not required for the following:
1. Underground gate valve with roadway boxes.

2. Halogenated extinguishing systems.

3. Carbon dioxide extinguishing systems.

4, Dry and wet chemical extinguishing systems.

5. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where a common
supply main is used to supply both domestic and automatic sprinkler systems and a separate

shutoff valve for the automatic sprinkler system is not provided.
Hkk

SECTION 707
STRUCTURAL

hhk

707.6 Voluntary lateral-force-resisting system alterations. Alterations of existing structural
elements and additions of new structural elements that are initiated for the purpose of increasing
the lateral-force-resisting strength or stiffness of an existing structure and that are not required by
other sections of this code shall not be required to be designed for forces conforming to the
International Building Code, provided that an engineering analysis is submitted to show that:

1. The capacity of existing structural elements required to resist forces is not reduced;

2. The lateral loading to existing structural elements is not increased either beyond their capacity
or more than 10 percent;

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 16

P

o
(3,

e




NN~ N B o S R - VS

NN NN NNNNN e e s e e e e e e
== IEEEN e &  NO O L E==N« T - - N B« U O, B SO UV O =)

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

3. New structural elements are detailed and connected to the existing structural elements as
required by the International Building Code;

4, New or relocated nonstructural elements are detailed and connected to existing or new
structural elements as required by the International Building Code; and

5. (A-dangerons)) An unsafe condition as defined in this code is not created. Voluntary
alterations to lateral-force-resisting systems conducted in accordance with Appendix A and the
referenced standards of this code shall be permitted.

707.7 Wall anchors for concrete and masonry buildings. Where more than 25 percent of the
roof sheathing will be replaced on a building assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F with

a structural system consisting of concrete or reinforced masonry walls with a flexible roof
diaphragm or unreinforced masonry walls with any type of roof diaphragms, the work shall
include installation of wall anchors at the roof line to resist the reduced International Building
Code level seismic forces as specified in Section 102.1.4.1 of this code and design procedures of
Section 102.1.4, unless an evaluation demonstrates compliance of existing wall anchorage.

SECTION 708
ELECTRICAL

708.1 Flectrical work. Electrical work in Level 2 alterations shall comply with the Seattle

Electrlcal Code ((Newmsta}laﬁeﬂs- Aﬂqwkymsieaﬂedeleetﬂeal—eqmpmeﬁt—&nd%ﬂﬂg

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 17




O 0 NN N O B W N

N NN NN NN NN e = e e s e e e e
o0 ~I O W kR W N =) OV NN Y AW O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

kN

SECTION 710
PLUMBING

710.1 Minimum fixtures. Where the occupant load of the story is increased by more than 20
percent, plumbing fixtures for the story shall be provided in quantities specified in the
((nternational)) Uniform Plumbing Code based on the increased occupant load.

SECTION 711
ENERGY CONSERVATION

711, 1 Mmlmum requlrements Level 2 alteratzons to ex1st1ng bulldlngs or structures ((are

shall complv w1th the Washzngton State Ener,qy Code wzth Seatﬂe Amendments

Section 7. The following sections of Chapter 8 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 8
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 3
E ]
SECTION 802
SPECIAL USE AND OCCUPANCY

802.1 High-rise buildings. Any building having occupied floors more than 75 feet (22 860 mm)
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall comply with the requirements of
Sections 802.1.1 and 802.1.2.
802.1.1 Recirculating air or exhaust systems. When a floor is served by a recirculating air or
exhaust system with a capacity greater than 15,000 cubic feet per minute (701 m3/s), that system

shall be equipped with approved smoke
and heat detection devices 1nstalled in accordance with the Internatzonal Mechanical Code.

802. 1 2 Elevators. (( Mhe

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 18

®




O 0 N N U R W N

NN N NN NN NN e e e e e e s
0 NN N n s W= O O NN Y W N = O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

accordanece-with-ASME-A171-)) Elevators and other conveyances sall comply with the
International Building Code.

ded
- s wie
Aded h-2ihago | omaataan
aged—w

.

ok ok

SECTION 803
BUILDING ELEMENTS AND MATERIALS

khk

803.2 Fire partitions in Group R-3. Fire separation in Group R-3 occupancies shall be in
accordance with Section 803.2.1.

803.2.1 Separation required. Where the work area is in any attached dwelling unit in Group R-
3 or any multiple single family dwélling (townhouse), walls separating the dwelling-units that are
not continuous from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing shall be constructed to
provide a continuous fire separation using construction materials consistent with the existing
wall or complying with the requirements for new structures. All work shall be performed on the |
side of the dwelling unit wall that is part of the work area.

Exception: Where alterationis ((ex+epeairs)) do not result in the removal of wall or ceiling
finishes exposing the structure, walls are not required to be continuous through concealed floor

spaces.
kohk

SECTION 807
STRUCTURAL

khk

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 19

s
W\




N R N = )V, B - Y

0 NN U R WD R DO NN Y WDy e O

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

SECTION 808
ENERGY CONSERVATION

808.1 Minimum requirements. Level 3 alterations to existi

ng buildings or structures ((are

Section 8. The following sections of Chapter 9 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 9
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY

SECTION 901
GENERAL
FEX
901.2 Change in occupancy with no change of occupancy classification. A change in
occupancy, as defined in Section 202, with no change of occupancy classification shall not be
made to any structure that will subject the structure to any special provisions of the applicable
International Codes, including the provisions of Sections 902 through 911, without the approval
of the code official. A certificate of occupancy shall be issued where it has been determined that
the requirements for the change in occupancy have been met.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 . 20

o
o
(8\;@\4




O 0 1 N Ut R~ WD =

N NN N NN N NN e e e e e el e e e
0 ~1 O W R W N e Y0 Yy e W N — O

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

901.2.1 ((Repair-and-alteration)) Alteration with no change of occupancy classification. Any
((repair-or-alteration)) work undertaken in connection with a change of occupancy that does not
involve a change of occupancy classification shall conform to the applicable requirements for the
work as classified in Chapter 4 and to the requirements of Sections 902 through 911.

(@ _ fified in Section 1L05for historic buildings.)

SECTION 907
STRUCTURAL

fkk

907.3 Seismic loads. Existing buildings with a change of occupancy shall comply with the
seismic provisions of Sections 907.3.1 and 907.3.2.

907.3.1 Compliance with the International Building Code level seismic forces. Where a
building or portion thereof is subject to a change of occupancy that results in the building being
assigned to a higher occupancy category based on Table 1604.5 of the International Building
Code; or where such change of occupancy results in a reclassification of a building to a higher
hazard category as shown in Table 912.4; or where a change of a Group M occupancy to a Group
A, E, I-1, R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancy with two-thirds or more of the floors involved in Level 3
alteration work, the building shall comply with the requirements for International Building Code
level seismic forces as specified in Section ((364-5-4-1)) 102.1.4.1 for the new occupancy
category.

Exceptions:

1. Group M occupancies being changed to Group A, E, I-1, R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancies for

buildings less than six stories in height and in Seismic Design Category A, B or C.

2. Where approved by the code official, specific detailing provisions required for a new
structure are not requlred to be met where it can be shown that an equivalent level of
performance and seismic safety is obtained for the applicable occupancy category based on
the provision for reduced International Building Code level seismic forces as specified in
Section ((160+5-4-2)) 102.1.4.1.

3, Where the area of the new occupancy with a higher hazard category is less than or equal to
10 percent of the total building floor area and the new occupancy is not classified as
Occupancy Category IV. For the purposes of this exception, buildings occupied by two or
more occupancies not included in the same occupancy category, shall be subject to the
provisions of Section 1604.5.1 of the International Building Code. The cumulative effect of
the area of occupancy changes shall be considered for the purposes of this exception.

4, Unreinforced masonry bearing wall buildings in Occupancy Category III when assigned to
Seismic Design Category A or B shall be allowed to be strengthened to meet the
requirements of Appendix Chapter Al of this code [Guidelines for the Seismic Retrofit of
Existing Buildings (GSREB)].

"|| Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 - 21 (\}%\{
‘ Q\ER\k




0 N N R WD

[\ [\ [\®] N NN N [\ [\ —_— —_ —_ —_ —_ —_ — [u— oy —_
0 NN N R W =R DO VL NN Yy RN~ O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

907.3.2 Access to Occupancy Category IV. Where a change of occupancy is such that
compliance with Section 907.3.1 is required and the building is assigned to Occupancy Category
IV, the operational access to the building shall not be through an adjacent structure, unless that
structure conforms to the requirements for Occupancy Category IV structures. Where operational
access is less than 10 feet (3048 mm) from either an interior lot line or from another structure,
access protection from potential falling debris shall be provided by the owner of the Occupancy
Category 1V structure. :

SECTION 908
ELECTRICAL

908.1 ((Speeial-oceupaneies)) Electrical work. Where the occupancy of an existing building or

part of an existing building is changed ((to-one-of thefollowing special-occupancies-as-deseribed
in NERA70,)) the electrical wiring and equipment of the building or portion thereof that contains

the pr oposed occupancy shall comply Wlth the apphcable requlrements of the Seattle Electrical

ke

SECTION 910
PLUMBING

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 ‘ 22

()




N R e Y B ~ N VS B\

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

910.1 Increased demand. Where the occupancy of an existing building or part of an existing
building is changed such that the new occupancy is subject to increased or different plumbing
fixture requirements or to increased water supply requirements in accordance with the
((nternational)) Uniform Plumbing Code, the new occupancy shall comply with the intent of the
respective International Building Code and Uniform Plumbing Code provisions.

910.2 Food-handling occupancies. If the new occupancy is a food-handling establishment, all
existing sanitary waste lines above the food or drink preparation or storage areas shall be panned
or otherwise protected to prevent leaking pipes or condensation on pipes from contaminating
food or drink. New drainage lines shall not be installed above such areas and shall be protected in

accordance with the ((Huternational)) Uniform Plumbing Code.
910.3 Interceptor required. If the new occupancy will produce grease or oil-laden wastes,
interceptors shall be provided as required in the ((Futernational)) Uniform Plumbing Code.

EX 3

910.5 Group I-2. If the occupancy group is changed to Group I-2, the plumbing system shall
comply with the applicable requitements of the ((futernational)) Uniform Plumbing Code.

Kkk

SECTION 912
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION

912.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to buildings or portions thereof
undergoing a change of occupancy classification. This includes a change of occupancy
classification within a group as well as a change of occupancy classification from one group to a
different group. Such buildings shall also comply with Sections 902 through 911. The application
of requirements for the change of occupancy shall be as set forth in Sections 912.1.1 through
912.1.4. A change of occupancy, as defined in Section 202, without a corresponding change of
occupancy classification shall comply with Section 901.2.

[W] 912.1.1 Compliance with Chapter 8. The requirements of Chapter 8 shall be applicable
throughout the building for the new occupancy classification based on the separation conditions
set forth in Sections 912.1.1.1 and 912.1.1.2._All existing buildings with a change of occupancy
classification shall comply with the seismic provisions of Section 907.3.

912.1.1.1 Change of occupancy classification without separation. Where a portion of an
existing building is changed to a new occupancy classification and that portion is not separated
from the remainder of the building with fire barriers having a fire-resistance rating as required in
the International Building Code for the separate occupancy, the entire building shall comply with
all of the requirements of Chapter 8 applied throughout the building for the most restrictive
occupancy classification in the building and with the requirements of this chapter.

912.1.1.2 Change of occupancy classification with separation. Where a portion of an existing
building that is changed to a new occupancy classification and that portion is separated from the
remainder of the building with fire barriers having a fire-resistance rating as required in the
International Building Code for the separate occupancy, that portion shall comply with all the

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 23

QLERE




O 0 N1 O i b W N e

N RN N NN NN N = e e e e e e e s
o0 ~J (@)Y (9,1 N w [\ —_ o O o0 ~] [@)) w B W [\ P o

'912.1.3 Change of occupancy classification based on hazard category The relative degree of

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

requirements of Chapter 8 for the new occupancy classification and with the requirements of this
chapter.

912.1.2 Fire protection and interior finish. The provisions of Sections 912.2 and 912.3 for fire
protection and interior finish, respectively, shall apply to all buildings undergoing a change of
occupancy classification.

hazard between different occupancy classifications shall be determined in accordance with the
category specified in Tables 912.4, 912.5 and 912.6. Such a determination shall be the basis for
the application of Sections 912.4 through 912.7.

912.1.4 Accessibility. All buildings undergoing a change of occupancy clas51ﬁcat10n shall
comply with Section 912.8.

912.2 Fire protection systems. Fire protection systems shall be provided in accordance with
Sections 912.2.1 and 912.2.2.

912.2.1 Fire sprinkler system. Where a change in occupancy classification occurs that requires
an automatic fire sprinkler system to be provided based on the new occupancy in accordance with
Chapter 9 of the International Building Code, such system shall be provided throughout the area
where the change of occupancy occurs.

Exception:

1. Subject to the approval of the building official, an automatic fire sprinkler system is not
required in dwelling units according to Items 1.1 through 1.6 below. This exception is
permitted to be used for the change in occupancy for one dwelling unit over the life of the

building.

1.1 The occupancy of one unit is permitted to be changed to a dwelling unit without an
automatic sprinkler system unless sprinklers are otherwise required by this chapter.
If more than one unit is changed, the new units shall be equipped with a sprinkler

system.

1.2 In buildings that do not comply with the provisions of this code for number of
stories, allowable area, height or type of construction before the occupancy of the
unit is changed, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in the new unit.
The change of occupancy shall not be allowed if it increases the nonconformity.

1.3 In buildings undergoing substantial alteration, an automatic sprinkler system shall
be installed where required by this code for new construction.

1.4 The occupancy of one unit is permitted to be changed to a dwelling unit in an
existing duplex without an automatic sprinkler system where both of the following
conditions are met;

1.4.1 The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change
“in occupancy; and
1.4.2 The building complies with the requirements for building height and number

of stories for a Group R-2 occupancy.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 24

Lo
N ‘\__:/%a(/\
==

i
\




© ® 3 o A W N

NN NN NN N NN ke e e e e e e e e
0w NN N R WD = O VNN Y R W N —m, O

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

1.5 Where the occupancy of one unit is changed to a dwelling unit in an existing
duplex, sprinklers are required in the new unit and not in the existing units where all

of the following conditions are met:
1.5.1 The existing duplex does not comply with the requirements fot building
height and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy;

1.5.2 The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change

in occupancy;
1.5.3 The new unit is constructed as an addition to the duplex;

1.5.4 The new unit is separated from the existing duplex by a fire wall; and
1.5.5 The addition by itself complies with the requirements for a Group R-2

occupancy.
1.6 A sprinkler system is not required when a Group U occupancy that is accessory to a
Group R-3 occupancy is converted to a dwelling unit,

912.2.2 Fire alarm and detection system. Where a change in occupancy classification occurs
that requires a fire alarm and detection system to be provided based on the new occupancy in
accordance with Chapter 9 of the Infernational Building Code, such system shall be provided
throughout the area where the change of occupancy occurs. Existing alarm notification
appliances shall be automatically activated throughout the building. Where the building is not
equipped with a fire alarm system, alarm notification appliances shall be provided throughout the
area where the change of occupancy occurs and shall be automatically activated.

b

Section 9. The following sections of Chapter 10 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 10
ADDITIONS
SECTION 1001
GENERAL

Kkk

1001.3 Other work. Any ((repair—ex)) alteration work within an existing building to which an
addition is being made shall comply with the applicable requirements for the work as classified
in Chapter 4.

kkk

SECTION 1003
STRUCTURAL

Kkk

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 ) 25

b
W
(&M




\O [*2] ~ N |91 S w N bt

[ NS T NG T N T NG TR N R N RN N6 TR NO B NG R e e e e e e e
0 ~1 O\ W B~ W N =D Y Ny e WD O

Mauteen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

1003.3 Lateral-force-resisting system. The lateral force-resisting system of existing buildings to
which additions are made shall comply with Sections 1003.3.1, 1003.3.2 and 1003.3.3.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings of Group R occupancy with no more than five dwelling or sleeping units used solely
for residential purposes where the existing building and the addition comply with the
conventional light-frame construction methods of the International Building Code or the
provisions of the International Residential Code.

2. In other existing buildings where the lateral-force story shear in any story is notincreased by
more than 10 percent cumulative.

1003.3.1 Vertical addition. Any element of the lateral-force-resisting system of an existing
building subjected to an increase in vertical or lateral loads from the vertical addition shall
comply with the International Building Code wind provisions and the Infernational Building
Code level seismic forces specified in Section ((+6454-1)) 102.1.4.1 of this code.

1003.3.2 Horizontal addition. Where horizontal additions are structurally connected to an
existing structure, all lateral-force-resisting elements of the existing structure affected by such
addition shall comply with the International Building Code wind provisions and the
International Building Code level seismic forces specified in Section (($64:5:4-1)) 102.1.4.1 of
this code.

1003.3.3 Voluntary addition of structural elements to improve the lateral-force-resisting.
system. Voluntary addition of structural elements to improve the Jateral-force-resisting system of]
an existing building shall comply with Section 707.6.

hhk
SECTION 1006
ADDITIONS OF DWELLING UNITS

1006.1 Automatic sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems are required when new
dwelling units are added to buildings according to Items 1 through 5 below. This provision i

permitted to be used to add one unit over the life of the building.

1. One unit is permitted to be added to a residential or commercial building without an
automatic sprinkler system unless sprinklers are otherwise required by this section.
If more than one unit is added, the new units shall be equipped with a sprinkler

system.

2. In buildings that do not comply with the provisions of this code for number of
stories, allowable area, height or type of construction before the unit is added, an
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in the new unit. The addition of the
new unit shall not be allowed if it increases the nonconformity.

3. In buildings undergoing substantial alteration, an automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed where required by this code for new construction.

4. One unit is permitted to be added to an existing duplex without an automatic
sprinkler system where both of the following conditions are met. ‘

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 26

oo
!




O 0 1 O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

4.1 The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change in
occupancy; and :

42  The building complies with the requirements for building height and number
of stories for a Group R-2 occupancy.

5. Where one unit is added to an existing duplex, sprinklers are required in the new unit

and not in the existing units where all of the following conditions are met:
5.1 The existing duplex does not comply with the requirements for building height

and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy;
5.2  The project is considered a substantial alteration only because of the change in

occupancy;
5.3  The new unit is constructed as an addition to the duplex;

5.4  The new unit is éeparated from the existing duplex by a fire wall; and
5.5 . The addition by itself complies with the requirements for a Group R-2

occupancy.
1006.1.1 Fire walls. An existing nonconforming building to which an addition is made is
permitted to exceed the height, number of stories and area specified for new buildings if a fire

wall is provided, the existing building is not made more nonconforming, and the addition
conforms to this code.

Section 10. The following sections of Chapter 12 of the International Existing Building
Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 12
RELOCATED OR MOVED BUILDINGS

SECTION 1201
GENERAL

1201.1 Scope. This chapter provides requirements for relocated or moved structures.

((1264:2-Conformance—The-builemg-shan-be-sate-tornuman-oceupancy determin

1201.2 Nonresidential buildings or structures. Nonresidential buildings or structures moved

into or within the city shall comply with standards adopted by the building official. The building
official is authorized to require an inspection of the building before or after moving. The permit
holder shall correct all deficiencies identified by the inspection. The building official is
authorized to require that a bond or cash deposit in an amount sufficient to abate or demolish the

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 27

s
1\
<§§§f§\




O 0 N1 Oy R LN =

N NN N NN N N N M e e ek e e et e e e
R NN R W= O NN SN W N~ O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

building be posted prior to issuance of a permit. See Section 106 for information required on
plans. Any moved building that is not in complete compliance with standards for moved
buildings within eighteen months from the date of permit issuance and is found to be a public
nuisance may be abated.

1201.3 Residential buildings or structures. Residential buildings or structures moved into or
within the city are not required to comply with all of the requirements of this code if the original
occupancy classification of the building or structure is not changed. Compliance with chapter 12
will be required if the moved residential buildings or structures undergo substantial alteration.
Work performed on new and existing foundations shall comply with all of the requirements of

this code for new construction.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 28

B\
W
()




O 0 N o i A W N e~

NN NN N N D NN s s m e e e e
[~*- T e "\, T - VS B N6 T = o R - - BN B e ) Y T NS L e =~

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

Section 11. The following sections of Chapter 13 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, are amended as follows:

CHAPTER 13
PERFORMANCE COMPLIANCE METHODS

SECTION 1301
GENERAL

1301.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to the alteration, ((repeir;)) addition
and change of occupancy of existing structures, including ((histerie-and)) moved structures, as
referenced in Section ((164:5-3)) 102.1.3. The provisions of this chapter are intended to maintain
or increase the current degree of public safety, health and general welfare in existing buildings
while permitting ((repairs)) alteration, addition and change of occupancy without requiring full
compliance with Chapters 4 through 10 and Chapter 12, except where compliance with other

provisions of this code is specifically required in this chapter.

1301.1.1 Compliance with other methods. Alterations, ((repeirs)) additions and changes of
occupancy to existing structures shall comply with the provisions of this chapter or with one of

the methods provided in Section ((364-5)) 102.
[B] 1301 2 Apphcablllty ((MWM%%M

>

alteratzons ((ef)) and changes of occupancy shall be made to conform to the requirements of this
chapter or the provisions of Chapters 4 through 10 and Chapter 12. The provisions of Sections
1301.2.1 through 1301.2.5 shall apply to existing occupancies that will continue to be, or are
proposed to be, in Groups A, B, E, F, M, R, and S. These provisions shall not apply to buildings
with occupancies in Group H or Group L.

[B] 1301.2.1 Change in occupancy. Where an existing building is changed to a new occupancy
classification and this section is applicable, the provisions of this section for the new occupancy
shall be used to determine compliance with this code.

[B] 1301.2.2 Partial change in occupancy. Where a portion of the bu11d1ng is changed to a new
occupancy classification and that portlon is separated from the remainder of the building with fire

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 29

i
i
(@m«




O &0 N N B W N

NN NN N N NNN e e e e e e e e
W NN N R WY R, DO YN YN W N e O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

barrier wall assemblies having a fire-resistance rating as required by Table 508.4 of the
International Building Code or Section R317 of the International Residential Code for the
separate occupancies, or with approved compliance alternatives, the portion changed shall be
made to conform to the provisions of this section.

Where a portion of the building is changed to a new occupancy classification and that portion
is not separated from the remainder of the building with fire separation assemblies having a fire-
resistance rating as required by Table 508.4 of the International Building Code or Section R317
of the International Residential Code for the separate occupancies, or with approved compliance
alternatives, the provisions of this section which apply to each occupancy shall apply to the entire
building. Where there are conflicting provisions, those requirements which secure the greater
public safety shall apply to the entire building or structure.

[B] 1301.2.3 Additions. Additions to existing buildings shall comply with the requirements of
the International Building Code, International Residential Code, and this code for new
construction. The combined height and area of the existing building and the new addition shall
not exceed the height and area allowed by Chapter 5 of the International Building Code. Where a
fire wall that complies with Section 706 of the Infernational Building Code is provided between
the addition and the existing building, the addition shall be considered a separate building.

[B] 1301.2.4 Alterations ((and-repairs)). An existing building or portion thereof that does not
comply with the requirements of this code for new construction shall not be altered ((ex
repaired)) in such a manner that results in the building being less safe or sanitary than such
building is currently. If, in the alteration ((ex+epeir)), the current level of safety or sanitation is
to be reduced, the portion altered ((er-+epaired)) shall conform to the requirements of Chapters 2
through 12 and Chapters 14 through 33 of the International Building Code.

[B] 1301.2.5 Accessibility requirements. All portions of the buildings proposed for change of
occupancy shall conform to the accessibility provisions of International Building Code Section
((36%)) 3411. .

[B] 1301.3 Acceptance. The building code official shall evaluate compliance with this section
for ((Eeic Fepﬁ—}FS—)) alteratlons addmons and changes of occupancy to ex1st1ng bulldlngs ((-‘elﬁm{c

[B] 1301.3.1 Hazards Where the code official determines that an unsafe condition exists ((as
providedforin-Section116)), such unsafe condition shall be abated in accordance with ((Seetien
116)) the International Building Code.

[B] 1301.3.2 Compliance with other codes. Buildings that are evaluated in accordance with this

section shall comply with the International Fire Code ((and-International-Property-Maintenance

Code)).
[B] 1301.3.3 Compliance with flood hazard provisions. ((o-flood-hazard-areas;buildings))

Buildings located in flood hazard areas that are evaluated in accordance with this section shall
comply with Section 1612 of the International Building Code if the work covered by this section

constitutes substantial improvement.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 30

s
C&&\«




OO0 1 N R W N e

NN NN NN N NN e s s e e e e el e
0 N Oy W R WD = O N Y R W N~ O

Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

ok ok

[B] 1301.6.11 Means-of-egress capacity and number. Evaluate the means-of-egress capacity
and the number of exits available to the building occupants. In applying this section, the means
of egress are required to conform to the following sections of the International Building Code:

1003.7, 1004, 1005.1, 1014.2, 1014.3; 1015.2, 1021, 1025.1, 1027.2, 1027.6, 1028.2, 1028.3,
1028.4 and 1029. [except that the minimum width required by this section shall be determined
solely by the width for the required capacity in accordance with Table 1301.6.11(1)]. The number
of exits credited is the number that is available to each occupant of the area being evaluated.
Existing fire escapes shall be accepted as a component in the means of egress when conforming
to Section 705.3.1.2. Under the categories and occupancies in Table 1301.6.11(2), determine the
appropriate value and enter that value into Table 1301.7 under Safety Parameter 1301.6.11,
Means-of-Egress Capacity, for means of egress and general safety.

[B] 1301.6.11.1 Categories. The categories for means-of-egress capacity and number of exits
are:

1. Category a—Compliance with the minimum required means-of-egress capacity or number of
exits is achieved through the use of a fire escape in accordance with International Building Code
Section ((395)) 3406.

2. Category b—Capacity of the means of egtess complies with Section 1004 of the International
Building Code, and the number of exits complies with the minimum number required by Section
1021 of the International Building Code.

3. Category c—Capacity of the means of egress is equal to or exceeds 125 percent of the required
means-of-egress capacity, the means of egress complies with the minimum required width
dimensions specified in the International Building Code, and the number of exits complies with
the minimum number required by Section 10210of the International Building Code.

4. Category d—The number of exits provided exceeds the number of exits required by Section
1021 of the International Building Code. Exits equal to not less than that specified in Section
1015.2 of the International Building Code.

5. Category e—The area being evaluated meets both Categories ¢ and d.
Kok ok

Section 12. The following section of Chapter 15 of the International Existing Building

Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:

CHAPTER 15
REFERENCED STANDARDS

This chapter lists the standards that are referenced in various sections of this document. The
standards are listed herein by the promulgating agency of the standard, the standard
identification, the effective date and title, and the section or sections of this document that

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 31

s




N R e Y A

NN N NN NN NN e s e e el = e
0 N N W R W= O Y e NN Yy R WD~ O

Maureen Traxlet/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

reference the standard. The application of the referenced standards shall be as specified in
Section ((1624)) 101.5.

Section 13. Sections 2-13 of Ordinance 122529 are repealed.

Section 14. The provisions of this ordinance are declared to be separate and severable.

The invalidity of any clause, sentence, paragraph, subdivision, section or portion of this

ordinance, or the invalidity of the application thereof to any person, owner, or circumstance shall
not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance, or the validity of its application to other
persons, owners, or circumstances. |

Section 15. For a period of 60 days following the effective date of this ordinance, the
Director may accept and theréafter approve applications that are designed to comply with the
requirements of Ordinance 122529.

Section 16. This ordinance shall tal;e effect énd be in force 30 days from and after its
approval by the Mayor, but if not approved and returned by the Mayor within ten days after

presentation, it shall take effect as provided by Seattle Municipal Code Section 1.04.020.

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 32

W\
(i

Sy




© ®© N N W A W N e~

N N NN N NN NN e e = e e et b ek e
0 NN N R W m O VNN R W N O

Maureen Traxlert/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code ORD
June 2, 2010

Version #4

Passed by the City Council the \ !Q“\ day of A\ Xt) sl , 2010, and

signed by me in open session in authentication of its passage this

" day of A\)QJOST‘/ ,2010.
%/// //w/ _

Président  of the City Council

A
Approved by me this 2:2 /day of Ké/ [ ~/<” 7 , 2010.

WMAQ*

Michael McGinn, Mayor

| o |
Filed by me this <3 day of Au% 0s) ,2010.

mm\\

-

/‘

/}}/)’%m V}/ ( f/W%W
City Clerk

(Seal)

Form Last Revised on December 11, 2009 33

(@i&\%

——

%)




Maureen Traxler/MT ’ t.
DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code FISC.doc

June 18, 2010
Version #1
Form revised June 11, 2010
FISCAL NOTE FOR NON-CAPITAL PROJECTS
Department: Contact Person/Phone: DOF Analyst/Phone:
| DPD | Maureen Traxler/233-3892 | Amanda Allen/684-8894 [
Legislation Title:

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle Existing Building Code, amending Chapter 22.110 to
the Seattle Municipal Code to adopt by reference the 2009 International Existing Building Code;
amending chapters 2, 4, 6 through 10, and chapters 12, 13 and 15 and Appendix A, adopting a
new Chapter 1 related to administration, permitting and enforcement; and repealing Sections 2-
13 of Ordinance 122529.

e Summary of the Legislation: This bill adopts the 2009 Seattle Existing Building
Code. It is one of six coordinated bills that regulate construction and use of buildings
in Seattle. Five are prepared by the Department of Planning and Development (DPD):
the Seattle Building, Residential, Mechanical, Fuel Gas, and Existing Building codes.
The Fire Department is transmitting another bill adopting the 2009 Fire Code. These
codes are the current state and national standards for building construction. A bill
adopting the 2009 Seattle Energy Code has been delayed due to actions by the State
Building Code Council. '

e Background: These codes are adopted by the State, and State law requires local
jurisdictions to enforce them. Seattle adds local amendments to the State codes. (A detailed
list of Seattle amendments is attached.) The Construction Codes Advisory Board (CCAB)
has approved these proposed ordinances. CCAB, which consists of representatives of the
general public, and design, development and construction industries, has devoted countless
hours to reviewing and discussing these proposals. A draft of the Seattle Existing Building
Code was made available for public comment in November 2009. There is substantial
consensus about this ordinance.

o Please check one of the following:

X This legislation does not have any financial implications. .

Attachment 1: Changes in Seattle Amendments—2009 Seattle Existing Building Code

-

i » ( %
_ RS




Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code FISC ATTACHMENT.doc
June 18, 2010

Version #1

Changes in Seattle Amendments—2009 Seattle Existing Building Code

Note: This list includes changes proposed for the Seattle amendments to the International
Existing Building Code. Amendments that are carried forward from the 2006 Seattle Existing
Building Code are not listed; nor are differences between the 2006 and 2009 editions of the
International Existing Building Code listed. :

Chapter 1 Administration

101.2 The provision that, in the 2006 SEBC, required repairs of earthquake-damaged buildings
to comply with the SBC is expanded to include all repairs regardless of the cause of the damage.

Chapter 3 Prescriptive Compliance Method

None of Chapter 3 is adopted because it simply repeats Chapter 34 of the International Building
Code. Thus, rather than repeat the Seattle Building Code amendments in Chapter 3 of the
Existing Building Code, DPD is proposing to not adopt it again here.

Chapter 5 Repairs

Chapter 5 is not adopted as part of the Seattle Existing Building Code. Rather, repairs are
required to comply with the requirements of the SBC which were developed to address repair of
damage by earthquake and other causes. References to “repairs” are deleted throughout the
SEBC, or are replaced with cross references to the SBC.

Chapter 6 Alterations—Level 1

606.2.1 This ordinance deletes from Chapter 6 a new IEBC provision requiring installation of
wall anchors at the roof line of buildings of certain types of construction that are being reroofed.
The provision is moved to Chapter 7 and applied when more than 25 percent of the roof
sheathing is being replaced. DPD believes this a more appropriate trigger for this requirement
than the reroofing trigger in Chapter 6.

Chapter 7 Alterations—Level 2

701.3 Provisions from the Seattle Building Code are repeated in the SEBC. These provisions
specify when sprinkler systems are required when dwelling units are added to existing buildings.

Chapter 8 Alterations—Level 3

802.1.2 IEBC provisions are replaced with a requirement that elevators in buildings being
altered comply with the Building Code.

Attachment 1 to the DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code FISC.doc

s
i




Maureen Traxler/MT

DPD 2009 Existing Bidg Code FISC ATTACHMENT.doc
June 18, 2010

Version #1

Chapter 9 Change of Occupancy

912.2.1 Provisions from the Seattle Building Code are repeated in the SEBC. These provisions
specify when sprinkler systems are required when occupancies are changed to create dwelling
units in existing buildings.

Chapter 10 Additions

1006.1 Provisions from the Seattle Building Code are repeated in the SEBC. These provisions
specify when sprinkler systems are required when dwelling units are added to existing buildings.

Chapter 12 Relocated or Moved Buildings

1201 IEBC provisions for moved buildings are replaced with provisions from the Seattle
Building Code.

Chapter 13 Performance Compliance Methods

IEBC Chapter 13 is the same as IBC Section 3412, In several sections, amendments are added to
make the IEBC consistent with the SBC. ‘

Attachment 1 to the DPD 2009 Existing Bldg Code FISC.doc

@6




City of Seattle
Office of the Mayor

July 6,2010

Honorable Richard Conlin
President

Seattle City Council

City Hall, 2™ Floor

Dear Council President Conlin:

I am pleased to transmit the attached proposed Council Bill that adopts the 2009 Seattle Existing Building
Code. It is one of six coordinated bills that regulate construction and use of buildings in Seattle. Five are
prepared by the Department of Planning and Development (DPD): the Seattle Building, Residential,
Mechanical, Fuel Gas, and Existing Building codes. The Fire Department is transmitting another bill
adopting the 2009 Fire Code. These codes are the current state and national standards for building
construction. A bill adopting the 2009 Seattle Energy Code has been delayed due to actions by the State
Building Code Council.

These codes are adopted by the State, and State law requires local jurisdictions to enforce them. Seattle
adds local amendments to the State codes. (A detailed list of Seattle amendments is attached to the fiscal
note for this legislation.) The Construction Codes Advisory Board (CCAB) has approved these proposed
ordinances. CCAB, which consists of representatives of the general public, and design, development and
construction industries, has devoted countless hours to reviewing and discussing these proposals. The draft
of the Seattle Existing Building Code was made available for general public comment in November 2009.
There is substantial consensus about this ordinance.

Thank you for your consideration of this legislation. Adoption of the new codes will provide additional
flexibility of building design and will enhance safety for the citizens of Seattle. Should you have questions,
please contact Maureen Traxler at 233-3892.

Sincerely,

Michael Mc i(—\ Cﬁw ’

Mayor of Seattle

cc: Honorable Members of the Seattle City Council

Michael McGinn, Mayor '
Office of the Mayor Tel (206) 684-4000

600 Fourth Avenue, 7" Floor Fax (206) 684-5360 T
PO Box 94749 TDD (206) 615-0476  / v
Seattle, WA 98124-4749 mike.mcginn@seattle.gov | {j?{

i

F el
=
i




STATE OF WASHINGTON - KING COUNTY

~=88S.

259838 No.
CITY OF SEATTLE,CLERKS OFFICE

Affidavit of Publication

The undersigned, on oath states that he is an authorized representative of The Daily Journal of
Commerce, a daily newspaper, which newspaper is a legal newspaper of general circulation and it is now
and has been for more than six months prior to the date of publication hereinafter referred to, published in
the English language continuously-as a daily newspaper in Seattle, King County, Washington, and it is now
and during all of said time was printed in an office maintained at the aforesaid place of publication of this
newspaper. The Daily Journal of Commerce was on the 12™ day of June, 1941, approved as a legal
newspaper by the Superior Court of King County.

The notice in the exact form annexed, was published in regular issues of The Daily Journal of
Commerce, which was regularly distributed to its subscribers during the below stated period. The annexed
notice, a ‘

CT:123379 ORDINANCE
was published on
09/01/10

e
-

The amount of the fee charged for the for;gg\i{lg pub/ljgaxtio 1s the sum of $2,852.85, which
amount has been, paid in full, { T ‘i o

Nbtary public for the State of Washington,
residing in Seattle

Affidavit of Pﬁbliéa ion




City of Seattle

ORDINANCE M

AN ORDINANCE relating to the Seattle
Existing Building Code, amending Chapter
22.110 to the Seattle Municipal Code fto :
adopt by reference the 2009 International
Existing Building Code; amending chapters
2, 4, 6 through 10, and chapters 12, 13 and
16 and Appendix A, adopting a new Chapter .
1 related to administration; permitting and
enforcement; and repealing Sections 2-13 of
Oxdinance 122629,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF
SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS: '

Section 1. Section 22.110.010 of the
Seattle Municipal Code, which section was

. last amended by Ordinance 122529, is
. amended ds follows;

22.110.010 Adoption of International
Existing Building Cods(())

The Seattle Existing Building Cade con-

| sists of the following portions of the ((26086))
2009 edition of the Intaérnational Existing

. Building Code (( ;
2 through 10, Chapters 12, 13, 16, ond.

i1)): Chapters
Appendix A, together with Chapter 1 and

. the amendments and additions adopted by
~ordinance. One copy of the 8(2996)) 2009

International Existing Buil ing Code is
filed with the City Clerk in C.F. ((368937))
310928.

Section 2. The following is adopted as

i Chapter 1 of the Seattle Existing Building

. the Seattle Building Code.

- Code and reads as follows:

Chapter 1

ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 101 ‘
GENERAL

|
101.1 Title, This subtitle shall he known
as the “Seattle Existing Building Cods.” i

101.2 Applicability. If requested by
the permit applicant, this code applies ag a
code alternate to Chapter 34 of the Seattle
Building Code for alteration, change of ocet:

ancy, relocation of and additions to existing
uildings as defined in Chapter 2.

Exceptions: :
1. Buildings within the scope of the

International Residential Code shall comply .
with the International Residential Code.

2. Buildings undergoing substantial
alteration as defined in the Seattle Building

: Cuge shall comply with the Seattle Building

Code.

3. Repairs shall comply with the Seattle
Building Code. i

4. Historic buildings shall comply with
S

101.2.1 Compliance with other codes. |
Although this code may apply as an alternate “
to Chapter 34 of the Seattls Building Code for |

- alterations, changesof occupancey, relocation !
- and additions to certain existing buildings,

compliarice with the applicable provisions of
other codes, including but not limited to the |

. Washington State Energy Code with Secattle
. Amendments and the Seattle Electrical Code,
. isalso required.

[W] 101.2.2 Fire prevention. Except as
specifically provided for in this Code; the pro-!

.. visions of the International Fire Code shall |

apply to matters affecting or relating to struc- |
tures, processes gnd premises regarding: |

1. The hazard of fire and explosion aris: |

_ing from the storage, handling or use of strue-

tures, materials or devices;

2. conditions hazardous to life, property.
or public welfare'in the occupancy of struc::

tures or premises; and |

3. the construction, extension, repair; |
alteration or removal of fire suppression and
alarm systems or fire hazards in the struc:
ture or on the premises from oceupancy or |
operation. i

[W] 101.2.3 Buildings not previously:
occupied. A building or portion of a build-
ing that has not béen previously occupied or
used for its intended purpose in accordance
with the laws in existence at the time of its
completion shall comply with the provisions
of the International Building Code for new [
construction or with any current permit for |
such occupancy, i

101.2.4 Buildings previously occu-
pied, The legal occiipancy of any building
existing on the date of adoption of this code
is permitted to continue without change, |
except as sKecificaIly provided otherwise in
this code, the International Fire Code, or the :
Seattle Housing and Building Maintenance |
Code, or ns deemed necessary by the code




official to correct an unsafe building. For the
purpose of this section, “unsafe building” is
not a mere lack of compliance with the cur-
rent code.

101,3 Purpose.

101.8.1 General. The purpose of this
code is to provide minimum standards to
safeguard life or limb, health, property and
public welfare by regulating and controlling
the design, construction, quality of materials,
occupancy, location and maintenance of cer-
tain existing buildings and structures with-
in the City and certain equipment in those
buildings, as specifically regulated herein.

101.3.2 Protection of the public. The
purpose of this code is to provide for and pro-
mote the health, safety and welfare of the
'general public, and not to create or otherwise
\establish or designate any particular class or

group of persons who will or should be espe-
cially protected or benefited by the terms of
‘this code.

i
,  101.3.3 Flexibility, The intent of this
icode is to provide flexibility for the use of
|alternative approaches to achieve compli-
jance with minimum requirements to safe-
rguard the public health, safety and welfare
insofar as they are affected by the alteration,
change of occupancy, addition and relocation
:of certain existing buildings.

101.4 Internal Consistenecy, If in any
.specific case, different sections of this code
specify different materials, methods of con-
struction or other requirements, the most
'restrictive governs. If there is a conflict
‘hetween a general requirement and a spe-
cific requirement, the specific requirement
applies.

101.5 Referenced codes. The codes and
standards referenced in this code are consid-
ered part of the requirements of this code to
the extent prescribed by each such reference.
If differences occur between provisions of this
code and referenced codes and standards, the
provisions of this code apply.

101.6 Appendices. Provisions in the
appendices of the International Existing
Building Code do not apply unless specifi-
cally adopted as part of this code with the
exception of Appendix A, which is herein
adopted.

101.7 Metric units. Wherever in this
ordinance there is a conflict between metric
units of measurement and English units, the
English units govern.

101.8 Impracticality. In cases where
total compliance with all the requirements
of this code is impractical, the applicant
may arrange a pre-design conference with
the design team and the code official. The
applicant shall identify design solutions and
modifications that conform to Section 102.2
or 102.3. The code official may waive specif-
ic requirements in this code, which the code
official determines to be impractical.

101.9 References to other codes,
Whenever an International, National or
Uniform Code is referenced in this code, it
means the Seattle edition of that code, includ-
ing local amendments. References to the
“Building Code”, “Residential Code”, “Fire
Code”, “Mechanical Code” and “Plumbing
C(zide" mean the Seattle editions of those
codes.

SECTION 102
COMPLIANCE METHODS

102.1 Compliance methods, The addi-
tion to or alteration, change of occupancy, or
relocation of existing buildings shall comply
with one of the methods listed in Sections
102.1.1 through 102.1.3 selected by the appli-
cant. Sections 102.1,1 through 102,1,3 shall
not be applied in combination with each other.
Where this code requires consideration of the
geismic-force-resisting system of an exisi-
ing building subject to alteration, change of
occupancy, addition or relocation of existing
buildings, the seismic evaluation and design
shall be based on Section 102.1.4 regardless
of which compliance method is used.

Exception: Subject to the as)proval of
the code official, alterations complying with
the laws in existence at the time the build-
ing or the affected portion of the building
was built shall be considered in compliance
with the provisions of this code unless the
building is undergoing a substantial alter-
ation. New structural members added as
part of the alteration shall comply with the
International Building Code. Alterations of
existing buildings in flood hazard areas shall
comply with Section 601.3.

102.1.1 Prescriptive compliance
method, To use the prescriptive compliance
method, the repairs, alterations, additions,
changes of occupancy and relocated build-
ings shall comply with Seattle Building Code
Chapter 34.

)
3 102.1.2 Work area compliance meth-
. od., To use the work area compliance method,
p the alterations, additions, changes of occu-
i pancy and relocated buildings shall comply
wié;h Chapters 4-10 and Chapter 12 of this
€1 code,

| 102.1.3 Pexformance compliance

mrathnd Mo uan the mosfavesanca complicaaa

j

4. Compliance with ASCE 41 using the
BSE-1 Earthquake Hazard Level and the
performance level shown in Table 102.1.4.2.
The design spectral response acceleration
parameters SXS and SX1 specified in ASCE
41 shall not be taken less than 75 percent of
the respective design spectral response accel-
eration parameters SDS and SDI defined by
the International Building Code.

TABLE 102.1.4.2

PERFORMANCE CRITERIA FOR
REDUCED IBC LEVEL SEISMIC

CES

CATEGORY (Based on IBC Table 1604.5)
--PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR USE WITH
ASCE 31 -- PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR
USE WITH ASCE 41 BSE.1 EARTHQUAKE
HAZARD LEVEL

1 .. Life safety (L)
CP)

-- Collapse preven-
tion (!

11 -- Life safety (LS) -- Collapse preven-
tion (CP)

II1-- Notes a, b .- Note a

IV -- Immediate occupancy (I0) --
Immediate occupancy (I0) -

a. Acceptance criteria for Occupancy
Category III shall be taken as 80 per-
cent of the acceptance criteria specified for
Occupancy Category II performance levels,
but need not be less than the acceptance cri-
teria specified for Occupancy Category IV
performance levels.

b. For Occupancy Category III, the ASCE
31 screening phase checklists shall be based
on the life safety performance level.

102.2 Modifications. The code official
may modify the requirements of this code
for individual cases provided the code offi-
cial finds: (1) there are practical difficulties
involved in carrying out the provisions of this
code; (2) the modification is in conformity
with the intent and purpose of this code; and
(3) the medification will provide a reasonable
level of fire protection and structural integri-
ty when considered together with other safe-
ty features of the building or other relevant
circumstances. The code official may, but is
not required to, record the approval of modi-
fications and any relevant information in the
files of the code official or on the approved
permit plans,

102.3 Alternate Materials, Methods of
Construction and Design. This code does
not prevent the use of any material, design
or method of construction not specifically
allowed or prohibited by this code, provided
the alternate has been approved and its use
authorized by the code official.

The code official may approve an alter-
nate, provided the code official finds that the
proposed alternate complies with the pro-
visions of this code, and that the alternate,
when considered together with other safety
features of the building or other relevant cir-
cumstances, will provide at least an equiva-
lent level of strength, effectiveness, fire resis-
tance, durability, safety and sanitation.

The code official may require that suffi-
cient evidence or proof be submitted to rea-
sonably substantiate any claims regarding
the use or suitability of the alternate. The
code official may, but is not required to,
record the approval of medifications and an
relevant information in the files of the build-
ing official or on the approved permit plans.

Section 3. The following sections of
Chapter 2 of the International Existing
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amende
as follows:

CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS
SECTION 201

GENERAL
wkh

SECTION 202
GENERAL DEFINITIONS

ADDITION. An extension or increase in
floor area, number of stories, or height of a
building or structure.

ALTERATION. Any construction or ren-
ovation to an existing structure other than a
repair or addition. Alterations are classified
as Level 1, Level 2, and Level 3,

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY, A change
in the purpose or level of activity within a
building that involves a change in application
of the requirements of this code.

CODE OFFICIAL., The ((officer—or
- s th-t}

other-designate

ind reemont-of thiscode))
Director of the Department of Planning and
Development and authorized representa-
tives.

(PANGEROUS—Anyhuilding;—strue-
ture-or-portionth fthat-meets-any-of the
cﬁn&itionrd:scﬁf:?he}ow—s;:ﬂ—he-deemed
dangerots: :
partiallycollapseds moved-offits foundation

[B] SUBSTANTIAL DAMAGE. For the
purpose of determining compliance with the
flood provisions of this code, damage of any
origin sustained by a structure whereby the
cost of restoring the structure to its before-
damaged condition would equal or exceed 50
percent of the market value of the structure
before the damage occurred.

SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT. For
the purpose of determining compliance with
the flood provisions of this code, any repair,
alteration, addition, or improvement of a
building or structure, the cost of which equals
or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of
the structure, before the improvement or
repair is started. If the structure has sus-
tained substantial damage, any repairs are

idered substantial impr ent regard-
less of the actual repair work performed, The
term does not, however, include either:

1. Any project for improvement of a build-
ing required to correct existing health, sani-
tary, or safety code violations identified by
the code official and that is the minimum
necessary to assure safe living conditions,
or

2. Any alteration of a historic structure,
provided that the alteration will not preclude
the structure’s continued designation as a
historic structure,

SUBSTANTIAL—STRUCTURAL

T—Enany-story;the-vertical-elements—of
hel T for e e ] :
fered-damagesuch-that-the-lateralload-car-
A e ottt A ot
ntal-direetion-has-been-reduced-by-more

tion;or
4 y i i t ry

i 4+
TIyH OY & roup—ot
B ) 34 g 241

pose-and-location:))

TECHNICALLY INFEASIBLE. An
alteration of a building or a facility that
has little likelihood of being accomplished
because the existing structural conditions °
require the removal or alteration of a load-
bearing member that is an essential part of 5,
the structural frame or because other exist- 1y
ing physical or site constraints prohibit mod. |,
ification or addition of elements, spaces, or
features that are in full and strict compliance
with the minimum requirements for new con-
struction and that are necessary to provide

accessibility. e

UNSAFE. ((Buildings,—structures—or 8
equipment-that-are-unsanitary,or-that-are 3
deficient-due to-inadequate-meansof egress «

cturat-nrem-

bers-mee it = For
. i g . + i 5
or—bhe—pubhcwe}farererﬂ?ahnvo}wﬂiegﬂ[

H ;
emed—unsafer)) Structurally
unsound, provided with inadequate egress !
constituting a fire hazard, or otherwise dan-;
gerous to human life, or constituting a haz.

4 ard to safety. health or public welfare because

of inadequate maintenance, deterioration,
instability, dilapidation, ohsolescence, fire
damage, abandonment or other causes.

WORK AREA. That portion or portions
of a building consisting of all reconfigured
spaces as indicated on the construction docu-
ments. Work area excludes other portions of
the building where incidental work entailed
by the intended work must be performed and
portions of the building where work not ini-
tinlly intended by the owner is specifically
required by this code, The boundl:ar of the .

ork area includes all spaces not physically !
Bseparated from rooms or spaces where work |
is being performed. - !

Section 4. The following sections of €
Chapter 4 of the International Existing
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended
as follows: ‘

CHAPTER 4.
CLASSIFICATION OF WORK
SECTION 401

GENERAL v

401.1 Scope. The provisions of this chap-
ter shall be used in conjunction with Chapters !
5 through 10 and' 12.and shall apply to the
alteration, ((repatrs)) addition and change of
occupancy of existing structures, including
((historic-and)) moved structures((-as—ref
erenced-in-Section-16+5:2)). The work per-
formed on an existing building shall be clas-
sified in accordan¢e with this chapter. 1

401.1.1 Compliance with other alter- |
natives. Alterations, ((repair)) additions and
o £0 asiatin

o atmirntnras

i

Ahanmas af nemise o



method, the alterationis, additions, changesor

occupancy and relocated buildings shall com-
ply with Chapter 13 of this code.

102.1.4 Evaluation and design proce-
dures. The seismic evaluation and design
shall be based on the procedures specified
in the International Building Code, ASCE
31 or ASCE 41, The procedures contained in
- Appendix A of this code shall be permitted to
“ be used as specified in Section 102,1.4.1.

il 102.1.4,1 Compliance with IBC level

1 seismic forces, Where compliance with the
: selsmic design provisions of the International
‘ Building Code is required, the procedures

Ushall be in accordance with one of the fol-
"lowing:

PR

1. One-hundred percent of the values in
-the International Building Code. Where the
existing seismic force-resisting system is a
type that can be designated as “Ordinary”,
yvalues of R, 70, and Cd used for analy-
sis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the
_International Building Code shall be those
éa‘specified for structural systems classified
a8 “Ordinary” in accordance with Table
12.2-1 of ASCE 7, unless it is demonstrated
that the structural system will provide per-
formance equivalent to that of a “Detailed”,
“Intermediate” or “Special” system.,

99] 2. Compliance with ASCE 41 using both
18{ the BSE-1 and BSE-2 earthquake hazard lev-

els and the corresponding performance levels
ue: shown in Table 102.1.4.1.

TABLE 102.1.4.1

5
);‘ PERFORMANCE CRITERIA FOR
iy IBC LEVEL SEISMIC FORCES
n OCCUPANCY

?1;‘ CATEGORY (Based on IBC Table 1604.5)

ol o PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR USE

! WITH ASCE 41 BSE-1 EARTHQUAKE

HAZARD LEVEL -- PERFORMANCE

, LEVEL FOR USE WITH ASCE 41 BSE-2
EARTHQUAKE HAZARD LEVEL

i I ..Life safety (LS) -- Collapse preven-
\0§ tion (CP)

or

| 1I -- Life safety (LS) -- Collapse preven-
nd tion (CP)

ot
j@ IHI--Notea-- Note a
M} 1V .. Immediate occupancy (I0) -~ Life

gy safety (LS)
eyt a. Acceptance criteria for Occupancy
Category III shall be taken as 80 per-
. cent of the acceptance criteria specified for
i Occupancy Category II performance levels,
but need not be less than the acceptance cri-
dd teria specified for Occupancy Category IV
11y performance levels.

M 102.1.4.2. Compliance with reduced
IBC level seismic forces. Where seismic
3011 evaluation and design is permitted to meet
1u ¢ reduced International Building Code seismic
»d ¢ force levels, the procedures used shall be in
accordance with one of the following:

1. One-hundred percent of the values in
the International Building Code. Where the
existing seismic force-resisting system is a
type that can be designated as “Ord'mari/”,

Egl values of R, ?0, and Cd used for analy-

o sis in accordance with Chapter 16 of ths

% International Building Code shall be those

- specified for structural systems classified

as “Ordinary” in accordance with Table

12.2-1 of ASCE 7, unless it is demonstrated

‘g8 that the structural system will provide per-

di01 formance equivalent to that of a “Detailed”,
@ “Intermediate” or “Special” system.

(41 2. Structures or portions of structures
100, that comply with the requirements of the
$8u applicable chapter in Appendix A as speci-

fied in Items 2.1 through 2.5 shall be deemed

1go t0 comply with this section.

e 2.1. The seismic evaluation and design of

STUE unreinforced masonry bearing wall buildings
in Occupancy Category I or II are permitted
to be based on the procedures specified in
Appendix Chapter Al,

2.2. Seismic evaluation and design of the
pac wall anchorage system in reinforced concrete
% s and reinforced masonry wall buildings with

flexible diaphragms in Occupancy Category
wmy I or II are permitted to be based on the pro-
cedures specified in Chapter AZ.

2.3. Seismic evaluation and design of crip-
ple walls and sill plate anchorage in residen-
tial buildings of light-frame wood construc-
tion in Occupancy Category I or IT are per-
mitted to be based on the procedures speci-

19on fied in Chapter A3. .
mus
myec 2.4, Seismic evaluation and design of soft,
3 03 weak, or open-front wall conditions in multi-
d z0 unit residential buildings of wood construc-
7989| tion in Occupancy Category I or II are per-
ays mitted to be based on the procedures speci-
ys yfiedin Chapter A4,

8880t 3 Compliance with ASCE 81 based on
the applicable performance level as shown
in Table 102.1.4.2. It shall be permitied to
use the BSE-1 earthquake hazard level as
defined in ASCE 41 and subject to the limi-
dueslatations in Item 4 below.

§op p

B8 8ura
L ]

ol

8hall comply with the provisiofis ¢f Chapress
4 through 10 anrd Chapter 12 or with one of
the alternatives provided in Section (16%5))

lapse;detachmentor-disledgmentof anypor- 102

e L
tionof-theb
vicedoads:))

EQUIPMENT OR FIXTURE. Any
plumbing, heating, electrical, ventilating, air
conditioning, refrigerating, and fire protec-
tion equipment, and elevators, dumb waiters,
escalators, boilers, pressure vessels and other
mechanical facilities or installations that
are related to building services, Equipment
or fixture shall not include manufacturing,
production, or process equipment, but shall
include connections from building service to
process equipment,

EXISTING BUILDING. A building
erected prior to the date of adoption of ((the
appropriate)) this code, ((or)) one for which a

" £
Tappurtenanceor-ortamenta

((fegad-b )) valid Certificate of
Occupancy has been issued, or one that has

passed a final inspection.

[B] FLOOD HAZARD AREA, The
greater of the following two areas:

1. The area within a flood plain subject
to a 1-percent or greater chance of flooding
in any year.

2. The area designated as a flood hazard
area on a community’s flood hazard map, or
otherwise legally designated.

. HISTORIC BUILDING. ((Anyhuild-
or-NationalRegisterof Historic Places;des-
ignated-asa historic pro . T

state de.s"g"."""“ taw-orsur "’e.’ e‘”l"}’ﬁe. & a"]
Register listedorlocally-designated-historic

1 : rooligibh on isted
Hisevne‘Preservahﬁn—Gfﬁcemﬁhe—Keepe):;X
building or structure that has been nominat-
ed for designation under SMC 25.12.660 and
the City Landmarks Preseryation Board has
not issued a determination regarding desig-
nation. or has been designated for preserva-
tion by the City Landmarks Preservation
Board under SMC 26.12.660, that has been
designated for preservation by the State of
Washington, has heen listed or determined
eligible to be listed in the National Register
of Historic Places, or is located in a landmark
or special review district subject to a require-
ment to obtain a certificate of ap{groyal before
making a change to the external appearance
of a structure,

LOAD BEARING ELEMENT, Any col-
umn, girder, beam, joist, truss, rafter, wall,
floor or roof sheathing that supports any ver-
tical load in addition to its own weight or any
lateral load.

NONCOMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL. A
material that, under the conditions anticipat-
ed, will not ignite or burn when subjected to
fire or heat. Materials that pass ASTM E 136
are considered noncombustible materials.

PRIMARY FUNCTION. A primary
function is a major activity for which the
facility is intended. Areas that contain a pri-
mary function include, but are not limited
to, the customer services lobby of a bank, the
dining area of a cafeteria, the meeting rooms
in a conference center, as well as offices and
other work areas in which the activities of the
public accommodation or other private entity
using the facility are carried out, Mechanical
rooms, boiler rooms, supply storage rooms,
employee lounges or locker rooms, janitorial
closets, entrances, corridors and restrooms
are not areas containing a primary func-
tion.

REGISTERED DESIGN
PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE
CHARGE. A registered design professional
engaged by the owner to review and coordi-
nate certain aspects of the project, as deter-
mined by the code official, for compatibility
with the design of the building or structure,
including submittal documents prepared by
others, deferred submittal documents and
phased submittal documents.

REHABILITATION, Any work, as
described by the categories of work defined
herein, undertaken in an existing building.

REHABILITATION, SEISMIC, Work
conducted to improve the seismic lateral force
resistance of an existing building.

((REPA—]RT_—'Phe—restﬁrat’mn—eo*gqad
ing-buitdingfor-the-purpose-of-its—nrainte~
nanee:))

SEISMIC LOADING. The forces pre-
scribed herein, related to the response of
the structure to earthquake motions, to be
used in the analysis and design of the struc-
ture and its components, SUBSTANTIAL
ALTERATION, Alterations that are sub:
ject to Section 3404.9 of the International
Building Code.

0

ke p

SECTION 402 °

REPAIRS

402.1 Scope, ((Repat’rs;—.as—deﬁned—ih
: ’A £ 1

&4 ] tarial
tron—oer-rep o tua materiais;
1

eqitipmel

A fonth
or-fixturestor-thepur

409-2-Applieations)) Repairs shall com-
ply with the provisiéns of Chapter ((5)) 34 of
the International Biilding Code.

emmes—ﬁammmy—forﬂm' | e

ag
required-repairof damaged-componentsshall
879-0r-167)) iy

*kn

SECTION 406 "
ALTERATION—LEVEL 3

[W] 405.1 Scope. Level 3 alterations
apply where the work area exceeds 50 per-
cent of the ((aggregate)) floor area of the
building.

ok
SECTION 408
HISTORIC BUILDINGS
408.1 Scope. Historic buildings ((provi-
sions)) shall comply with the Seattle Building
o de ] i Tnssificdnshi

Section 5. The following sections of
Chapter 6 of the International Existing
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended
as follows:

CHAPTER 6
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 1
SECTION 601

GENERAL

601.1 Scope. Level 1 alterations as
described in Section 408 shall comply with
the requirements of this chapter. ((

ot thie ol : I
)] .

dedk

SECTION 602

BUILDING ELEMENTS
MATERIALS «

*kk

602.4 Mater{;'ls and methods. All
new work shall comply with materials and
methods requirements in the International

Building Code,
3 Washington State
Energy Code with Seaitle Amendments
International Mechanical Code, and
International)) Uniform Plumbing Code, 8s
applicable, that specify material standards,
detail of installation and connection, joints,
penetrations, and continuity of any element,
component, or system in the building,

Hhk

AND

SECTION 604

MEANS OF EGRESS

604.1 General, Repairs shall ((be-done-in|
intat tecr

tiorrprovided for-the-means-of egress)) comply]
with the International Building Code.

wkk

SECTION 606.
STRUCTURAL

Fkdk

606.2 Addition or replacement of]
roofing or replacement of equipment.
Where addition or replacement of roofing or
replacement of equipment results in addition-
al dead loads, structural components support-
ing such reproofing or equipment shall com-
ply with the gravity load requirements of the
International Building Code.

Exceptions:

1. Structural elements where the addition-
al dead load from the roofing or equipment is
not increased by more than 5 percent,




! 2. Buildings constructed in accordance

'with the International Residential Code or
‘the conventional light-frame construction
"methods of the International Building Code
and where the dead load from the roofing or
equipment is not increased by more than §
percent.

3. Addition of a second layer of roof cover-

ing weighing 3 pounds per square foot (0.1437

, kN/m2) or less over an existing, single layer
! of roof covering.

i ((WGTB&—WaH.—&nehors—fot-cmteret_e

i and-masonry-butldings-Whereapermit

o i A : :

| cent-of thereof-areaof-abuildingassigned

a—structural-system—consistingof conerete
i forced M it o]

the-work-shat-inelude-installation—of-wall

2 N i A Tl
forces—as-specified-in-Section((1615+4:2))
188 34-1-of this-code-and-designprocedures

o i I
walt-anchorage:))

606,3 Additional requirements for
reroof permits. The requirements of this
section shall apply to alleration work requir-
ing reroof permits.

606,3.1 Bracing for unreinforced
masonry parapets, Where a permit is
issued for reroofing more than 25 percent of
the roof area of a building assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or F that has parapets
constructed of unreinforced masonry, the
work shall include installation of parapet
bracing to resist the reduced International
Building Code level seismic forces as spec-
ified in Section ((161:5+4)) 102.1.4.1 of this
code, unless an evaluation demonstrates com-
pliance of such items.

606.3.2 Roof diaphragms resisting
wind loads in high wind regions. Where
roofing materials are removed from more
than 60 percent of the roof diaphragm of
a bhuilding or section of a building located
where the basic wind speed is greater than 90
mph or in a special wind region, as defined
in Section 1609 of the International Building
Code, roof diaphragms and connections that
are part of the main wind-force resisting
system shall be evaluated for the wind loads
specified in the International Building Code,
including wind uplift. If the diaphragms and
connections in their current condition do not
comply with those wind provisions, they shall
be replaced or strengthened in accordance
with the loads specified in the International
Building Code.

*kH

SECTION 607

ENERGY CONSERVATION

607,1 Minimum requirements. Level

30 shall be’provided with automatic sprinkler
protection where all of the following condi-
tions occur:

1.The work area is required to be pro-
vided with automatic sprinkler protection in
accordance with the International Building
Code as applicable to new

construction;

2. The work area exceeds 50 percent of the
floor area; and

3, The building has sufficient municipal
water supply for design of a fire sprinkler
system available to the floor without instal-
lation of a new fire pump.

704.2.2.1 Mixed uses. In work areas
containing mixed uses, one or more of which
requires automatic sprinkler protection in
accordance with Section 704.2.2, such pro-
tection shall not be required throughout the
work area provided that the uses requiring
such protection are separated from those not
requiring protection by fire-resistance-rated
construction having a minimum 2-hour rat-
ing for Group H and a minimum 1-hour rat-
ing for all other occupancy groups.

704.2,8 Windowless stories, Work locat-
ed in a windowless story, as determined in
accordance with the International Building
Code, shall be sprinklered where the work
area is required to be sprinklered under the
provisions of the International Building Code
for newly constructed buildings and the build-
ing has a sufficient municipal water supply
without installation of a new fire pump.

704.2,4 Other required suppres-
sion systems. In buildings and areas list-
ed in Table 903.2,11.6 of the International
Building Code, work areas that have exits or

corridors shared by more than one tenant or B

that have exits or corridors serving an oceu-
pant load greater than 30 shall be provided
with sprinkler protection under the follow-
ing conditions:

1, The work area is required to be pro-
vided with automatic sprinkler protection in
accordance with the International Building
Code applicable to new construction; and

2. The building has sufficient municipal
water supply for design of a fire sprinkler
system available to the floor without instal-
lation of a new fire pump.

704.2,6 Supervision, Fire sprinkler sys-
tems required by this section shall be super-
vised by one of the following methods:

1. Approved central station system in
accordance with NFPA 72;

2, Approved proprietary system in accor-
dance with NFPA 72;

3. Approved remote station system of the
jurisdiction in accordance with NFPA 72; or

4. When approved by the code official,
approved local alarm service that will cause
the sounding of an alarm in accordance with

1 alterations to existing buildings or struc- NFpA 72

tures ((are-p
L

irements—of-the
International-Fnergy-ConservationCode-or

to-new-construetion-only:)) shall comply with
the Washington State Energy Code with
Seattle Amendments.

Section 6. The following sections of
Chapter 7 of the International Existing
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended
as follows:

CHAPTER 7
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 2
SECTION 701

GENERAL

1.3

701.3 Compliance. All new construction
elements, components, systems, and spaces
shall comply with the requirements of the
International Building Code.

Exceptions:

1. Windows may be added without requir-
ing compliance with the light and ventilation
requirements of the International Building
Code.

2. Newly installed electrical equipment
shall comply with the (( i
Section708)) Seattle Electrical Code.

3, The length of dead-end corridors in
newly constructed spaces shall only be
required to comply with the provisions of
Section 705.6.

4, The minimum ceiling height of the
newly created habitable and occupiable spac-
es and corridors shall be 7 feet (2134 mm).

6. Automatic sprinkler systems are
required when new dwelling units are added

Exception: Supervision is not required
for the following:

1. Underground gate valve with roadway
boxes,

2. Halogenated extinguishing systems.

3. Carbon dioxide extinguishing sys-
tems.

4, Dry and wet chemical extinguishing
systems.,

5. Automatic sprinkler systems installed
in accordance with NFPA 13R where a com-
mon supply main is used to supply both
domestic and automatic sprinkler systems
and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic
sprinkler system is not provided,

ik

SECTION 707

STRUCTURAL
whk

707.6 Voluntary lateral-force-resist-
ing system alterations. Alterations of
existing structural elements and additions of
new structural elements that are initiated for
the purpose of increasing the lateral-force-
resisting strength or stiffness of an existing
structure and that are not required by other
sections of this code shall not be required
to be designed for forces conforming to the
International Building Code, provided that
aﬁ) engineering analysis is submitted to show
that: ’

1. The capacity of existing structur-
al elements required to resist forces is not
reduced;

2. The lateral loading to existing struc-
tural elements is not increased either beyond
their capacity or more than 10 percent;

3. New structural elements are detailed
and connected to the existing structural
) ts as required by the International

o buildi ccord to Ttems ou!
5.6 helow, This exception is permitted to be
used to add one unit over the life of the build-

mg

Bujlding Code;

4, New or rélocated nonstructural ele-

ments are detailed and connected to existing
or new structural elements as required by the

Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended

as follows:
CHAPTER 8

ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 3
ek

SECTION 802
SPECIAL USE AND OCCUPANCY

802.1 High-rise buildings. Any build-
ing having occupied floors more than 75 feet
(22 860 mm) above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access shall comply with
g}(x)ez ieguirements of Sections 802.1.1 and

802,1.1 Recirculating air or exhaust
systems, When a floor is served by a recir-
culating air or exhaust system with a capac-
ity greater than 15,000 cubic feet per minute
(701 m3/s), that system shall be equipped
with approved smoke

and heat detection devices installed
in accordance with the International
Mechanical Code.

i 1)) Elevators and other con-
yeyances shall comply with the International
1di

Code
*kk
SECTION 803

BUILDING
MATERIALS

ok

ELEMENTS  AND

803.2 Fire partitions in Group R-3.
Fire separation in Group R-3 occupancies
shall be in accordance with Section 803.2.1.

803.2.1 Separation required, Where
the work area is in any attached dwelling unit
in Group R-3 or any multiple single family
dwelling (townhouse), walls separating the
dwelling-units that are not continuous from
the foundation to the underside of the roof
sheathing shall be constructed to provide a
continuous fire separation using construction
materials consistent with the existing wall
or complying with the requirements for new
structures. All work shall be performed on
the side of the dwelling unit wall that is part
of the work area.

Exception: Where alterations ((or
trs)) do not result in the removal of
wall or ceiling finishes exposing the struc-
ture, walls are not required to be continuous
through concealed floor spaces.

(333
SECTION 807
STRUCTURAL
Kk

((8074—Btrueturalalterations—Al
structuratelementsof thelateral-force-resist-

mg-Eevel—E—a-}Ee. ral ns—as—tnggeredt_yﬂe on

Exceptions:

f-the-building-or
strueture-have-been-or-areproposed-to-be
trrvolvodi Ll ? iehi

ifieduin Soct
e-counted-toward-the




. b.4 Une unit 1s permitted to be paaed g

;aresidential or commercial building without
an automatic sprinkler system unless sprin-
klers are otherwise required by this section.

AIf more than one unit ig added, the new units
shall be equipped with a sprinkler system

5.2 In buildings that do not comply with
\the provisions of this code for number of sto-
‘ries, allowable area, height or type of con-
« struction before the unit is added. an auto-
matic sprinkler system s ovided in
the new unit. The addition of the new unit
shall not be allowed if it increages the non-
(K conformity.

1 5.8 In buildings undergoing substantial
4 glteration, an automatic sprinkler system is
required where required by this code for new

‘dco_nmm

5.4 One unit is permitted to be added
vét“ an_existing duplex without an automatic
sprinkler system where both of the following

Tieonditions are met:

5., Bl The project is considered a substan-
| tial alteration only because of the change in
Y occupancy; and

u

t 5.4.2 The building complies with the

 yequirements for building height and num-
ber of stories for & Group R-2 occupancy,

5.5 Where one unit is added to an existing
duplex, sprinklers are required in the ne

5. (A-dangerons)) An unsafe condition as
defined in this code is not created. Voluntary
alterations to laterai-force-resisting systems
conducted in accordance with Appendix A
and the referenced standards of this code
shall be permitted.

701. all anchorg for concrete and
masonry buildings. Where more than 25
percent of the roof sheathing will be replaced
on a building assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F wi structural system
consisting of concrete or reinforced masonry
walls with a flexible roof diaphragm or unre-
inforced masonry walls with any type of xoof
diaphragms, the work shall include installa-
tion of wall anchors at the roof line to resist
the reduced International Building Code
level seismic forces as sFecified in Section
102.1.4.1 of this code and design procedures

of Section 102.1.4, unless an evaluation dem-

onstrates compliance of existing wall anchor-
age.

SECTION 708

ELECTRICAL

708.1 Electrical work. Flectrical work
n Level 2 alterations shall comply with the
Seattle Electrical Code. (( i
tions: i

o

unit and not in the existing units where all
of the following conditions are met;

X 5.6.1 The existing duplex does not com-
ply with the requirements for building height
and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy:

¢

e 5.5.2 The project is considered a substan-
tial alteration only because of the change in

d occupancy:

5.5.3 The new unit is constructed as an
30 addition to the duplex:

5.5.4 The new unit is separated from the
19| existing duplex by a fire wall: and

5.5.56 The addition by itself complies with
,@ the requirements for oup R-2 occupan-

10 gy

)

_[J] 5.6 A sprinkler system is not required
when a Group U occupancy that is accessory

to a Group R-3 occupancy is converted to a
;’9‘1 dwelling unit,
8

o Yk
B
nel SECTION 704
FIRE PROTECTION

fsut W] 704.1 Scope. The requirements of
18U hig gection shall be limited to work areas
98tiy which Level 2 alterations are being per-
Uolformed, and where specified they shall apply

throughout the floor on which the worl
omgareas are located or otherwise heyond the
wsWork area.

Exception:, The fire code official may
modify or waive the fire protection require-
ments for Level 2 alteration projects in which
‘the fire protection requirements constitute
an excessive burden.

704.1.1 Corridor ratings. Where an

"8 gpproved automatic sprinkler system is
su installed throughout the story, the required
fire-resistance rating for any corridor locat-

ed on the story shall be permitted to be

0d reduced in accordance with the International
Building Code. In order to be considered for a

'9911 corridor rating reduction, such system shall ;

! provide coverage for the stairwell landings
88 gorving the floor and the intermediate land-
ings immediately below.

o3 [W] 704.2 Automatic sprinkler sys-
JIM tems. Automatic sprinkler systems shall
£ 0/ be provided in accordance with the require-
Y3 ments of Sections 704.2.1 through 704.2.5.
M Tnstallation requirements shall be in accor-
i dance with the International ((Building
Cede))_Fire Cod FPA 13 FPA
13R.

704.2,1 High-rise buildings. In high-

i ¢ rise buildings, work areas that have exits or

% corridors shared by more than one tenant or

5g that have exits or corridors serving an occu-

jgn pant load greater than 30 shall be provided

with automatic sprinkler protection in the

entire work area where the work area is locat-

wn ed on a floor that has a sufficient sprinkler

820 water supply system from an existing stand-
;&1 pipe or a sprinkler riser serving that floor.

;3; 704.2.1.1 Supplemental automatic

; sprinkler system requirements. Where
i the work area on any floor exceeds 50 per-
tors cent of that floor area, Section 704.2.1 shall
{838 apply to the entire floor on which the work
ey areais located.

;“;l‘:,' Exception: Tenant spaces that are
{enb entirely outside the work area.

704.2.2 Groups A, B, E, F-1, H, I, M,

i R-1, R-2, R-4, S-1 and S-2, In buildings

tmo‘ with occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F-1, H,

3 I,M, R-1,R-2, R-4, 8-1 and 8-2, work areas

that have exits or corridors shared by more

i than one tenant oxr that have exits or corri.

;?% dors serving an occupant load greater than
430

Joow
ns o,

‘shalb-have-aminimumrof two-duplex-receptar
cle-outlets-orone-duplex-receptacle-outletand
one-ceilingor-wall-type lighting-outlet
have—a—minimum-of-two—duplex-—receptacle
outlets:

708783 haundry-areas-haundryareas

k sh-al-l—have—a'mtmmumﬂfen?dnp*exrecept&

SECTION 710

PLUMBING

710.1 Minimum fixtures, Where the
occupant load of the story is increased by
more than 20 percent, plumbing fixtures
for the story shall be provided in quantities
specified in the (( 3 y) Uniform
Plumbing Code based on the increased oceu-
pant load.

SECTION 711
ENERGY CONSERVATION

711.1 Minimum requirements. Level
2 alterations to existing buildings or struc-
tures ((are-permitted-without-requiring-the
gne-energy—reqﬂiremenes-vf—ﬂxe—bnm&onﬁl

International

te-new-construction-only:)) shall comply with
the Washi v State Energy Code with
Seattle Amendments.

Section 7. The following sections of
Chapter 8 of the International Existing

SECTION 808
ENERGY CONSERVATION

808.1 Minimum requirements. Level
3 alterations to existing buildings or struc-

tures ((are-permitted-without-requiring-the
g A by it
the-energyrequirements-of the-Fnternational
Energy-Conse 3 3 ]
T A d b h ol
conform-to-the-energy-requirements-of-the
International-Brergy-Conservation-Codeor
to-new-construction-only:)) shall comply with
the Washington State Energy Code wit

Seattle Amendments.

Section 8. The following sections of
Chapter 9 of the International Existin
Building Cade, 2009 Edition, are amende
as follows:

CHAPTER 9
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
SECTION 901

GENERAL
ok

901,2 Change in oceupancy with no
change of occupancy classification, A
change in occupancy, as defined in Section
202, with no change of occupancy classifi-
cation shall not be made to any structure
that will subject the structure to any special
provisions of the applicable International
Codes, including the provisions of Sections
902 through 911, without the approval of the
code official. A certificate of occupancy shall
be issued where it has been determined that
the requirements for the change in occupancy
have been met.

901,2.1 ((Repair—and—alteration))
Alteration with no change of occupancy
classification. Any ((repatr-or-alteration)
work undertaken in connection with a change
of sccupancy that does not involve a change of
occupancy classification shall conform to the
applicable requirements for the work as clas-
sified in Chapter 4 and to the requirements
of Sections 902 through 911,

((Bxeeption+Asmodified-inSection1165
fnr—histvr:c%nﬂd-hxgs—.))

Hehk

SECTION 907

STRUCTURAL
ek

907.3 Seismic loads, Existing buildings
with a change of occupancy shall comply with
the seismic provisions of Sections 907.3.1 and
907.3.2.

907.3.1 Compliance with ' the
International Building Code level seis-
mic forces. Where a building or portion
thereof is subject to a change of occupancy
that results in the building being assigned to
a higher occupancy category based on Table
1604.,5 of the International Building Code;
or where such change of occupancy results
in a reclassification of a building to a high-
er hazard category as shown in Table 912.4;
or where a change of a Group M occupancy
to a Gvroui)1 A, E, I-1, R-1, R-2 or R-4 oceu-
pancy with two-thirds or more of the floors
involved in Level 3 alteration work, the build-
ing shall compg with the requirements for
International Building Code level seismic
forces as specified in Section ((F0%:54:1))
102.1.4.1 for the new occupancy category.

Exceptions:

1. Group M occupancies being changed to
Group A, E, I-1, R-1, R-2 or R-4 occupancies
for buildings less than six stories in height
and in Seismic Design Category A, Bor C,

2. Where approved by the code official,
specific detailing provisions required for
a new structure are not required to be met
where it can be shown that an equivalent
level of performance and seismic safety is
obtained for the applicable occupancy cat-




v

egory based on the provision for reduced
International Building Code level seismic
forces as specified in Section ((36%:5+4:2))
102,1.4.1.

3. Where the area of the new occupancy
with a higher hazard category is less than
or equal to 10 percent of the total building
floor area and the new occupancy is not clas-
gified as Occupancy Category IV. For the pur-
poses of this exception, buildings occupied by
two or more occupancies not included in the
same occupancy category, shall be subject
to the provisions of Section 1604.5.1 of the
International Building Code. The cumula-
tive effect of the area of occupancy changes
shall be considered for the purposes of this
exception.

4. Unreinforced masonry bearing wall
“buildings in Occupancy Category III when
assi%ned to Seismic Design Category Aor B
shall be allowed to be strengthened to meet
the requirements of Appendix Chapter Al of
this code [Guidelines for the Seismic Retrofit
of Existing Buildings (GSREB)].

907.3.2 Access to Occupancy Category
IV. Where a change of occupancy is such that
compliance with Section 907.3.1 is required
and the building is assigned to Occupancy
Category IV, the operational access to the
building shall not be through an adjacent
structure, unless that structure conforms to
the requirements for Occupancy Category IV
structures, Where operational access is less
than 10 feet (3048 mm) from either an inte-
rior lot line or from another structure, access

rotection from potential falling debris shall
e provided by the owner of the Occupancy
Category IV structure.

SECTION 908
ELECTRICAL

908.1 ((Bpeeial—oececupaneies))
Electrical work, Where the occupancy of
an existing building or part of an existing
building is changed ((to-one-of f 3

46;)) the electrical wiring and equipment of
the building or portion thereof that contains
the proposed occupancy shall comply with
the applicable requirements of the Seattle
ELlect[ica} Code ((NFPA-76-whetherornot-a

A

Yood
P y-groupsinvorved:

. + tolovies diosmrerdstm]
locations:
! L . 05
116_ Ml“he!“ pictur e. and-televisionstudio

908:2Unsafe-conditions—Where-the
eccupancy-of an-existing building-o

comply-with NFPA70:
WWWW PRI LR A I
ments-of NFPA70-for the new oceupancy:

9084 Number—of-electrical-outlets:
orpartofanexisting-buildingischanged;the
number-of-electrieal-outlets-shatlcomply-with
NFPA-76-for-the-new-ocettpaney:))

ek

SECTION 910
PLUMBING

910.1 Increased demand, Where the
occupancy of an existing building or part of
an existing building is changed such that
the new occupancy is subject to increased
or different plumbing fixture requirements
or to increased water supply requirements
in accordance with the ((};'-Iﬂeﬁmﬁ'ﬂnﬂ%
Um'ltorm Plumbing Code, the new occupancy
shall comply with the intent of the respective
International Building Code and Uniform

Plumbing Code provisions.

910.2 Food-handling occupancies. If
the new occupancy is a food-handling estab-
lishment, all existing sanitary waste lines
above the food or drink preparation or storage

 areas shall b panned or otherwise protécted

i

§ prevent lesking pipes or condénsation on
pipes from contaminating food or drink, New
drainage lines shall not be installed above

such areas and shall be protected in accor:”

danhce with the ((Znternationald)) Uniform
Plumbing Code.

910.3 Intercentor required, If the new

changed, an automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided in the new unit. The change of

of a permit, See Section 106 for information
equired on plans. Any moved building that

occupancy shall not be allowed if it increases
the nonconformity.

1.3 In buildings undergeing substantial
alteration, an automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed where required by this code
for new construction.

1.4 The occupancy of one unit is permit-
ted to be changed to a dwelling unit in an
existing duplex without an automatic sprin-

kler system where both of the following con-
ditions are met:

1.4.1 The project is considered a substan-
tial alteration only because of the change in
occupancy; and

1.4.2 The building complies with the
requirements for building height and num-
ber of stories for a Group R-2 occupancy.

1.6 Where the occupancy of one unit is

changed to a dwelling unit in an existing
duplex, sprinklers are required in the new

s not in complete compliance with standards
or moved buildings within eighteen months
yom the date of permit issuance and is found
to be a public nuisance may be abated.

1201.3 Residential buildings or struc-
tures. Residential buildings or structures:
moved into or within the city are not required
to comply with all of the requirements of this
code if tfyle original occupancy classification
of the building or structure is not changed,
Compliance with chapter 12 will be required
if the moved residential buildings or strue-
tures undergo substantia}l alteration. Wor
performed on new and existing foundations
shall comply with all of the requirements of i
this code for new construction. g

T

g
ro o3

o2

nemwn

unit and not in the existing units where all
of the following conditions are met:

1,6.1 The existing duplex does not com-
ply with the requirements for building height
and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy:

1.5.2 The project is considered a substan-
tial alteration only because of the change in
accupancy;

1.6.3 The new unit is constructed as an

addition to the duplex:

1,6.4 The new unit is separated from the
existing duplex by & fire wall; and

1.5.5 The addition by itself complies with
the requirements for a Group R-2 occupan-

cy.

1.6 A sprinkler system is not required
when a Group U occupancy that is accessory
to a_Group R-3 occupancy is converted to a
dwelling unit.

912,2.2 Fire alarm and, detection sys-
tem. Where a change in occupancy classifi-
cation occurs that requires a fire alarm and
detection system to be provided based on the
new occupancy in accordance with Chapter
9 of the International Building Code, such
system shall be provided throughout the
area where the change of occupancy occurs,
Existing alarm notification appliances shall
be automatically activated throughout the
building. Where the building is not equipped
with a fire alarm system, alarm noti(}ication
appliances shall be provided throughout the
area where the change of occupancy oceurs
and shall be automatically activated.

*kk

Section 9. The following sections of
Chapter 10 of the International Existing

Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended 1

as follows:
CHAPTER 10
ADDITIONS
SECTION 1001
GENERAL

*hk

1001.3 Other work., Any ((repuir—or))
alteration work within an existing building to
which an addition is being made shall comply
with the applicable requirements for the work
as classified in Chapter 4.

dkd

SECTION 1003
STRUCTURAL

dkk

1003.3 Lateral-force-resisting system,
The lateral force-resisting system of existing
buildings to which additions are made shall
comply with Sections 1003.3.1, 1003.3.2 and
1003.3.3.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings of Group R occupancy with
no more than five dwelling or sleeping units
used solely for residential purposes where the
existing building and the addition comply
with the conventional light-frame construc-
tion methods of the International Building
Code or the provisions of the International
Residential Code.

2. In other existing buildings where the
lateral-force story shear in any story is not
increased by more than 10 percent cumula-

) tive,

1003.3,1 Vertical addition, Any ele-
ment of the lateral-force-resisting system of
an existing building subjected to an Increase
in vertical or lateral loads from the vertical
addition shall comply with the International
Building Code wind provisions and the
International Building Code level seis-
mic forces specified in Section ((015+4:1))
102.1.4.1 of this code, .

1003.3.2 Horizontal addition, Where
horizontal additions are structurally con-
nected.to an.existing structure, all lateral-
force-resisting elements of the existing strue-
ture affected by such addition shall comply
with the International Building Code wind
provisions and the Internatz:g'na_l.Blrt‘ildl:ng

VO T

) qravorar utiatig
Internat R tral-Code ieprovi-

o !
made-prior-to-the-final-approvaly)) G

Section 11, The following sections of
Chapter 13 of the International Existing]
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended’
as follows: . i

CHAPTER 13

PERFORMANCE
METHODS

SECTION 1301
GENERAL

1301.1 Scope. The provisions of this
chapter shall apply to the alteration,
((repairy)) addition and change of occupan-
¢y of existing structures, including ((histor~
ie-snd)) moved structures, as referenced in
Section ((361+:5-3)) 102.1.3. The provisions
of this chapter are intended to maintain or
increase the current degree of public safety,
health and general welfare in existing build-
ings while permitting ((repair)) alteration,
addition and change of occupancy without
requiring full compliance with Chapters 4
through 10 and Chapter 12, except where
compliance with other provisions of this code
is specifically required in this chapter,

1301.1.1 Compliance with other meth-r:
ods. Alterations, ((repair;)) additions and
changes of occupancy to existing structures
shall comply with the provisions of this chap-
ter or with one of the methods provided in
SQootinn ((FAF-EN 102

COMPLIANCE



OCCUPBHCY W1ll proauce grease or oi-laden
wastes, interceptors shall be provided as
required in the ((Internationad)) Uniform
Plumbing Code.

Wk
910.5 Group I-2. If the occupancy group

is changed to Group I-2, the plumbing 8yS-
tem shall comply Zvith the applicable require-
International)

ments of the Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ok

SECTION 912

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION

912.1 General, The provisions of this
* section shall apply to buildings or portions
thereof undergoing a change of occupancy
classification, This includes a change of occu-
pancy classification within a group as well as
a change of occupancy classification from one
group to a different group. Such buildings
shall also comply with Sections 902 through
911, The application of requirements for the
change of occupancy shall be ag set forth in
Sections 912.1,1 through 912.1.4. A changs of
occupancy, as defined in Section 202, without
a corresponding change of occupancy classifi-
cation shall comply with Section 901.2,

[W] 912.1.1 Compliance with Chapter
8. The requirements of Chapter 8 shall be
applicable throughout the building for the
new occupancy classification based on the
separation conditions set forth in Sections

912.1.1.1 and 912.1.1,2._All existing build-

ings with a change of occupancy classifica- £

tion shall comply with the seismic provisions

of Section 907.8.

912,1.1,1 Change of occupancy clas-
sification without seg)aration. Where a
portion of an existing building is changed
to a new occupancy classification and that
portion is not separated from the remain-
der of the building with fire barriers having
a fire-resistance rating as required in the
International Building Code for the separate
oceupancy, the entire building shall comply
with all of the requirements of Chapter 8
applied throughout the building for the most
. restrictive occupancy classification in the
"+ building and with the requirements of this
1 chapter,

912.1.1.2 Change of occupancy clas-
sification with separation. Where a por-
tion of an existing building that is changed
to a new occupancy classification and that
.y portion is separated from the remainder
» of the building with fire barriers having a
fire-resistance rating as required in the
International Building Code for the sepa-
rate occupancy, that portion shall comply
with all the requirements of Chapter 8 for
the new occupancy classification and with the
requirements of this chapter.

Pt
s

-3

912.1.2 Fire protection and interior
finish. The provisions of Sections 912.2
and 912.3 for fire protection and interior
finish, respectively, shall apply to all build-
ings undergoing a change of occupancy clas-
T8 sification.

I 912.1.3 Change of occupancy classi-
IT fication based on hazard category. The
U relative degree of hazard between different
I occupancy classifications shall be determined
T1in accordance with the category specified in

Tables 912.4, 912.6 and 912.6. Such a deter-
¥ mination shall be the basis for the application
'@ of Sections 912.4 through 912.7,

912.1.4 Accessibility. All buildings
undergoing a change of occupancy classifica-
tion shall comply with Section 912.8,

o
X9,

Blord

912,2 Fire protection systems. Fire
+ protection systems shall be provided in accor-
dance with Sections 912.2.1 and 912.9.2,

912,2.1 Fire sprinkler system, Where
a change in occupancy classification occurs
! that requires an automatic fire sprinkler sys-
. tem to be provided based on the new occu-
pancy in accordance with Chapter 9 of the
International Building Code, such system
shall be provided throughout the area where
the change of occupancy occurs.

i Exception:

1, Subject to the approval of the building
official, an automatic fire sprinkler system
is not required in dwelling units according

tion is permitted to be used for the change in
i eccupancy for one dwelling unit over the life
i of the building,

; 1.1 The occupancy of one unit is permit-
1 ted to be changed to a dwelling unit without

an automatic sprinkler system unless sprin-
i ers are otherwise required by this chapter.

an one unit is changed, the new

mo
units ghall be equipped with a gprinkler sys-

em

n buildings that do not comply with

the provisions of this code for number of sto-
ries, allowable area, height or type of con-

to Items 1.1 through 1.6 below. This excep- #hy—fk

L0UE 18V6! 5e1010L WUFCES SPECLLILU LI Douutvn

((301:5-4:1)) 102.1,4.1 of this code.

1003.3.3 Voluntary addition of struc-
tural elements to improve the lateral-
force-resisting system. Voluntary addition
of structural elements to improve the lateral-
force-resisting system of an existing building
shall comply with Section 707.6.

Rk
SECTION 1006

ADDITIONS OF DWELLING UNITS

1006.1 Automatic sprinkler systems.
Automatic sprinkler systems are required
when new dwelling units are added to build-
ings according to Items 1 through b belo
This provision is permitted to be used to add
one unit over the life of the building,

1. One unit is permitted to be added to
aresidential or commercial building without
an automatic sprinkler system unless sprin-
klers are otherwise required by this section.

If more than one unit is added, the new units
shall be equipped with a sprinkler system.
2. In buildings that do not comply with

the provisions of this code for number of sto-
ries, allowable area, height or type of con-

struction before the unit is added. an auto-

matic sprinkler system shall be provided in

the new unit. The addition of the new unit

shall not be allowed if it increases the non-

conformity.
3. In buildings undergoing substantial

alteration, an automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed where required by this code

or new construction.
4. One unit is permitted to be added to an

existing duplex without an automatie sprin-

existing duplex without an automatic sprin-
Kkler system where both of the following con-

ditions are met:

4.1 The project is considered a substan-

tial alteration only because of the change in
occupancy; and

A}
4.2 The building complies with the
requirements for building height and num-
ber of stories for a Group R-2 occupancy.

5. Where one unit is added to an existing
duplex, sprinklers are required in the ne
unit and not in the existing units where all
of the following conditions are met;

5.1 The existing duplex does not comply
with the requirements for building height
and story count for a Group R-2 occupancy;

5.2 The project is considered a substan-

tial alteration only because of the change in
occupancy:

5.3 The new unit is constructed as an
addition to the duplex:

5.4 The new unit is separated from the
existing duplex by a fire wall; and

6.5 The addition by itself complies with
the requirements for 8 Group R-2 occupan-

cy.

1006.1.1 Fire walls, An existing noncon-
forming building to which an addition is made
is permitted to exceed the height, number of
stories and area specified for new buildings
if a fire wall is provided, the exisfing build-
ing is not made more nonconforming, and the

addition conforms to this code,

Section 10. The following sections of
Chapter 12 of the International Existing
Building Code, 2009 Edition, are amended
as follows:

CHAPTER 12

RELOCATED
BUILDINGS

SECTION 1201
GENERAL

1201.1 Scope, This chapter provides
requirements for relocated or moved struc-
tures.

OR MOVED

) 44 1 p £ AL, 4 7
Inter -Property Code:
A 2. 4 H ' £
Any repair-alteration;orchangeof 72
1w e
code-ap) e-work-being-performed:
b i1 4 o) A3 red
tht of -the-Inter

4} " "
the—fnter 1

1201.2 Nonresidential buildings or
structures. Nonresidentinl buildings or
structures moved into or within the city shall
comply with standards adopted by the build-
ing official. The building official is autho-
rized to require an inspection of the build-
ing before or after moying. The permit hold-
er shall correct all deficiencies identified by
the inspection. The building official is autho-
rized to require that a bond or cash deposit

in_an amount sufficient to abate or demol-

struction before the occupancy of the unit is

1
i
)
i

A e e = oo

ish the building be posted prior to issuance

b J
BY-THE-JURISDICTION]-Noteitis-ree-
emmended-that-this-date-coincide-with-the
Jury B
ing-additions)) Additions, alterations ((or))
and changes of occupancy shall be made to '
conform to the requirements of this chapter !
or the provisions of Chapters 4 through 107
and Chapter 12. The provisions of Sections
1301.2.1 through 1301.2.5 shall apply to;
existing occupancies that will continue tog
be, or are proposed to be, in Groups A, B, E,:
F, M, R, and S. These provisions shall not
apply to buildings with occupancies in Group |
H or Group I.

[B] 1301.2.1 Change in occupancy.E
Where an existing building is changed to aL
new occupancy classification and this section
is applicable, the provisions of this section for
the new occupancy shall be used to determine
compliance with this code.

[B] 1301.2.2 Partial change in occu-
pancy. Where a portion of the building
1s changed to a new occupancy classifica-
tion and that portion is separated from the
remainder of the building with fire barrier
wall assemblies having a fire-resistance
rating as required by Table 508.4 of the
International Building Code or Section R317
of the International Residential Code for the
separate occupancies, or with approved com-
pliance alternatives, the portion changed
shall be made to conform to the provisions
of this section.

Where a portion of the building is
changed to a new occupancy classification
and that portion is not separated from the
remainder of the building with fire sepa-
ration assemblies having a fire-resistance
rating as required by Table 508.4 of the
International Building Code or Section R317
of the International Residential Code for the
separate occupancies, or with approved com- '
pliance alternatives, the provisions of this
section which apply to each occupancy shall!
apply to the entire building, Where there are|
conflicting provisions, those requirements:
which secure the greater public safety shall,
apply to the entire building or structure.

[B] 1301.2.3 Additions. Additions to
existing buildings shall comply with the
requirements of the International Building
Code, International Residential Code, and
this code for new construction, The com- ;
bined height and area of the existing build-
ing and the new addition shall not exceed
the height and area allowed by Chapter 5 of
the International Building Code. Where a
fire wall that complies with Section 706 of
the International Building Code is provided
between the addition and the existing build-
ing, the addition shall be congidered a sepa-|

rate building,

(B 180124 Alterations (and,
repa-n‘sgl) An existing building or portion‘
thereof that does not comply with the require-,
ments of this code for new construction shall,
not be altered ((errepaired)) in such a man-
ner that results in the building being less safe
or sanitary than such building is currently.
If, in the alteration ((er-repair)), the current
level of safety or sanitation is to be reduced,
the portion altered (( ired)) shall
conform to the requirements of Chapters 2
through 12 and Chapters 14 through 33 of
the International Building Code.

[B] 1301.2.5 Accessibility require-
ments, All portions of the buildings pro-
posed for change of occupancy shall conform
to the accessibility provisions of International
Building Code Section ((368)) 3411.

[B] 1801,3 Acceptance. The build-

ing code official shall evaluate compliance
with this section for ((Fer repairs;)) altera-

tions, additions, and changes of occupancy

to existing buildings, ((
i i ts-section;compliance

ithrthis se
cote-official))
[B] 1301.3.1 Hazards. Where the code

official determines that an unsafe condition
exists (( 1 i )), such

etion-116]
- unsafe condition shall be abated in accor-

dance with ((Seetion316)) the International
Building Code.

[B] 1301.8.2 Compliance with other
codes. Buildings that are evaluated in accor-
dance with this section shall comply with the .
International Fire Code (( 2 {

[B] 1301,3.8 Compliance with flood
hazard provisions, (Infleodhazard-areas;
buildings)) Buildings located in flood hazard
areas that are evaluated in accordance with
this section shall comply with Section 1612 of
the International Building Code if the work ;
covered by this section constitutes substan-
tial improvement.

*kk

[B] 1301.6,11 Means-of-egress capac-
ity and number, Evaluate the means-of-

{
am




O ——
egress capacity and the number of exits avail-
able to the building occupants. In applying \
this section; the means of egress are required
to conform to the following sections of the |
International Building Code: |

1003.7, 1004, 1006.1, 1014.2, 1014.3,1
|
1

1016.2, 1021, 1025.1, 10272, 1027.6, 1028.2,
1028.3, 1028.4 and 1029. [except that the
hinimum width required by this section shall

be determined solely by the width for the |

required capacity in accordance with Table
1301.6.11(1)]: The number of exits credited
is the number that is available to each occu-
pant of the area being evaluated, Existing
fire escapes shall be accepted as a component

. ifi the means of egress when conforming to |

Section 705.3.1.2, Under the categories and

cccupancies in Table {801.6.11(2), determine

the appropriate value and enter that value
into Table 13017 under Safety Parameter

1301 6.11, Means-of-Bgress Capacity, for

means of egress and;general safety. /

[B] 1301.6.11.1 Categories, The catego- |

ries for means-of-egréss capacity and number
of exits are: %

1. Catepory a—Chmpliance with the min-|
imum required means-of-egress capacity or;
number of exits is achieved through the use of
a fire escape in acconlance with International
Building Code Section ((365)) 3406, : ]

2. Category b—Capacity of the meamxj
of egress complies vith Section 1004 of the
International Building Code, and the number

- of exits complies with the minimum number
required by Section{021 of the International
Building Code. . |

G o i

3. Category c—Capacity of the means of |
egress is équal to or exceeds 125 percent of |
the required means-of-egress capacity, the |
means of egress complies with the minimum |
required width dimensions specified in the |

. International Building Code, and the number N
|

of exits complies with the minimum number
required by Section 10210f the International
- Building Code.- L

4. Category d—The number of exits pro-
“'vided exceeds the number of exits required
by Section 1021 of the International Building
Code, Exits equal to not less than that spec-
ified in Section 1015.2 of the International
Buildirig Code:i3: . o

5, Category ¢— The area being evaluated

meets both Categories c and d.
KE K

Section 12. The following' section of 1
Chapter. 15 of the International Existing |
Building Code; 2009 Edition; is amended as |
follows: . !

CHAPTER15S ;
REFERENCED STANDARDS ]

This chapter lists the standards that are |
referenced in various sections of this docit- |
ment. The standards are listed herein by the
promulgating agency of the standard; the
standard identification, the effective date
and title, and the section or sections of this |

"document that reference the standard. The
application of the referdnced standards shall |
be as specified in Section (1024)) 101.5. |

Section 13. [Se;ctl ;~2;13 of Ordinance

i
t

122629 arerepealed.
Section 14, Thé provisions of this ordi-
‘nance are declared t separate and sever- |

' able. The invalidity of dny ¢lause, sentence,
paragraph, subdivision, section or portion of
this'ordinance, or | alidity of the appli-

¢ation thereof to pBrSON, OWNEr, or cir:
cumstance shall not a the validity of the
remainder of this ordinance, or the validity

“of its application to other persons, owners, or
circumstances. .. ~

Section 16. For a period of 60 days follow-
ing the effective date of this ordinance, the
Director may accept and thereafter approve
applications that are designed to comply with

- the requirements o nance 122629,

Section 16. This ordinance shall take |

.- effect and be in force 80 days from and ufter |
its approval by the Mayor, but if not approved |
-‘and.returned by the Mayor within ten days
after presentation, hl{? shall take effect as |

provided by Seattle Municipal Code Section !
- 1.04.020. -

Passed by the City Council the 16th day |
of August, 2010, and signed by me in open /

session in authentication of its passage this
. 16th day of August, 2010,

Richard Conlin. i

VT

President of the City Council ‘

Approved by me
010, o

I. ‘Michael McGin "M/layor 1
23rd: day of Ayug'ust,k

by the City Clerk

Publication order
i 1n the Seattle Dail A

Date of publicaii
e




