


.......... ................... .......... I -



Apr!123,1997
1997 Seaffle Fire Code %pplement
SFDORD97.Vl
MD
v3

ORDINANCE 11957q

17

18

19

20

21

221

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

AN ORDINANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code to existing conditions and the

dispensing of flammable liquids from protected above-ground storage tanks, and amending the

Seattle Fire Code, Sections 102.1, 5202.3.1, 5202.4. 1, and Appendix 11-F, Seattle Municipal

Code Section 22.600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding to amendments made by Ordinances

118018 and 118436.

BE IT ORDAINED BY TBE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 22.600.020 of the Seattle Municipal Code (Ordinance 118019 § 2 (part), as

last amended by Ordinance 11843 6) is hereby amended to read as follows:

22.600.020 Adoption of Uniform Fire Code.

The Uniform Fire Code, 1994 Edition, with Appendices I-C, 11-A, 11-B, 11-C, 11-D, IT-E, 11-F

(with amendments), 111-A, 111-C, IV-A (with amendments), IV-B, V-A, VI-A, VI-B, VI-E, VI-F

and VI-G thereto, the Uniform Fire Code Standards, 1994 Edition, both published by the

International Fire Code Institute, one copy of which is filed with the City Clerk (C.F. 3 0113 7),

are adopted and by this reference made part of this subtitle. This Uniform Fire Code together

with the City of Seattle amendments thereto, as adopted under separate ordinances and known as

the Seattle Fire Code Supplement, shall constitute the Official Seattle Fire Code. In any case in

which there is a conflict between the component parts of the Seattle Fire Code, the Seattle Fire

Code Supplement shall be controlling over the Uniform Fire Code.

Section 2. Section 6 of Ordinance 118018, regarding Subsection 102.1 of the 1994 Uniform

Fire Code which was previously adopted as part of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2

(part), as amended by Ordinance 11843 6, is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.1 Existing Conditions. Except as specifically provided in this Code for retroactive compliance,

((T-)) !he provisions of this Code, the Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to ((exisfiiig)) conditions

to rsoftdifioa-s)) arising after the adoption thereof, Lo conditions not legally in existence at

the adoption of this Code, and to conditions which, ((and not in str4c4 eemplianee thefewith sha4l b

pefmitted te eeii6fme eely if)) in the opinion of the Chief, ((they do not)) constitute a distinct hazard to

I

life or property.

A condition is not "legally in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the condition

I



April 23, IM
1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplement
SFD0RD97.VI

NM
V3

2

6

7

10

I I

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

is in compliance with the building code and fire code of the CAy of Seattle in effect when the condition

first arose, and the practice, process, materials used and storage config2rations have not changed since

the condition first arose.

Section 3. Section 56 of Ordinance 119018, regarding Subsection 5202.3.1 of the 1994 Uniform

Fire Code which was previously adopted as part of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2

(part) as amended by Ordinance 11843 6, is hereby amended to read as follows:

5202.3 Storage of Fuel.

5202.3.1 General. Class I liquids shall be stored in closed containers, or in tanks located underground.

Exception: Class I liquids are allowed aboveground when located within an Industrial [1] zone,

as defined in the Seattle Land Use Code, and when stored in special enclosures in accordance

with Section 5202.3.6 or in protected aboveground tanks in accordance with Appendix II-F. No

Class I liquids are allowed in abovegrou-nd tanks within the Fire District.

Class II and III-A liquids shall be stored in containers or in tanks located underground, ((of)) in special

enclosures in accordance with Section 5202.3.6 or in protected aboveground tanks in accordance with

Appendix 11-F. See also Appendix II-F.

Section 4. Section 57 of Ordinance 118018, regarding Subsection 5202.4.1 of the 1994 Uniform

Fire Code which was previously adopted as part of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2

(part) as-amended by Ordinance 118436, is hereby amended to read as follows:

5202.4.1 Aboveground tanks. Class I liquids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor

vehicle from aboveground tanks.

Exception: Class I liquids are allowed to be dispensed from aboveground tanks when such

tanks are located outside of the Fire District and within an Industrial [11 zone, as defined in the

Seg,ttle Land Use Code, and installed inside special enclosures in accordance with Section

5202.3.6 or are in accordance with Appendix 11-F.

2



April 23,1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplement
SFD0RD97.Vl

MD
v3

7

10

I I

12

Class 11 and 111-A liquids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor vehicle from aboveground

tanks except when such tanks are installed inside special enclosures in accordance with Section 5202.3 ~6

or are motected abovearound tanks in accordance with Appendix 11-F, See also Appendix 11-F.

Section 5. As an addition to the amendments made by Ordinances 118018 and 118436,
.

Subsection 4.3 of Appendix 11-F of the 1994 Uniform Fire Code, previously adopted as part of the

Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 2 (part) as amended by Ordinance 118436, is hereby amended

to read as follows:

4.3 Size. Primary tanks used for Class I liquids shall not exceed a 10,000-gallon (37,854 L) individual

or aggregate cgpacily. Primary tanks used for Class 11 or III liquids shall not exceed a 10,000-gallon

13
"1

(3 7 8 54 L) individual or 40, 000-gallon (1 15
1416 L) aggregate capacity.

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

Section 6. As an addition to the amendments made by Ordinances 118018 and 118436,

Subsection 5.2 of Appendix II-F of the 1994 Uniform Fire Code, previously adopted as part of the

Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2 (part) as amended by Ordinance 11843 6, is hereby amended

to read as follows:

5.2 Total Quantity. Protected aboveground tank installations shall not exceed 10,000 gallons (37,854

L) aggregate capacjjy of Class I liquids or 40,000 gallons (151416 L) total aggregate capacity of

primary tanks containing Class 1, 11 and 111-A liquids. Tank installations having the maximum

allowable aggregate capacity shall be separated from other installations of protected aboveground tanks

by not less than 100 feet (3 048 mm).

Section 7. The attached text, containing the amendments to the 1994 Uniform Fire Code,

Subsections 102.1, 5202.3.1, 5202.4. 1 and Appendix II-F, is aversion of the Seattle Fire Code

Supplement in a form which can be reproduced and added to the bound volume of the 1994 Uniform Fire

Code for easy reference. The attachment amends and supplements the easy reference version attached to

Ordinance 118019.- The attached text is provided for reference only, and in any case in which there is a

conflict between the Seattle Fire Code Supplement and the attached text, the Seattle Fire Code Supplement

shall be controlling-

I

3



April 23, 1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplement
SFDORD97.VI

MD
V3

Section 8. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force thirty (30) days from and after its approval

by the Mayor, but if not approved and returned by the Mayor within ten (10) days after presentation, it shall

take effect as provided by Municipal Code Section 1.04.020.

Passed by the City Council the-'5-dayof MOLU 1997, and signed by mein open session

1997.in authentication of its passage this dayof

9

10

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

(Seal)

4



Section 102.1 is replaced to read as follows:

102.1 Existing Conditions. Except as specifically provided in this Code for retroactive

compliance, the provisions of this Code, the Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to conditions arising

after the adoption thereof, to conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of this Code, and

to conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.

A condition is not "legally in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the condition is in

compliance with the building code and fire code of the City of Seattle in effect when the

condition first arose, and the practice, process, materials used, and storage configurations have

not changed since the condition first arose.



Section 103.1.4 is replaced to read as follows:

103.1.4 Appeals. Appeals from decisions or actions pertaining to the application and

interpretation of this Code shall be addressed to the Fire Chief. If not resolved with the Chief,

the appellant may submit a written request to the Fire Chief for a review by the Fire Code

Appeals Board in accordance with all applicable by-laws, rules, regulations and ordinances. The
results of this appeal will be advisory only, in accordance with City of Seattle Ordinance 117717.



Section 5202.3.1 is replaced to read as follows:

5202.3 Storage of Fuel.

5202.3.1 General. Class I liquids shall be stored in closed containers, or in tanks located

underground.

Exception: Class I liquids are allowed aboveground when located within an Industrial

[1] zone, as defined in the Seattle Land Use Code, and when stored in special enclosures

in accordance with Section 5202.3.6 or in protected aboveground tanks in accordance

with Appendix 11-F. No Class I liquids are allowed in aboveground tanks within the Fire

District.

Classes 11 and III-A liquids shall be stored in containers or in tanks located underground, in

special enclosures in accordance with Section 5202.3.6 or in protected aboveground tanks in

accordance with Appendix 11-F. See also Appendix 11-F.



Section 5202.4.1 is replaced to read as follows:

5202.4 Dispensing.

5202.4.1 Aboveground tanks. Class I liquids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a

motor vehicle from aboveground tanks.

Exception: Class I liquids are allowed to be dispensed from aboveground tanks when
such tanks are located outside of the Fire District and within an Industrial [1] zone, as

defined in the Seattle Land Use Code, and installed inside special enclosures in

accordance with Section 5202.3.6 or are in accordance with Appendix 11-F.

Class 11 and 111-A liquids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor vehicle from

aboveground tanks except when such tanks are installed inside special enclosures in accordance

with Section 5202.3.6 or are protected aboveground tanks in accordance with Appendix 11-F.

See also Appendix II-F.

Section 5202.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

5202.4.2 Filling of portable containers and tanks and cargo tanks. It is unlawful to sell,

offer for sale, or distribute any container for the storage and/or handling of flammable liquids,

unless such container has been approved for such purpose under applicable provisions of this

Code. Class 1, 11 and III-A liquids shall not be dispensed into portable containers unless such
container is of approved material and construction, and having a tight closure with screwed or

spring cover so designed that the contents can be dispensed into without spilling. Liquids shall

not be dispensed into portable tanks.

Cargo tanks shall be filled at bulk plants or terminals.



APPENDIX 11-F

Section 4.3 is amended to read as follows:

4.3 Size. Primary tanks used for Class I liquids shall not exceed a 10,000-gallon (37 854 L)

individual or aggregate capacity. Primary tanks used for Class 11 or III liquids shall not exceed a

10,000-gallon (37 854 L) individual or 40,000-gal-lon (151416 L) aggregate capacity.

Section 5.2 is amended to read as follows:

5.2 Total Quantity. Protected aboveground tank installations shall not exceed 10,000 gallons

(37 854 L) aggregate capacity of Class I liquids or 40,000 gallons (151416 L) total aggregate

capacity of primarytanks containing Class 1, 11 and 111-A liquids. Tank installations having the

maximum allowable aggregate capacity shall be separated from other installations of protected

aboveground tanks by not less than 100 feet (3048 mm).



Legislative- Department

Seattle City Council

..!.'~7Memorandum

Date: March 20, 1997

To:

From:

Subject:

Members, Public Safety Committee

Retroactive Enforcement of the Fire Code

~V
enzel, Council Central Staff

The Fire Code Advisory Board, and its subcommittee on retroactivity, have been analyzing and

discussing the issue of retroactive enforcement of the Seattle Fire Code for some months now.

The Fire Marshal and the Board have reached agreement on recommending to Council a change

to the Seattle Fire Code. The fire unions have decided not to take a position on the issue. The

crux of the change would allow existing conditions that were in compliance with the _codewhen

thgy arose to continue, regardless of code changesunless the Chief determines the condition is a

distinct hazard.

I've attached, on pa ge 3, three versions of the code language addressing this issue:

" The Uniform Fire Code language

" The current Seattle Amendment to the Uniform Fire Code Language

" The proposed language

I've also attached "Reasons for Code Change," a paper developed by the Fire Code Advisory

Board subcommittee on retroactivity.

In addition to the reasons outlines by the Board, several points stand out in considering this

change.

1. It Is Impractical To Expect All Citizens To Be Knowledgeable About The Changgs In-The

Code Eve1y Three Years. The Uniform Fire Code is a business that produces a model code

adopted by 27 western states.'The code is substantially amended every three years. Anyone can

propose a code change, from fire chiefs in jurisdictions of all sizes to manufacturers or installers

of new equipment. 'Structures, equipment and processes approved under previous codes provide,

in.many cases, a good degree of safety. A retroactive code technically requires all citizens and

businesses, (including all City operations), to be familiar with all the changes every three years,

and ensure all their practices, structures, and equipment meet the current code. At the same time

the Fire Marshal's Office staff does not want-businesses to overhaul their )uildings or processes

based on their interpretation of the new code; they, want business to consult the FireMarshal's

Office. Butthe Fire Marshal's Offidd cannot possibly provide sufficient staff for this service.

1



Meanwhile, the retroactive language of the code places the responsibility on citizens to be. in

compliance.

2. Business Insurance Policies Require That Businesses Be In ComRfiance With All Codes. If

an insurance loss occurs, businesses fear their coverage could be compromised because of

noncompliance with some provision of the code.
- Under the current code, on a case-by-case

basis, the Fire Marshal's Office can rule that compliance with each new code provision is not

necessary, because the structure, equipment or process, which met the previous code, provides an

equivalent level of safety, or does not constitute a distinct hazard to life of property. But the

FMO does not have
'

staff to inspect all pre-existing fa~ilities and provide these rulings. There is a

.backlog of thousands of businesses awaiting their review by the Marshal's Office.

The proposed language presumes that pre-existing. conditions which met the code when they

arose still meet a reasonable standard of fire safety. If a fire inspector notes a distinct hazard,

even if it met a previous code, the inspector can cite that as a violation.

3. In Practice, The Distinct Hazard Standard Is Used By The FMO.In Deciding What Must Be

Upgraded In Facilities That Pre-Date The Current.Code. In practice, once the FMO is able to

focus its attention on a particular facility, older facilities are not required to meet every modem

code standard. In collaboration with the business, the FMO arrives at the minimum upgr~des

necessary to avoid distinct hazards. In this respect, the proposed code language more closely

mirrors the actual enforcement practice. To quote from a draft Fire.Department paper on

retroactive enforcement:

The Seattle Fire Department recognizes that total compliance -with all the requirements
ok

the Code is often physically" irpbssible aii7d/or economically impracticable for existing

facilities. It is the Department's' policy to accommodate requests for a conference with

the code enforcement team to identify design solutions which may provide equivalent

protection.

Keep in mind, however, that a backlog'of thousands of cases means many businesses have been

unable to obtain such a review.

DRAWBACKS TO MAKING THE 6HANGE:

1. Some businesses have been required by the FMO to make substantial upgrades, (and some

have voluntarily upgraded) to comply with changing codes. Businesses who evaded- inspection or

detection may now be absolved of similar responsibility. This is potentially ahnancial ,

advantage to those businesses who, didn't make changes. However, thbFMO may still require

changes -under the distinct hazard stan~ard.

2. There will be administrative headaches for the FMO: inspectors must determine when a

condition arose, and consult the -code. in effect at that time, to determine the app licable standard.

-This will require some retraining of staff. Keep in'mind, however, that any time the Chief

determines A distinct hazard exists, the condition must be upgraded.

2



VARIATIONS OF FIRE CODE LANGUAGE RELATED TO RETROACTIVE
- ENFORCEIvENT

,,,Uniform Fire Code: The provisions of this code shall apply to conditions arising after the

adoption thereof, conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of this code, and to

conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a distinct hazard to life.or p~operty.'

The current Seattle Amendment to the Uniform Fire Code Language: The provisions of this

Code shall apply to existing conditions as well as to conditions arising after the adoption thereof,

44 a-Te GeRE3

that conditions legally in existence at-the ad012t n strict compliance

th
.

erewith shall be permi n'lv if, in the opinion of the Chiefjhe do not constitute
tted to continue o

a distinct hazard to. life or property.

A cond this code" unless the condition:

de and fire code of the City nf RP-ntfle
*

"fect when the
a) is in compliance with the "b'uilding c

used,condition first arose, and the practicp orocess mat and storage cgnfi uration have

not changed since the condition first aroseLor

code, and to.conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a distinct hazard to life or

property.

The proposed I anguage: Except as spe'Cificallyprovided in this- Code for retroactive

compliance, ((T-)) Ihe provisions of this code, The Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to coilditions

arising after the adoption thereof, Lo conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of this

in compliahce with, the build

anv time after the condition first arose,

code and fire code of the Citv of Seattle then ;n gffenf at

nd the Dractice. Drocess, materials used and stgLag-e

time of compliance.confip-urations have not chanized since t

Ll-



Your

Seattle

Fire Department

G ~ajde Harris, Chief

Norman B. Rice, Mayor

April 14, 1997

LETTER OF TRANSMITTAL

The Honorable Jan Drago

President

Seattle City Council

Via The Honorable Mayor Norman B. Rice

Attention: Tom Tierney, Director

Office of Management and Planning

Subject. AN ORDINANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code to

existing conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from protected

above-ground storage tanks, and amending the Seattle Fire Code, Sections

102.1, 5202.3.1, 5202.4.1, and Appendix II-F, Seattle Municipal Code

Section 22.600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding to amendments made by

Ordinances 118018 and 118436.

Dear President Drago:

Enclosed with this letter is a draft of an ordinance which amends those sections of the

Seattle Fire Code that pertain to the retroactive'application of the Fire Code to existing

conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from protected above-ground storage

tanks. The proposed ordinance represents the consensus recommendation of the Seattle

Fire Code Advisory Board and the Seattle Fire Department.

In November, 1995, the Fire Code Advisory Board was charged with the challenging task

of examining proposed amendments to the Seattle Fire Code and making

recommendations to the Fire Department, the Mayor's Office and City Council. In

February, 1996, the review of Seattle amendments to the 1994 edition of the Uniform Fire

Code (UFC) culminated in the passage of Ordinances 118018 and 118019. This review

was completed under an expedited schedule in order to allow the Seattle Building Code

An equai err.picyment opportunity - affirmadve action employer.

City of Seattle-Fire Department, 301 SecondAvenue South, Seattle, Washington 0.3104-2680 (206) 386-1400, Fax (206) 386-1412

"Printed on Reryded Paper"



Ordinance Traii6mittal Letter

April 14,1997

Page 2

and Fire Code to remain in sync (i.e., both 1994 versions). It was decided that the

expedited review schedule dictated that certain issues, such as retroactive application of

the Fire Code, would be reviewed at a later date.

On December 3, 1996, the Fire Code Advisory Board voted that Seattle should adopt the

following language for the Seattle Fire Code, Section 102. 1, Existing Conditions:

"The provisions of this code, the Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to conditions

arising after the adoption thereof, to conditions not legally in existence at the

adoption of this code, and to conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief,

constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.

A condition is not "legall, y in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the

condition:

(a) is in compliance with the Building and Fire Code of the CjjY of Seattle in

effect when the condition first arose, and

(b) the practice, process, iiiaterials used, or storage configurations have not

changed, since the condition first arose."

The Fire Department, Fire Code Advisory Board and the business community support this

Code change. The Seattle Fire Fighter's Union has voted not to oppose the ordinance.

This change will make Seattle's Fire Code language more consistent with 21 other

Western states which adopt the Uniform Fire Code, and place Seattle businesses on a level

playing field with businesses in other areas.

On March 4, 1997, the Fire Code Advisory Board voted and approved as a "friendly

amendment," language offered by Council Central staff member, Mary Denzel.

"Except as specifically provided in this Code for retroactive compliance, the

provisions of this code, the Seattle Fire Cod
,

shall apply to conditions arising

after the adoption thereof, to conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of

this Code, and to conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a distinct

hazard to life or property-

A condition is not "legally in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the

condition:

(a) is in compliance with the building code and fire code of the CijY of Seattl

in effect when the condition first arose, and the practice, process, materials



Ordinance Traii6mittal. Letter

April 14,1997

Page 3

used and storage configgrations have not changed since the condition first

arose, o

(b) was in compliance with the building code and fire code of the City o

Seattle then n effect at any time after the condition first arose and the

practice, process, materials used, and storage configurations have not c janaed

since the time of compliance."

The Fire Department, Fire Code Advisory Board and the business community support this

new language. This language will make Seattle's Fire Code more consistent with

21 other Western states which adopt the Uniform Fire Code, and place Seattle businesses

on a level playing field with businesses in other areas.

Proposed amendments to Article 52 of the Seattle Fire Code which regulate motor vehicle

fuel dispensing stations will allow installation of protected, above-ground fuel storage

tanks. No gasoline fuel dispensing from above-ground tanks will be allowed in the

downtown fire district.

Above-ground tank fuel dispensing was formerly common among rural, agricultural areas.

Stringent environmental regulation and excessive insurance costs associated with

underground fuel storage tanks have resulted in above-ground fuel storage tank

development. The proposed ordinance includes size limits, set back requirements and

adherence to national standards for projectile and ballistic protection.

On behalf of the Seattle Fire Department and the Fire Code Advisory Board, we would

like to thank the members of the Subcommittees on Retroactive Code Enforcement and

Flammable and Combustible Liquid Storage Tanks chaired by David Schneidler and

Philip Dovinh respectively, for their diligence and outstanding effort put forth to reach an

agreement mutually satisfactory to all parties, while providing utmost consideration to fire

and life safety.

V. ery truly yours,

J4ald A. Birt, Fire Marshal

Seattle Fire Department

JAB:mwp

Enclosure



I T

Your

Seattle

Fire Department

Claude Harris, Chief

Norman B. Rice, Mayor

March 11, 1997

LETTER OF TRANSMITTAL

The Honorable Jan Drago

President

Seattle City Council

Via The Honorable Mayor Norman B. Rice

Attention~ Tom Tier-icy, Director

Office of Management and Planning

Subject: AN ORDINANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code to

existing conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from protected

above-ground storage tanks, and amending the Seattle Fire Code, Sections

102.1, 52023). 1, 5202.4~ 1, and Appendix 11-F, Seattle Municipal Code

Section 22,600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding to amendments made by

Ordinances 118018 and 118436.

Dear President Drago~

Enclosed with this letter is a draft of an ordinance which amends those sections of the

Seattle Fire Code that pertain to the retroactive. application of the Fire Code to existing

conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from protected above-ground storage

tanks. The proposed ordinance. represents the consensus recommendation of the Seattle

Fire Code Advisory Board and the Seattle Fire Department.

In November, 1995, the Fire Code Advisory Board was charged with the challenging task

of examining proposed amendments to the Seattle Fire Code and making recommendations

to the Fire Department, the Mayor's Office and City Council. In February, 1996, the

review of Seattle amendments to the 1994 edition of the Uniform Fire Code (UFC)
culminated in the passage of Ordinances 118018 and 118019. This review was completed
under an expedited schedule in order to allow the Seattle Building Code and Fire Code to

remain in sync (i.e., both 1994 versions). It was decided that the expedited review schedule

An
equa': employment opportunity - affirmalive action ampbyer.

ity of Seat Department, 301 Second Avenue South, Seattle, Washington 981-34-2680 (206) 386-1400, Fax (2106) 386-1,412

"Printed on Recycled Pao&amp;'



Ordinance Transmittal Letter

March 11, 1997

Page 2

dictated that certain issues, such as retroactive application of the Fire Code, would be

reviewed at a later date.

On December 5., 1996, an ordinance was submitted which was the result of an extensive

review and collaborative -process undertaken by the Fire Code Advisory Board, the Fire

Department and the reguiated community. The highest consideration was given to fire and

life safety, while also examining the current methodology of Fire Code enforcement, We
attempted to evaluate the impacts on businesses and fire fighters, weigh legal implications

against the potential liability for the responsibility of maintaining safe occupancies or use of

dangerous materials and considered practices in other jurisdictions along with the history of

fire code development.

On March 4, 1997, the Fire Code Advisory Board voted and approved as a "friendly

amendment," language offered by Council Central staff member, Mary Denzel. The result

of the Fire Code Advisory Board action with concurrence by the Seattle Fire Department,

is that Seattle should adopt the following language for the Seattle Fire Code, Section

1011, Existing Conditions:

"Except as specifically provided in this Code for retroactive compliance, the

provisions of this code, the Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to conditions arising

after the adoption thereof, Lo conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of

+his Code, and to conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a distinct

hazard to life or property.

A condition is not "leeally in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the

condition:

(a) is in compliance with the building code and fire code of the City of Seattle

in effect when the condition first arose, and the practice, process, materials

used and storal4e configurations have not cbanged since the condition first

arose, o

(b) was in compliance with the building code and fire code of the City o

Seattle then in effect at any time after the condition first arose and the

practice, process, materials used, and storage configurations have not changed

since the time of compliance."

The Fire Department, Fire Code Advisory Board and the business community support this

new language. This language will make Seattle's Fire Code more consistent with

21 other Western states which adopt the Uniform Fire Code, and place Seattle businesses

on a level playing field with businesses in other areas.



Ordinance Transmittal Letter

March 11, 1997

Page
3
)

Proposed amendments to Article 52 of the Seattle Fire Code which regulates motor vehicle

fuel dispensing stations will allow installation of protected, above-ground fuel storage

tanks. No gasoline fuel dispensing from above-ground tanks will be allowed in the

downtown fire district.

Above-ground tank fuel dispensing was formerly common among rural, agricultural areas.

Stringent environmental regulation and excessive insurance costs associated with

underground ftiel storage tanks have resulted in above-ground fuel storage tank

development. The proposed ordinance includes size limits, set back requirements and

adherence to national standards for projectile and ballistic protection.

On behalf of the Seattle Fire Department and the Fire Code Advisory Board, we would like

to thank the members of the Subcommittees on Retroactive Code Enforcement and

Flammable and Combustible Liquid Storage Tanks chaired by David Schneidler and Philip

Dovinh respectively, for their diligence and outstanding effort put forth to reach an

agreement mutually satisfactory to all parties, while providing utmost consideration to fire

and life safety.

Very truly yours,

"'A

Ik

JerNld A. Birt, Fire Marshal

Seattle Fire Department

JAB.-mwp

Enclosure



LEGISLATIVE REQUEST -- SUPPORTING INFORMATION

The following informationis submitted in conformance with City of Seattle Operating

Procedure 100-0 14 and 200-00 1.

Title of the Project[Program

AN ORDINANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code to existing

conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from protected above-ground storage

tanks, and amending the Seattle Fire Code, Sections 102.1, 5202.3. 1, 5202.4. 1, and

Appendix 11-F, Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding

to amendments made by Ordinances 118018 and.1 18436.

Statement of Obiectives

The proposed ordinance is the result of an extensive review and collaborative process

undertaken by the Fire Code Advisory Board, the Seattle Fire Department and the

regulated community. The objective is to relieve the regulated community of the burden

of being regarded as not in compliance with current fire code regulations at the time of a

new fire code adoption.

The proposed ianguage derines those situations which will be required to comply with the

new law. In cases where a condition is in compliance with the Seattle Fire Code and

Building Code in effect when the condition first arose and the practice, process, materials

used and storage configurations have not changed since the condition first arose, the

condition will be allowed to continue. The new language also covers those situations

where a condition was brought into compliance under a version of the Seattle Fire Code

and Building Code in effect after the condition first arose but prior to the enactment of the

.current Code. Again, if the practice, process, materials used and storage configurations

have not changed since that condition was brought into compliance, the condition will be

allowed to continue under the new code,

This language change will make Seattle's fire code language more consistent with 21 other

Western states which adopt the Uniform Fire Code and place Seattle's businesses at par

with businesses in other areas,

Proposed amendments to Article 52 and Appendix 11-F regulate motor vehicle fuel

dispensing and will allow for the installation of above-ground fuel storage tanks in the City

for this activity but will prohibit dispensing Class I flammable liquids into motor vehicles

from above-ground tanks located in the Fire District.



Legislative Request/Supporting Information

1997 Fire Code Ordinance

Page 2

Historical Overview

The passage of Ordinance 117717 and Resolution 29248 resulted in the

reconfiguration of the Seattle Fire Code Advisory Board and the creation of an

executive work program for the Fire Marshal's Office. The new legislation was the

culmination of an interdepartmental work group which included industry

representation.

2. Existing fire code text concerning the application of the fire code to existing

conditions places the burden of meeting current fire code requirements with the

building owner, regardless of the degree of hazard presented by the condition to fire

and life safety.

The language in the proposed amendment is intended to clarify conditions that are not

"legally in existence" at the time of adoption of a new fire code. The Uniform Fire

Code is a continually evolving document which is published every three years. The

State of Washington adopts the Uniform codes as the minimum standard for all cities.

While cities can amend the Uniform codes, the local amendments cannot be less

restrictive than the minimum standard set forth in the Uniform codes.

4. Stringent environmental regulation coupled with excessive leak or contamination

insurance costs have resulted in the development of above-ground fuel tanks. In

recognition of this trend, the International Fire Code Institute created Appendix TI-F

which, in conjunction with Uniform Fire Code Appendix Standard A-11-F-1,

establishes safety requirements for above-ground fuel tanks. The City of Seattle did

not adopt Appendix 11-F until last year with the adoption ofthe 1994 edition of the

Uniform, Fire Code. Appendix 11-F was not adopted by Seattle until the standard for

above-ground flammable liquid storage tank construction was completed.

5. The standard for protection of above-ground fuel tanks evolved to provide for

adequate fire and life safety. Dispensing Class I flammable liquids into motor vehicles

from, above-ground tanks will be prohibited in the Fire District. We anticipate issuing

permits to industrial facilities located on Harbor Island and similarly zoned areas.

Fiscal Overview

Permits will be issued for above-ground fuel storage tank installation. At this time, it is
I

difficult to predict with certainty how many permit applications will be received. We are

aware of interest expressed by Todd Shipyards and other maritime industries in this type

of installation, Permits have been issued for above-ground fuel tanks, The code change

offers an option for affected businesses with no real revenue increase.



Legislative Request/Supporting Informition

1997 Fire Code Ordinance

Page 3

Personnel Reauirements

None.

Facilities and Equipment Reguirements

None.

Evaluation Criteria

None.

Contact Person

Chief Jerald A. Birt, Fire Marshal 386-1450.



March 11, 1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplemei

SFDORD97.N71

SFD:m,ivp

V1

4

6

7

10

I I

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23)

24

25

26

27

28

29

.30

3 2

33

ORDINANCE

AN ORDNANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code to
existi

conditions and the

dispensing of flammable liquids from protected above-ground storz :tianks and amending the
C)

71"

Seattle Fire Code, Sections 102. 1, 5202.3.1, 5202.4. 1, and Appen~J-lx II-F, Seattle Municipal

Code Section 22.600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding to ame.n'dments made by Ordinances

118018 and 118436.

Section I
.

Section 22,600.020 of the Seattle Mtinic, Code (Ordinpce 118019 § 2 (part), as

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLO7XS:

last amended by Ordinance 1184')6) is hereby amended to.,i'ead as follov(~.

22.600.020 Adoption of Uniform Fire Code.

The Uniform Fire Code, 1994 Edition, with Append~,es I-C. ll-A,~,"11-13, II-C, 11-D, II-E, 11-F

(with amendments), 111-A, 111-C, IV-A (with ameOdments), ly.,~~B, V-A, VI-A, VI-B, VI-E, VI-F

J,

and VI-G thereto, the Uniform Fire Code Stan,.;dards, 1994~Edifion, both published by the

International Fire Code Institute, one copy q6' which i

s1f1led
with the City Clerk (C.F. 3011317), are

adopted and by this reference made part 9T this sub ~Atle. This Uniform Fire Code together with

the City of Seattle amendments thereto,;f as adop~!~ed under separate ordinances and known as the

Seattle Fire Code Supplement, shall q0onstitutk the Offlicial Seattle Fire Code. In any case in which

there is a conflict between the corriponentparts of the Seattle Fire Code, the Seattle Fire Code

Supplement shall be controlling
ier

th.0

I

Uniform Fire Code.

Section 2. Section 6 oYOrdiOnce 18018, regarding, Subsection 102.1 of the 1994 Uniform Fire

Code which was previous] opted as part of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2 (part) as

amended by Ordinance I
~

94-36, hereby amended to read as follows:

102.1 Existing Condj4ions, Except as specifically provided in this Code for retroactive compliance,

((T)) Ihe provisioris of this Code, the Seattle Fire Code, shall apply to conditions ((as well a

..Xvis'no, after the adoption thereof, ((exeept4hat)) to conditions not legally in existence atto conditi --I I

the adoption/16f this Code, and to conditions which, ((and not in striet eemplianee therewith shall b

)
in the opinion of the Chief, ((t-hey-d&amp;+KA)) constitute a distinct hazard to

legally in existence at the adoption of this Code" unless the condition:

34



I

2

4

10

I I

12

14

f 5

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

2 3

24

25

26

27

28

29

10-1

31

2

33

March 11, 1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplemen
SFDORD97NI

SFD:niivp

VI

(a) is in compliance with the buildinR code and fire code of the City of Seattle in e when the
A-

condition first arose, and the practice, proce s, materials used and storage conflikurations have not

changed since the condition first arose, o

iance with the building code and fire code of the C-Ity of Seattle then in effect at aLiy tim

after the condition first arose, and the practice, process, matejifs used and storage configurations have

not changed since the time of compliance,

Section 3. Section 56 of Ordinance 1] 8018, iegarding Subsection 5202.3. 1 of th-e 1994 Uniform

Fire Code which was previously adopted as part of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordina~ e 118019 § 2 (part)

as amended by Ordinance H 843 6, is hereby adended to read as follows:

5202.3 Storage of Fuel.

5202.3.1 General. Class I liquids shall b~ stored in closed containers, o,r in tanks located underground,

Exception: Class I liquids r~_J`allowed aboveground when st-'red in special enclosures in

accordance with Section 52.02.3.6 or in protected abovegrg nd tanks in accordance with

Appendix 11-F. No Class/I liquids are allowed in above.--round tanks within the Fire District.

J

Class 11 and 111-A liquids shalIJ)e stored in containers or in ,,,nks located underground, ((of)) in special

enclosures in accordance with Section 5202.3.6 or in prot6cted aboveground tanks in accordance with

Appendix 11-F. See also ~kppendix 11-F.

Section 4. Se~tion 57 of Ordinance H 80 1A, regarding Subsection 5202.4.1 of the 1994 Uniform

Fire Code which wds previously adopted as part,of the Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2 (part)

as amended by Oi;,Iiinance H 84') 6, is hereby a;

-

mended to read as follows:

5202.4.1
Abolground

tanks. Class I liqqids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor

vehicle from ab~veground tanks,

ExceiVion: Class I liquids are allowed to be dispensed from aboveground tanks when such tanks

are I cated outside of the Fir-e-District and installed.inside special enclosures in accordance with

SeCA(lon
5202.1.6,or are in accordance with Appendix 11-F.

34



I

2

7

10

I I

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

2 3

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

March 11, 1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code Supplemei

SFDORD97AII

SFD-.iiiwp

VI

Class 11 and 111-A liquids shall not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor vehicle om aboveground

tanks except when such tanks are installed inside special enclosures in accordane

,

Z
w

it
h

Section 5202.3.6
J

o Appendix 11-F.or are pro ected aboveground tanks in accordance with Appendix JI-F. Sep"",
~/uC

Section 5. As an addition to the amendments made by,
Ordidnees I Irf 8 and 118436,

Subsection 4.3 of Appendix 11-F of the 1994 Uniform Fire Cod,~/,"previou
I. adopted as part of theY

Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance 118019 § 2 (part) as amen5Wd by C~'Ainance
11843 6, is hereby amended

to read as follows:

4.3 Size. Prima~y tanks used for Class I liquids shat ot exc6ed a 10,000-gallon (37,854 Q individual or

ag,g,regate capacity. Primary tanks used for Class, 1
1
_
~

o
r

11LI

,

ijuids shall not exceed a 10,000-gallon (37

854 L) individual or 40,000-gallon (11 51 416 L' aggregate capacity.

Aamendmen'ts made by Ordinances 118018 and 118436,Section 6. As an addition to th9

Subsection 5.2 of Appendix 11-F of tye 1994 Ufliform Fire Code, previously adopted as part of the

Seattle Fire Code by Ordinance I I.IIA019 § 2 (Oart) as amended by Ordinance 118436, is hereby amended

to read as follows.-

5.2 Total Quantity. Protec
V.d aboveg und tank installations shall not exceed 10,000 gallons (37,854

I

r 40,000 g 11L) aggregate capacity of Cl
'

all9ss I liauidsol ons (151416 L) total aggregate capacity of primary

tanks containing Class 1, M and 111-A liquids. Tank installations having the maximum allowable aggregate

capacity shall be
separaed

from other installations of protected aboveground tanks by not less than 100

Section 7jhe attached text, &amp;ontaining the amendments to the 1994 Uniform Fire Code, Subsections

1011, 5202.3 3. 1/5202.4,1 and Appen d~ix 11-F, is a version of the Seattle Fire Code Supplement in a form

which can be ftroduced and added to t4p bound volurne of the 1994 Uniform Fire Code for easy reference.

The attachrq~nt amends and supplements t lie easy reference version attached to Ordinance 118019, The

.32

33

34

attache xt is provided for reference only, and in any case in which there is'a conflict between the Seattle Fire

Code
S7pplement

and the attached text, the Seattle Fire Code Supplement shall be controlling.



Mareb 11, 1997

1997 Seattle Fire Code
Supplejiiei~

SFDORD97.VI

SFD,m-*vp

VI

2

4

5

6

Section 8. This ordinance shall take effiect and be in force thirty (30) days fro nd after its approval

by the Mayor, but if not approved and returned by the Mayor within ten (10) days a er presentation, it shall

ft
o
'

take effect as provided by Municipal Code Section 1.04.020.

Passed by the City Council the_ day of 11997, ao sigped by me in open session in

10

I I

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23
1

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

32

3 4

authentication of its passage this_ day of 199

President of the Cit)?'Council
f

41

Approved by me this day of

Seal)

I

I

City Clerk



Section 102.1 is replaced to read as follows:

102.1 Existin"9' Conditions. Except as specifically provided in this Coqp,fo retroactive

compliance, th&amp;~,provisions
of this Code, the Seattle Fire Code, shal

applyto
conditions arising

after the adoptioi
.

thereof, to conditions not legally in existence at the option of this Code, and

to conditions which, in the opinion of the Chief, constitute a disti.r.f zard to life or property.t

A condition is not "legilly in existence at the adoption of th.ii'Coqf

,

'

unless the condition:
I

(a) is in compliance with the"building code and fire cod
,

Q` of th

I

4ity of Seattle in effect when the

condition first arose, and the pra~ctlce, Process, materlixfs used~ and storage configurations have not

changed since the condition first ar6.qe; or

of the City of Seattle then in effect at(b) was in compliance with the building code apd fire
co.~

any time after the condition first arose, and the' practice,;,'Process, materials used and storage

configurations have not changed since the,,ti

I

me"of cor~'?pliance.

Section 103,1.4 is replacedfo read as follo

Chief, the appellant m,~'ay submit 0in request to the Fire Chief for a review by the Fire

Code Appeals Bo,-.11' in accordance w.Vh all applicable by-laws, rules, regulations and

ordinances. The, 1: stilts of this appedwill be advisory only, in accordance with City of

Seattle Ordinanc:'e H 7717.

i

J~'
,

I

103.1.4 Appeals. App
.

als from decisionlior actions pertaining to the application and

interpretation of this ~Mode shall be addr sed to the Fire Chief. If not resolved with the

1-2a 3/11/97



Section 5202.3 ). 1 'Is replaced to read as follows:

5202.3 Storage of Fuel.

I~Jiquids shall be stored in closed containers, or in5202.3.1 General. Class

underground.

Exception: Class I liquia-kare allowed aboveground when stored in spe,661

enclosures in accordance wh1i Section 5202.3.6 or in protected,"above und tanks'ato

in accordance with Appendix 1-1-1F. No Class I liquids are alloo4ed ip/aboveground
I z r

tanKs witnin the Iire District.

Classes 11 and 111-A liquids shall be stored in 6ontainers or in tar*s cated underground,

in special enclosures in accordance with Section 5-2-02,3.6 or iw r, tected aboveground
I?

,

tanks in accordance with Appendix 11-F. See also ppendix U

1-1641) 3111/97



Section 5202.4.1 is replaced to read as follows:

5202.4 Dispensing.

5202.4.1 Abo~v'4~ound tanks. Class I liquids shall not be dispense

I

d into O(e fu'el tank of

a motor vehicle
ftoi:~-i,,~boveground

tanks.

Exception: liquids are allowed to be dispensed from.a,6oveground tanks

when such tanks ar~~-Iocated outside of the Fire District and,.4"nsu-illed inside special

enclosures in accordan~&amp;,,with Section 5202.3.6 or are in accordance with

Appendix IT-F.

Class 11 and 111-A fiquids shall not be dis*s9d into the fuel; Lank of a motor vehicle from

aboveground tanks except when such tanks ai~~,installed iii"&lt;";'de special enclosures in

-ound tanks in accordance withaccordance with Section 5202.3.6 or are protecte'~'-At'O.'

Appendix 11-F. See also Appendix 11-F.

Section 5202.4.2 is amended to read

a
lx

l~ 161lows:

5202.4.2 Filling of portable conta4ners and tanks and cargo tanks. It is unlawful to

sell, offer for sale, or distribute an,"'. container for the storage and/or handling of flammable

liquids, unless such container has,b'-een approved for such purpose under applicable

provisions of this Code. Class

1
,;

'

-1 and 111-A liquids shall not be dispensed into portable

containers unless such containef :s of approved material and construction, and having a

tight closure with screwed or s:pnna cover so designed that the contents can be dispensed
Z'

into without spilling. Liquid, :shall not be dispensed into portable tanks.

Cargo tanks shall be fililed ~0. bulk plants or terminals.

1-166a 3/11/97



APPENDIX 11-F

Section 43 is amended to read as follows:

4.3 Size. Primary tanks used for Class I liquids shall not exceed a 10,000-gallo 7854

L) individual or aggregate capacity. Primary tanks used for Class 11 or III liquk
rssihall not

INIn

exceed a 10,000-gallon (37 854L) individual oi-40,000-gallon (151 416L) ggregate

canacitv

Section 5.2 is amended to read as follows:

5.2 Total Quantity. Protected abovegrounA tank installations shall not exceed 10,000

gallons (37 854 L) aggregate capacity of Cyass I liquids or 40,000 gallons (151416 L)

total aggregate capacity of primary tanks ~~ontain* n- Class 1, 11 and 111-A liquids, Tank
---7

1
'.'

'

installations havin the maxinnurn allowable aggregate capacity shall be separated from9

other installations of protected aboveg~; round tanks by not less than 100 feet (3048 mm).

I

1-432a 3/11/97



City of Seattle

Executive Department-Off ice of Management and Planning.

Thomas M. T ierney, Director

Norman B. Rice, Mayor
,

February 12, 1997

The Honorable Mark Sidran

City Attorney

City of Seattle

Dear Mr. Sidran:

The Mayor is proposing to the City Council that the enclosed legislation be adopted.

REQUESTING
DEPARTMENT: Fire Department

SUBJECT: AN ORDINANCE relating to the application of the Seattle Fire Code

to existing conditions and the dispensing of flammable liquids from

protected above-ground storage tanks, and amending the Seattle Fire

Code, Sections 102.1, 5202.3.1, 5202.4. 1, and Appendix 11-F, Seattle

Municipal Code Section 22.600.020 and Ordinance 118019, adding to

amendments made by Ordinances 118018 and 118436.

Purs:uant to the City Council's S.O.P. 100-014, the Executive Department is forwarding this

request for legislation to your office for review and drafting.

After reviewing this request and any necessary redrafting of the enclosed legislation, return the

legislation to OMP. Any specific questions regarding the legislation can be directed to Thomas

Dunlap at 386-9120.

Sincerely,

Norman B. Rice

Mayor

by

TOM TIERNEY&lt;9&amp;11-

Director

hAadrnin\1agis\1aw1trs\dun1ap2

Enclosure

Accommodations for people with disabilities provided on request. An equal employment opportunity - affirmative action employer.

Off ice of Management and Planning 300 Municipal Building, Seattle, Washington 98104-1826

(206) 684-8080 0 (TDD) 684-8118 0 FAX (206) 233-0085

Pinted on.Recycled Paper"



THE ATTACHED DOCUMENT IS_;SP#IWRED F ING
Wnmi

THE CITY COUNCIL BY
"

4cl- 0 1THEMEMBERIS) OFTHE CITY COU L'WH MSEATUIYISI ARE ~HOWN BELOW.

TOR CITY COUNCIL PRESIDENT USE ONLY

COMMITTEE(S) REFERREn TO,

. PRESIDENT'S SIGNATURE



06
STATE OF WASHINGTON - KING COUNTY

attle,City Clerk
_ss.

No. ORDINANCE IN

Affidavit of Publication

The undersigned, on oath states that he is an

authorized representative of The Daily Journal of Commerce, a

daily newspaper, which newspaper is a legal newspaper of general

circulation and it is now and has been for more than six months

prior to the date of publication hereinafter referred to, published in

the English language continuously as a daily newspaper in Seattle,

King County, Washington, and it is now and during all of said time

was printed in an office maintained at the aforesaid place of

publication of this newspaper. The Daily Journal of Commerce

was on the 12th day of June, 1941, approved as a legal newspaper

by the Superior Court of King County.

The notice in the exact form annexed, was published in regular

issues of The Daily Journal of Commerce, which was regularly

distributed to its subscribers during the below stated period. The

annexed notice, a

GT-.0RD 118574

was published on

S/21/97

the sum of S
,
w#A AlAmit has be n~paid in full.

~ I

The amount of the fee chargpd fok
,

~he foregoing publication is

05/21i

Notary Public for the State of Washington,
residing in Seattle

Affidavit of Publication



INOTWE
TRUSTEVIS

PURSUANT TO. TOE
REVISED C11- 011,

'WASHIN

suant to ~~Cw 6!~241JW~ Fail.

ure, to bring s--.ich a,Javv~4vit may
ll

llrl vq;!,~-opf~r
IOsut i~l a A

o~zrsds fbr

CHAPTV.19 f, I n f
,

SEQ~

Document Title-, Notice of

U'ustee's Gr=lx~r H&amp;L

5orvices Inc, tf~

the pul~lic. Legal Deictipti,:m:

20 f;L-et Of thf, S
, 1~~

of LotThe W ,

he S. 1~2 of Lot 6, moc~- 19,
5 ~~ tw

Earlington AcresTY8ct5, Offif~ial

~al desCrip
ton b4~~low, As-

144,502f #'

-~js Tax areel
,,zmssor

0480-03,24XAI~'TS- 64183-23593-

P T_Q

that the undersigrwd Trustee

thr, 30fll day of MAY~

swu~
X,

7ho "n;stee ma es no vpr.

enta+ioas of

(~emlmg wh;?'t. interest 'm fh;~ -fe~,31

maperty abc)ve i~

sold, The Deed --f Trmsteina,_

lien may a firs,

li~,n or there may be

f~the~r pnio~~,
)4~

'MQ Tru,~tee is E~0, re',

qwr~,~. to providi, title inforgio-

vkm ~,.fme~ mi~ig tl~is property.

Aw", -persm in ~his

f6mvic:_-~m" i~s elicouraffea to

make hii~ -~r h~--r nwf~ ifivestiga.
at the hour ol iv~vv

t_rn., at the King Countyr lock,

C-3urthouse, in the City oi

Soattle State of Washington,
1

s 41 at, public ai.iction to tbe

st lbidder, pa,highest and be yable,

at the time -of sale, the follf-,wing-

scribed real property' situated
'&amp;

,

tbe State ofComity of Kim-

"~T,aqhington to-wit:

'vVF-qT ~O FEET OF THE
,

!TH HALF OF LOT dpbtors nor col~.erning the con-
S()T

THE SOU-ITH HALF OF LOT se-~;,tation or -warn3r.ties as.lf!

sicalhtht -h

,
1

"M-D THE SOUTH HALF OF dition ~-,f thc- prol-w-fty, Nc. refire-

:CO1YN- W, 'WA $HINGTON, Ieriri~ig titlp infolm~3tion, ill-

ih h

tion comennin. th o-w~iership ofg e

thc- property. and the position

16 of t~w deed of truston tit,

i,)Cling foreclose~, Any

t e rp-4cd the f~,mclr,-mrp

al,~o ev.~couraged tf-) ("Onsult OR

attorp,ey, as the Tn3:stoa will not
, run.omer gprovde, R,gal avce t

the The Truste~;t.

does not, prcnide ir.form-ition

tbe location of the
71-1 kLA ~Lk U11 x m,,SoU

a-
'OF RECORDED IN VOLUME mmtal or ha7ardcus wastf-

PAGI~ 8a, bitities or problerns coxanected
15 OF PLATS

yp,ipq BLOCK 18, EARLINGTON made concern
I , ~-,rty ~~rXC'RE TRACTS, ACCORD- conditiork oi Q~e prop

I-NG' TO THE PLiVE THERE- -,vhether th&lt;-n-c are mi,~

li

,

RECORDS Of KIN G with tMss property. Any per-sorl

(cornmanly kmLo"Am ap 8004 ardous vraqte or emvironwet)a

South 1,T_)rAd ~;-treft~ Seatt I C, jss"teq, or other inf~rmat~om

WA 981'78) -which is subject io ab~ mi, the real propert"',
I

'OF,
I NNGTON. iorma~-ion ~~i~cerning ~113' haz-

l

e p ySIWATE IN THE COUNTY forwition concerning
! comfitiol~ of the propp-rty, in-STATE OF WASH- r-a

all such
That cet-ta:vs deed r~f trus~dxwd f~revlosed should ofjtZ73in

4,-,moary 12, 1944, recolrded Jaa-i- ii7,formati,,-m independevitly.
19974'

,.

,oratioY3, fox the us4,.s wrj~d pur'The defaulst,s) for which this

~~,3id Con
;r~tary aQt and dek~d of

~ill

,

t6recle-sure, is made is/axe as fol- poses therein mentioned, ard on

lows: [If derawt is for other than Oath stated that she -0' xatbov-

ymmt ofmonpv, set forth thc~ ized to the saii! instru-
pa

n,ngastate oIL for the 'S

ya

rp,iration, as B5~~npficiary~ signed. a Notav.,; Pub.,ic in

thiW'

.,oun wo
-r-widc Fuy~&amp;t)g b4~~fbre mc, the 1111deCnlwVkh

e
z 24

- ay oQ, Tide Home LoapstC -

er,Gran ,

gli-mince Company, as Trustee, STIiXE OF WASHINGTON,

to SHICUre ~atl obligatija in favcw C'quVit
2
-v

b,f F

10~6-54Chicao Title In- (2116;

t

.oy
,kdams, hij.%band wid wife, a&amp; Seattle 'W'ashingtfm 98101.

7I

,
,yf, ,mn,gli

~kd~sris and Cindy 1- tek,~ 1111, Thirf, ~\venue, #,'W)0~HR

.
,p Dated: FcbraarY

-saary -

0
'

11994, under ,V-1itav

File 1,44, 9413131,1142, of 111-k S, RAABE
fi-om H&amp;I,

SERVTVE~, ISX., Tims-asbintonVtC -Xi

. e ~orpoof tbe obligatki-,j,n arly
_ux

n,,astm of the Grantor's default tj3c Jore~,ojng jjjst~-, -,3~ t, an,

_
.4on N-J,l ana~,or . .)

j
act

1): w pEmding to siek satis g
oratim tl1a7e_xec11,ted

rt bh iC

or, comme~iced by the (1,31v cfnn~ZYJJsmoned swom,4j .o a
Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust appeared Lila S.

pr the Benefici~iry's oucc,"sor is t~' me kriown to he, the
. nI c,Se i~:psf 11 &amp; 1-

i
'

ation secured by tha acknowlefigrd the said ir_stni-
oblith pem

Dee~l of Tyust. ;nmt to be, the free and vol-
'

,
_

f this 'a-', 'lat,, Dates ofpijUication h-1 i1te S(-oY15 Ta~TTi,t`h i .
$402.84, 1J0TYkL MONTHLY atijo Dail-~ Jollxnal of Coln,-

I~A'01RNTS AND LATE merce, A~~il 30 and May 21.

$Io,i73.84. 2, F;-Iil- 5/~ P~79867)

2001.~arj 9
t I-wt made, 1'`t , ,

Washington. resiplingFebruary 24, 1997) ---- State of

'$~0,07 1.60, LATE CTT,,o.G&amp;~, 9 Kent, WA,

lAte chargc~a .)f $44.76 for eacb My Cw ission ExpiTes~ jafl-

,or
~ an6ach: (June 1, 1.996 4-31.19h Notary Pubho h

-

iAorsthly payments at $1019~00
'

~Spnl) By: SANDRAHARRIS,
tbed f-

EN TS: 9 year first above written,MONTITLY PAY M
os~,a ere

vvhi,L~h -4re. nown. arrea
I

,

p~trtiCl,313MI 1. Pai].Ure W pay Mt~nt.

W.

hea due. the foft-v;ing anv-11,1171t,, Wittiess jny hand and official

ffixed the day ar~d
s~ t! h


